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Andrew S. Marcaccio, Counsel 280 Melrose Street
PPL Services Corporation Providence, RI 02907 -
AMarcaccio@pplweb.com Phone 401-784-4263 RhOde ISIQ nd Energg
a PPL company
July 11, 2024
VIA ELECTRONIC MAIL

Luly E. Massaro, Commission Clerk
Rhode Island Public Utilities Commission
89 Jefferson Boulevard

Warwick, RI 02888

RE: Docket No. 23-35-EE — 2024 Annual Energy Efficiency Program Plan
Quarterly Report of EERMC Invoices — 2024 — Quarter 2

Dear Ms. Massaro:

On behalf of The Narragansett Electric Company d/b/a Rhode Island Energy (the
“Company”), attached please find the 2024 — quarter 2 report showing Energy Efficiency
Resource Management Council (“EERMC”) expenses for work performed by EERMC vendors
in connection with the 2024 energy efficiency program year that were paid by the Company
between April 1, 2024 and June 30, 2024.

This report is being filed in accordance with directives issued by the Public Utilities
Commission (“PUC”) at an open meeting that occurred on January 25, 2022. Specifically, the
PUC directed the Company to file copies of all invoices paid to cover EERMC’s expenses on a
quarterly basis by the 15" of April, July, October, and December.

Please note that consistent with the directives issued by the PUC, the Company will also
send a copy of this report to each member of the EERMC individually via e-mail.

Thank you for your attention to this filing. If you have any questions or concerns, please

do not hesitate to contact me at 401-784-4263.
Sincerely,

FHe A —

Andrew S. Marcaccio
Enclosures

cc: Docket No. 23-35-EE Service List



Date Approval by
Date Invoice EERMC Executive Date Invoice
Vendor Name Vendor Invoice # Date Range for Time Worked Invoice $ Received Director Received Paid

Marissa DeSautel 233 $ 1,294.61 3/27/2024 3/27/2024 4/4/2024
Advocacy Solutions 622 Feb-24| $ 185.00 3/29/2024 3/29/2024 4/25/2024
Optimal 376086 Jan-24| $ 47,166.50 3/29/2024 3/29/2024 4/3/2024
Optimal 378840 Feb-24| $ 49,818.25 4/19/2024 4/19/2024 4/24/2024
Marissa DeSautel 288 Mar-24| $ 3,905.00 5/8/2024 5/8/2024 5/23/2024
Marissa DeSautel 294 Apr-24| $ 2,117.50 5/8/2024 5/8/2024 5/23/2024
PivotPath 1789 Jun-24( $ 11,300.00 6/10/2024 6/10/2024 6/28/2024
Optimal 382879 Mar-24| $ 50,007.00 6/11/2024 6/11/2024 6/27/2024




DESAUTEL BROWNING LAwW

EsT. 2015 - NEWPORT, RI

38 Bell A , Suite B
Newgo(rat\,“lfhozi/:r}:lilndu(l)gs40 I NVO I C E

Invoice # 233
Date: 03/01/2024
Due On: 03/31/2024

RI Energy Efficiency Resource Management Council

00001-RI Energy Efficiency Resource Management Council

Legal Counsel to EERMC.

Type Date Notes Quantity Rate Total

Service  02/14/2024 Attention to meeting materials and attendance. Emails 0.40 $275.00 $110.00
re: same.

Service  02/21/2024 Attention to EE docket filing. 0.50 $275.00 $137.50

Service  02/22/2024 Drafting Documents: Drafted motion to intervene for 1.20 $275.00 $330.00
docket 24-06-EE and cover letter

Service 02/22/2024 Review docket materials, attention to client filing. 040 $275.00 $110.00

Service  02/23/2024 Review motion and cover letter. Attention to filing. 0.80 $275.00 $220.00
Review EE docket filing by Rl Energy.

Service  02/26/2024 Emails: EE filing. 0.20 $275.00 $55.00

Service  02/27/2024 Attention to motion for filing. 0.20 $275.00 $55.00

Expense 02/27/2024 Reimbursable expenses: postage for EERMC motion to 1.00 $2.11 $2.11

intervene in docket 24-06-EE

Service  02/27/2024 Filing of Documents: Electronic and physical filing of 1.00 $275.00 $275.00
EERMC motion to intervene for docket 24-06-EE

Total $1,294.61

Page 1 of 2



Invoice # 233 - 03/01/2024

Detailed Statement of Account

Other Invoices

Invoice Number Due On Amount Due Payments Received Balance Due

225 03/13/2024 $3,465.00 $0.00 $3,465.00

Current Invoice

Invoice Number Due On Amount Due Payments Received Balance Due
233 03/31/2024 $1,294.61 $0.00 $1,294.61
Outstanding Balance $4,759.61

Total Amount Outstanding $4,759.61

Please make all amounts payable to: Desautel Browning Law

Please pay within 30 days.

Page 2 of 2
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Ad‘\?ocacySolutions

Invoice For Rl Energy Efficiency Resource
Management Council

RI Office of Energy Resources
One Capitol Hill
Providence, RI 02908

Item Type Description

Product Branding and Communications Development - 02/08/2024 - Other
/ Ben Smith: Edits to staging site outside of original budgeted time

Page 1 of 1

From | Advocacy Solutions LLC

1 Richmond Square
Suite 200N
Providence, RI 02906

Invoice ID | 622
Issue Date | 02/29/2024
Due Date | 02/29/2024 (upon receipt)

Quantity Unit Price Amount
1.00 $185.00 $185.00
Amount Due $185.00



INVOICE 0 Optirrl.al

Federal Tax ID# 03-0351557 ENERGY

AN NW‘E COMPANY

Remit checks to: Remit ACH transfer to: Remit Wire Transfers to:
Optimal Energy, LLC ABA Routing Number 063100277 ABA Routing Number 026009593
PO Box 74008680 Account Number 898052466590 Account Number 898052466590
Chicago, IL 60674-8680 Email ACH/Wire remittance details to RemittanceNotifications@nv5.com Swift Code INTL. BOFAUS3N

February 27, 2024

) Project No: 863224-0007590.00
Steven Chybowski Invoice No: 000000376086
Rhode Island Office of Energy Resources
Professional Services from January 1, 2024 to January 31,2024 _  _ _ _ _ _ _ _ _ _ _ _ _ ______
Phase _ _ _ _ | oo1_ _ EE Prg Planning & Implementation Oversig_ _ _ _ _ _ _ _ _ _ _ o - - -
Task 01 Council Representation
Professional Personnel
Hours Rate Amount
Johnson, Craig 4.00 214.00 856.00
Ross, Samuel 1.75 229.00 400.75
Totals 5.75 1,256.75
Total Labor 1,256.75
Total this Task $1,256.75
Task 02 Implementation Oversight and Plan Develo
Professional Personnel
Hours Rate Amount
Caesar, Adrian 19.25 201.00 3,869.25
Johnson, Craig 16.50 214.00 3,531.00
Ross, Samuel 2.75 229.00 629.75
Sultan, Sara 38.50 173.00 6,660.50
Totals 77.00 14,690.50
Total Labor 14,690.50
Consultants
GLENN REED DBA: GDR CONSULTING 265.00
JENNIFER L. CHIODO DBA: JLC CONSULTING 412.00
CORE ENERGY INSIGHTS INC. 945.25
ECOMETRIC CONSULTING, LLC 360.50
ENERGY FUTURES GROUP, INC. 477.00
RALPH PRAHL 636.00
Total Consultants 3,095.75 3,095.75
Total this Task $17,786.25

Task 03 Education Initiatives

Please Reference Our Invoice Number on your Payment



Project 863224-0007590.00  Rhode Island EERMC - 2024 Invoice 000000376086

Professional Personnel

Hours Rate Amount
Johnson, Craig 2.75 214.00 588.50
Ross, Samuel .25 229.00 57.25
Sultan, Sara 15.00 173.00 2,595.00
Totals 18.00 3,240.75
Total Labor 3,240.75
Consultants
RACHEL SHOLLY 4,606.50
Total Consultants 4,606.50 4,606.50
Total this Task $7,847.25
Total this Phase $26,890.25
Phase 002 System Reliability Procurement
Task 01 Council Representation
Professional Personnel
Hours Rate Amount
Ross, Samuel 1.00 229.00 229.00
Sultan, Sara 2.00 173.00 346.00
Totals 3.00 575.00
Total Labor 575.00
Total this Task $575.00
Task 02 Plan Development and Oversight
Professional Personnel
Hours Rate Amount
Johnson, Craig 1.75 214.00 374.50
Ross, Samuel 7.25 229.00 1,660.25
Totals 9.00 2,034.75
Total Labor 2,034.75
Total this Task $2,034.75
Total this Phase $2,609.75
Phase 003 Regulatory Proceedings
Task 01 Council Representation
Professional Personnel
Hours Rate Amount
Ross, Samuel 2.00 229.00 458.00
Totals 2.00 458.00
Total Labor 458.00
Total this Task $458.00
Task 02 Develop Technical Materials

Please Reference Our Invoice Number on your Payment Page 2



Project 863224-0007590.00  Rhode Island EERMC - 2024 Invoice 000000376086
Professional Personnel
Hours Rate Amount
Ross, Samuel 6.00 229.00 1,374.00
Totals 6.00 1,374.00
Total Labor 1,374.00
Total this Task $1,374.00
Total this Phase $1,832.00
Phase 004 Council Sponsored Meetings and Materials
Task 01 Meeting Attendance
Professional Personnel
Hours Rate Amount
Caesar, Adrian 2.00 201.00 402.00
Johnson, Craig 3.00 214.00 642.00
Ross, Samuel 3.00 229.00 687.00
Sultan, Sara .50 173.00 86.50
Totals 8.50 1,817.50
Total Labor 1,817.50
Total this Task $1,817.50
Task 02 Develop Technical Materials
Professional Personnel
Hours Rate Amount
Caesar, Adrian 19.25 201.00 3,869.25
Johnson, Craig 21.50 214.00 4,601.00
Ross, Samuel 10.00 229.00 2,290.00
Sultan, Sara 8.75 173.00 1,513.75
Totals 59.50 12,274.00
Total Labor 12,274.00
Total this Task $12,274.00
Task 03 Other Council Responsibilities
Professional Personnel
Hours Rate Amount
Caesar, Adrian .25 201.00 50.25
Totals .25 50.25
Total Labor 50.25
Consultants
RACHEL SHOLLY 456.50
Total Consultants 456.50 456.50
Total this Task $506.75
Total this Phase $14,598.25
Phase 005 Research, Analysis, and Other Council Su
Please Reference Our Invoice Number on your Payment Page 3



Project 863224-0007590.00  Rhode Island EERMC - 2024 Invoice 000000376086
Professional Personnel
Hours Rate Amount
Johnson, Craig .50 214.00 107.00
Ross, Samuel 4.75 229.00 1,087.75
Totals 5.25 1,194.75
Total Labor 1,194.75
Total this Phase $1,194.75
Phase 006 Administrative
Consultants
RACHEL SHOLLY 41.50
Total Consultants 41.50 41.50
Total this Phase $41.50
Billing Limits Current Prior To-Date
Total Billings 47,166.50 0.00 47,166.50
Limit 817,025.00
Remaining 769,858.50
Total this Invoice $47,166.50
Billings To Date
Current Prior Total
Labor 38,966.25 0.00 38,966.25
Consultant 8,200.25 0.00 8,200.25
Totals 47,166.50 0.00 47,166.50

Please Reference Our Invoice Number on your Payment
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Project 863224-0007590.00  Rhode Island EERMC - 2024 Invoice 000000376086

B|”|ng BaCkUp Tuesday, February 27, 2024
NV5, Inc. Invoice 000000376086 Dated 2/27/2024 2:37:18 PM
Phase 001 EE Prg Planning & Implementation Oversig
Task 01 Council Representation
Professional Personnel
Hours Rate Amount

Johnson, Craig 1/3/2024 1.25 214.00 267.50

bi-weekly check-in call with RIE/OER, associated meeting prep.
Johnson, Craig 1/16/2024 1.25 214.00 267.50

Bi-weekly check-in with OER and RIE, associated meeting prep.
Johnson, Craig 1/30/2024 1.50 214.00 321.00

Bi-weekly check-in with OER and RIE, associated meeting prep. Equity
Working Group - Attend EWG meeting

Ross, Samuel 1/3/2024 1.00 229.00 229.00
OER / RIE check in
Ross, Samuel 1/16/2024 .75 229.00 171.75
prep for, partial attendance at OER/RIE check in
Totals 5.75 1,256.75
Total Labor 1,256.75
Total this Task $1,256.75
Task 02 Implementation Oversight and Plan Develo
Professional Personnel
Hours Rate Amount
Caesar, Adrian 1/9/2024 .25 201.00 50.25
Assessment of RI Equity Metrics
Caesar, Adrian 1/11/2024 .50 201.00 100.50
January C&I Sector team planning and kickoff meeting agenda
development
Caesar, Adrian 1/15/2024 1.00 201.00 201.00

RICG PY 2022 impact evaluation sample design memo review and CTeam
feedback discussion w/Eval team
Caesar, Adrian 1/16/2024 2.50 201.00 502.50

Preliminary year-end 2023 data review and Res/C&I data report
development; C&I electric savings data corrections

Caesar, Adrian 1/17/2024 .50 201.00 100.50
RICG PY 2022 impact evaluation sample design meeting

Caesar, Adrian 1/18/2024 1.50 201.00 301.50
January C&I sector team call prep

Caesar, Adrian 1/19/2024 .25 201.00 50.25
EM&V study tracker updates

Caesar, Adrian 1/22/2024 1.50 201.00 301.50

January C&l sector team call notes review and follow-ups/action items;
C&l data report formula updates for deviation in electric savings;
preliminary YE 2023 data report review; EM&V study tracker updates
Caesar, Adrian 1/23/2024 1.75 201.00 351.75

RI Energy equity metrics assessment; pre-EWG kickoff meetings (C-
Team, GHHI, RI Energy)

Please Reference Our Invoice Number on your Payment
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Project 863224-0007590.00  Rhode Island EERMC - 2024

Invoice

000000376086

Caesar, Adrian 1/24/2024 6.00 201.00
C&I and Residential 2024 data report template development - process
check-in, BCR model remapping to data report measure categories, data
report instructional guide development/updates; preliminary Year End
2023 C&I data report review

Caesar, Adrian 1/30/2024 3.50 201.00
RI Res/C&I data report development annual updates - 2024 BCR model
measure mapping, program-level sheet development and formula
updates, instructional guide development; revised RICG 2022 sample
design methodology review

Johnson, Craig 1/3/2024 .25 214.00

Sector team work - coordinate with Adrian on Res/C&I sector team
meeting plans for January

Johnson, Craig 1/5/2024 .25 214.00

Check-in with Sam and Adrian, discussed plans for finalizing and updating

monthly data report, as well as plans for reviewing compliance filing BC
models and updating internal sector team report infrastructure.

Johnson, Craig 1/9/2024 1.50 214.00
Res sector team work - 2024 kickoff meeting with internal res team,
associated meeting prep. EWG - check-in and coordinate with Margie and
Adrian about prep work before first EWG meeting.

Johnson, Craig 1/11/2024 .50 214.00

Residential Sector Team - continue work on scoping out meeting plans
and topics for sector team work.

Johnson, Craig 1/17/2024 1.00 214.00
EWG - Review equity metrics and work on internal assessment of
feasibility and impact. Coordinate with Bryan and Brendan for a meeting
pre-EWG meeting. Sector teams - Meeting with Spencer to coordinate on
plan for res/IE meetings in 2024, associated meeting prep.

Johnson, Craig 1/23/2024 5.25 214.00
Res Sector Team - coordinate with Spencer on time to prep for February
meeting, brainstorm initial topics. EWG - Pre-EWG Kickoff meeting with
RIE and GHHI, associated meeting prep including reassessing our
assessment of feasibility to track, and impact of tracking.

Johnson, Craig 1/25/2024 1.50 214.00
Res Sector Team - Continue prep for kickoff meeting with Spencer,
including assembling list of topics for sector team meetings for year.

Johnson, Craig 1/26/2024 3.00 214.00
Res Sector Team - Meeting with Spencer to discuss planning for sector
team meetings, associated meeting prep.

Johnson, Craig 1/29/2024 1.00 214.00
Sector Teams - work on drafting schedule and meeting topics for sector
team meetings in 2024, including standing check-ins with Spencer.

Johnson, Craig 1/31/2024 2.25 214.00
Sector Team work - review program leads table from Spencer. Prep
meeting invites for res team meetings. Work on materials for February
res team meeting.

Ross, Samuel 1/2/2024 .50 229.00
catch up on corresp & work completed while out; planning team's tasks
for the week

Ross, Samuel 1/10/2024 2.25 229.00
prep for, meet with RIE team to discuss goals for 2024 collaboration;
internal team meeting re: same, planning workstream for balance of wk;
confirmation of delayed Council mtg and impacts

Sultan, Sara 1/5/2024 4.50 173.00

1,206.00

703.50

53.50

53.50

321.00

107.00

214.00

1,123.50

321.00

642.00

214.00

481.50

114.50

515.25

778.50

Please Reference Our Invoice Number on your Payment
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Project 863224-0007590.00  Rhode Island EERMC - 2024 Invoice 000000376086

Data Snapshot - Linked the data snapshot template to the November
data and created the November data snapshot. Created draft December
data snapshot. Worked on the process and instructions guide for
updating future snapshots.

Sultan, Sara 1/8/2024 .50 173.00 86.50

Read 2024 EE plan and reviewed Cost of Energy Supply to inform work
on cost of supply analysis.

Sultan, Sara 1/9/2024 3.75 173.00 648.75

Cost of Supply Analysis - Created a template in excel to review Cost of
Energy Supply and copied tables from 2024 EE plan. Monthly Data
Snapshot - Created template for gas data snapshots and updated electric
data snapshot. Created new Sankey diagrams and updates figures in
both electric and gas snapshots. Created a process guide for developing
data snapshot content. Working session with Adrian on updates and
automation processes.
Sultan, Sara 1/10/2024 3.25 173.00 562.25
Data Snapshot - Updated template to add program descriptions. Working
session with internal team, discussed updates on data snapshot
workbook template.
Sultan, Sara 1/11/2024 1.00 173.00 173.00

Cost of Supply Analysis - Reviewed attachment 4 of 2024 EE plan to copy
details into Excel template for Cost of Energy Supply analysis

Sultan, Sara 1/15/2024 3.50 173.00 605.50

Cost of Supply Analysis - Continued reviewing the attachment 4 for EE
plan and filled the cost tables in excel sheet for cost of supply analsysis.
Reviewed and incorporated feedback from Sam. Monthly Data Reports -
Completed res workbook for december data reports.
Sultan, Sara 1/16/2024 3.75 173.00 648.75
Data Reports - Worked on C&I workbook for December data reports.
Worked on cross sector analysis for December data reports. Working
session with Adrian to work on mapping measures in C&I data report.
Data Snapshot - Reviewed and incorporated feedback on data snapshot
for program descriptions, updated gas snapshot template and popultated
december data.
Sultan, Sara 1/17/2024 2.00 173.00 346.00
Data Snapshot - Update December snapshot based on updated C&I data.
Working session with internal team to discuss updates made to snapshot.
Cost of Supply Analysis - Completed cost of supply analysis excel
template by filling out remaining table for EE plan's RI test inclusion.

Sultan, Sara 1/18/2024 .50 173.00 86.50
Working session with internal team, discussed work on finalizing data
snapshot.

Sultan, Sara 1/24/2024 3.00 173.00 519.00

Data Reports - Begin working on C&I 2024 data report template. Work on
mapping BC Model names and end uses. Working session with Adrian
regarding same.

Sultan, Sara 1/25/2024 2.50 173.00 432.50
Continued working on C&I BC model 2024 and completed elec mapping.
Sultan, Sara 1/26/2024 2.25 173.00 389.25

Data Reports - Started working on mapping gas BCR model for Res and
C&I data reports.

Sultan, Sara 1/29/2024 2.50 173.00 432.50

Data Reports - Continued working on C&I data report template that maps
in 2024 BC model.

Sultan, Sara 1/30/2024 3.50 173.00 605.50

Please Reference Our Invoice Number on your Payment Page 7



Project

863224-0007590.00 Rhode Island EERMC - 2024 Invoice

000000376086

Sultan, Sara

Data Reports - Continued working on C&I data report template for 2024
BC model and completed the C&I sector. Cretaed Elec BC model template
for Res data report. Begin working on mapping for IE sector programs in
res data report.
1/31/2024 2.00 173.00 346.00
Data Reports - Continued working on BCR mapping for Income Eligible
sector and completed IE elec mapping for res data report. Began work on
elec res BCR mapping for res data report.
Totals 77.00 14,690.50
Total Labor

Total this Task

Task 03 Education Initiatives
Professional Personnel

Hours Rate Amount
Johnson, Craig 1/2/2024 .50 214.00 107.00

EE & Climate Awareness Campaign RFP - coordinate with OER and
EERMC legal regarding next steps.

Johnson, Craig 1/4/2024 .50 214.00 107.00

Check-in call with Steve and Rachel re: EE and Climate Awareness
Campaign RFP update, associated meeting prep.

Johnson, Craig 1/5/2024 .50 214.00 107.00

Check-in call with EERMC legal re: next steps on EE and Climate
Awareness Campaign RFP update.

Johnson, Craig 1/11/2024 .50 214.00 107.00

Meeting with Rachel and Sam to discuss next steps on Council rebranding
and upcoming EE and Climate Awareness campaign RFP

Johnson, Craig 1/31/2024 .75 214.00 160.50

Ross, Samuel

Sultan, Sara

Sultan, Sara

Sultan, Sara

Sultan, Sara

Sultan, Sara

Check-in with Rachel and others on Education items, including EE and
Climate Public Awareness Campaign RFP and new Council website launch

1/11/2024 .25 229.00 57.25
educ update mtg partial attendance
1/2/2024 .50 173.00 86.50

Extracted relevant updates from variety of RI newsletters and updates to
inform upcoming quarterly newsletter

1/3/2024 .50 173.00 86.50
Read newsletters and took notes for council's newsletter.
1/4/2024 3.75 173.00 648.75

Newsletter - Compiled a list of important news and added to the template
for the upcoming council's newsletter. Attended EC4 meeting and
summarized information for the newsletter. Created a new color palette
based on updated Council logo in Canva. Council Branding - worked on a
new brand kit for the Council and created a new template using the new
logo and brand.
1/5/2024 3.50 173.00 605.50
Newsletter - Extracted relevant updates from variety of RI newsletters
and updates to inform upcoming newsletter. Worked on notes from EC4
meeting to include in Newsletter. Reviewed and revised newsletter
template. Began work on drafting writeups for next newsletter.
1/8/2024 .50 173.00 86.50
Explored NEEP, EC4, EBC, and ACEEE websites to subscribe to their
newsletters and stay informed about upcoming events to cover for
newsletter.

14,690.50
$17,786.25

Please Reference Our Invoice Number on your Payment
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Project 863224-0007590.00  Rhode Island EERMC - 2024 Invoice 000000376086
Sultan, Sara 1/9/2024 .50 173.00 86.50
Extracted relevant updates from variety of RI newsletters and updates to
inform upcoming quarterly newsletter
Sultan, Sara 1/17/2024 2.00 173.00 346.00
Newsletter - Attended EC4 STAB meeting and drafted keypoints for
inclusion in newsletter.
Sultan, Sara 1/18/2024 1.00 173.00 173.00
Reviewed RI future of gas TWG meeting 6 and watched the recording to
prepare for newsletter.
Sultan, Sara 1/19/2024 .50 173.00 86.50
Extracted relevant updates from variety of RI newsletters and updates to
inform upcoming quarterly newsletter
Sultan, Sara 1/23/2024 1.00 173.00 173.00
Transcribed notes from Maine IRA Home Energy Rebates Draft Proposal
meeting for use in Council newsletter.
Sultan, Sara 1/30/2024 .50 173.00 86.50
Reviewed the newsletters from past week and subscribed to a few other
resources.
Sultan, Sara 1/31/2024 .75 173.00 129.75
Covered EC4 Advisory Board meeting for the newsletter.
Totals 18.00 3,240.75
Total Labor 3,240.75
Total this Task $7,847.25
Total this Phase $26,890.25
Phase 002 System Reliability Procurement
Task 01 Council Representation
Professional Personnel
Hours Rate Amount
Ross, Samuel 1/10/2024 1.00 229.00 229.00
attend SRP TWG
Sultan, Sara 1/22/2024 2.00 173.00 346.00
Read SRP triannual plan.
Totals 3.00 575.00
Total Labor 575.00
Total this Task $575.00
Task 02 Plan Development and Oversight
Professional Personnel
Hours Rate Amount
Johnson, Craig 1/19/2024 .50 214.00 107.00
Check-in with Sam and OER on SRP Investment Proposal.
Johnson, Craig 1/29/2024 1.25 214.00 267.50
Working session with Sam to review DR BC Model.
Ross, Samuel 1/19/2024 .50 229.00 114.50
check in with OER on DR, Council budget approaches
Ross, Samuel 1/22/2024 1.00 229.00 229.00
Begin review of DR investment proposal
Please Reference Our Invoice Number on your Payment Page 9



Project 863224-0007590.00  Rhode Island EERMC - 2024 Invoice 000000376086
Ross, Samuel 1/23/2024 1.00 229.00 229.00
complete review of DR investment proposal doc; request BC Model
Ross, Samuel 1/25/2024 2.25 229.00 515.25
review DR IP presentation and begin review of BC model
Ross, Samuel 1/26/2024 1.00 229.00 229.00
cont. BC model reivew; disc. DR next steps with team; reach out to
Carrie for meeting early next wk
Ross, Samuel 1/30/2024 1.00 229.00 229.00
prep for, attend SRP check in
Ross, Samuel 1/31/2024 .50 229.00 114.50
DR debrief with team, next steps
Totals 9.00 2,034.75
Total Labor 2,034.75
Total this Task $2,034.75
Total this Phase $2,609.75
Phase 003 Regulatory Proceedings
Task 01 Council Representation
Professional Personnel
Hours Rate Amount
Ross, Samuel 1/9/2024 2.00 229.00 458.00
Fog TWG attendance
Totals 2.00 458.00
Total Labor 458.00
Total this Task $458.00
Task 02 Develop Technical Materials
Professional Personnel
Hours Rate Amount
Ross, Samuel 1/24/2024 6.00 229.00 1,374.00
prep for, attend future of gas stakeholder committee meeting
Totals 6.00 1,374.00
Total Labor 1,374.00
Total this Task $1,374.00
Total this Phase $1,832.00
Phase 004 Council Sponsored Meetings and Materials
Task 01 Meeting Attendance
Professional Personnel
Hours Rate Amount
Caesar, Adrian 1/25/2024 2.00 201.00 402.00

Please Reference Our Invoice Number on your Payment
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863224-0007590.00  Rhode Island EERMC - 2024 Invoice 000000376086
January EERMC Meeting
Johnson, Craig 1/25/2024 3.00 214.00 642.00
January EERMC and ExCom meeting attendance.
Ross, Samuel 1/25/2024 3.00 229.00 687.00
attend EERMC ExCom, Council mtg
Sultan, Sara 1/25/2024 .50 173.00 86.50
Attended council meeting.
Totals 8.50 1,817.50
Total Labor 1,817.50
Total this Task $1,817.50
02 Develop Technical Materials
Professional Personnel
Hours Rate Amount
Caesar, Adrian 1/3/2024 .50 201.00 100.50
January EERMC mtg. materials development check in - RI procurement
update, 2024 EERMC mtg. calendar and topics, 2025 planning priorities,
EERMC data snapshot
Caesar, Adrian 1/4/2024 1.00 201.00 201.00
January EERMC mtg. materials development - Electric DR proposal
review, regulatory updates, EERMC data snapshot; November EERMC
data snapshot development
Caesar, Adrian 1/5/2024 2.50 201.00 502.50
January EERMC mtg. materials development - November EERMC data
snapshot development, 2024 EERMC mtg topics and calendar
Caesar, Adrian 1/9/2024 1.75 201.00 351.75
January EERMC mtg. materials development - data snapshot
presentation, 2024 EERMC calendar; Data Snapshot development -
reformatting Gas data snapshot and PDF export, program descriptions for
Snapshot instructional guide
Caesar, Adrian 1/10/2024 1.50 201.00 301.50
January EERMC mtg. materials development - data snapshot
presentation, 2024 EERMC calendar; Data Snapshot development -
reformatting Gas data snapshot and PDF export, program descriptions
and definitions for Snapshot instructional guide
Caesar, Adrian 1/12/2024 .50 201.00 100.50
January EERMC mtg. materials development - data snapshot
presentation, 2024 EERMC calendar, 2024 Council priorities, draft 2024
SOw
Caesar, Adrian 1/16/2024 2.00 201.00 402.00
January EERMC mtg materials development check in; EERMc data
snapshot development - program definitions and descriptions, preliminary
2023 year-end data update
Caesar, Adrian 1/17/2024 2.50 201.00 502.50
January EERMC mtg materials development check in; Data Snapshot
walkthrough presentation, EERMC Calendar presentation
Caesar, Adrian 1/18/2024 3.50 201.00 703.50
January EERMC mtg materials development check ins; updated data
snapshot review; Data Snapshot walkthrough presentation, EERMC
Calendar presentation development
Caesar, Adrian 1/19/2024 1.25 201.00 251.25
EERMC calendar presentation updates - TWG schedule, EERMC meeting
logistics survey results summary and conclusions
Caesar, Adrian 1/23/2024 .50 201.00 100.50
January EERMC mtg. prep check-in
Please Reference Our Invoice Number on your Payment Page 11



Project 863224-0007590.00  Rhode Island EERMC - 2024 Invoice 000000376086

Caesar, Adrian 1/24/2024 .50 201.00 100.50
Data Snapshot presentation walkthrough

Caesar, Adrian 1/26/2024 .50 201.00 100.50
January EERMC mtg. follow ups - data snapshot feedback, EERMC
calendar updates, EERMC meeting schedule and cadence

Caesar, Adrian 1/30/2024 .25 201.00 50.25
January EERMC mtg. follow-ups and initial February EERMC mtg. material
prep discussion

Caesar, Adrian 1/31/2024 .50 201.00 100.50
February EERMC mtg. material development - EERMC calendar update,
EERMC website launch, monthly data snapshot

Johnson, Craig 1/3/2024 .25 214.00 53.50
January Materials - Review draft January agenda and coordinate material
development with Adrian and Sara.

Johnson, Craig 1/4/2024 .25 214.00 53.50
January Council Materials -Check-in with team on material development.

Johnson, Craig 1/5/2024 .25 214.00 53.50
January Council Meeting Materials - check-in with Sam and Adrian and
progress/next steps for team materials. Coordinate with OER re: potential
need to reschedule meeting.

Johnson, Craig 1/8/2024 .25 214.00 53.50
January Council Meeting Materials - Coordinate with Adrian on EERMC
calendar development.

Johnson, Craig 1/9/2024 .50 214.00 107.00
January Council Materials - Working session with Sam and Adrian on
progress for completing deliverables. Discussed timing giving likelihood of
meeting postponement.

Johnson, Craig 1/11/2024 .50 214.00 107.00
Coordinate, check-in on, and work on development of January Council
materials.

Johnson, Craig 1/12/2024 .50 214.00 107.00
January Council Materials - Check-in with internal team on progress.
Work on scoping out next steps on materials.

Johnson, Craig 1/14/2024 2.50 214.00 535.00
January Council Materials - Draft content for 2025 Council Priorities
presentation. Begin drafting supplemental materials including shadow
agenda and memo covering outcomes from PUC open meetings in
December.

Johnson, Craig 1/15/2024 3.00 214.00 642.00
January Council Materials - Draft format for monthly council meeting
briefing material and work on content for this months version. Work on
memo summarizing PUC Open Meeting rulings.

Johnson, Craig 1/16/2024 .50 214.00 107.00
January Council materials - check-in with internal team on timeline and
development of January materials.

Johnson, Craig 1/17/2024 1.25 214.00 267.50
January Council Materials - Work on updates to Council Priorities slides.

Johnson, Craig 1/18/2024 6.50 214.00 1,391.00
January Council Materials - Finish updates to Council priorities slides.
Work on PUC Open Meeting rulings memo. Review Data Snapshot
documents and slide deck. Review calendar slide deck. Review OER draft
materials, provide input. Work on Councilor Briefing Memo. Working
session with team re: same.

Johnson, Craig 1/19/2024 1.00 214.00 214.00

Please Reference Our Invoice Number on your Payment Page 12
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Invoice

000000376086

January Council Materials - Meeting with Steve and Sam to discuss
Council budget reallocation materials and strategies/suggestions for

Councilors. Briefing Memo - make updates to, and finalize memo, send to

Steve. PUC Open Meeting Rulings Memo - review Sam's comments, edits
to memo.

Johnson, Craig 1/22/2024 .75 214.00
January Council Materials - Check-in with Sam on comments for Open
Meeting Summary memo, update memo, and send to PUC staff for
comment.

Johnson, Craig 1/24/2024 .50 214.00
January Council Materials - Work on PUC Open Meeting Rulings memo,
discussion with John H. re: same.

Johnson, Craig 1/25/2024 2.00 214.00
January Council Materials - Review materials, prep talking points.

Johnson, Craig 1/26/2024 1.00 214.00
Coordinate with team re: follow-ups from Council meeting, including
updates to materials for February meeting. Work on developing calendar
and tracker for all monthly meeting materials that require deliverables
from our team.

Ross, Samuel 1/4/2024 1.00 229.00

review Jan agenda, corresp re: same; team meeting to confirm work plan

developing materials
Ross, Samuel 1/5/2024 .25 229.00

coordinate on RFP next steps, council mtg logistics, work for next wk, etc.

Ross, Samuel 1/11/2024 .50 229.00
coord updated COuncil meeting development process, assignments
Ross, Samuel 1/12/2024 .25 229.00

check in on progress on materials, confirm plan for my review early next
wk

Ross, Samuel 1/15/2024 1.00 229.00
review & comment on Council materials, focus on priorities

Ross, Samuel 1/16/2024 1.00 229.00
review and comment on council materials

Ross, Samuel 1/17/2024 2.50 229.00
coord continued efforts on Council materials, incl. reviews and comments
on multiple, incl. Council prioriites slides

Ross, Samuel 1/18/2024 2.25 229.00
Team and individual working sessions to finalize Council materials, incl.
edits to priorities and path to finalization for Data Snapshot, priorities,
and others. Coord plan to discuss DR next steps given RIE delay, incl.
discussion with CGill.

Ross, Samuel 1/29/2024 .25 229.00
coord team efforts this week on Council materials

Ross, Samuel 1/30/2024 .50 229.00
team check in, prep for DR afternoon call and OER check in on Council
agenda

Ross, Samuel 1/31/2024 .50 229.00
coord development of tracker for recurring Council materials, data
snapshot next steps

Sultan, Sara 1/4/2024 .50 173.00
January Council meeting - Working session with team to review and
discuss material development roles for January council meeting.

Sultan, Sara 1/9/2024 1.25 173.00

January Council Materials - Working session with internal team, discussed

council materials. Begin work on developing slide deck for data snapshot
overview, discussion with Adrian regarding same.

160.50

107.00

428.00

214.00

229.00

57.25

114.50

57.25

229.00

229.00

572.50

515.25

57.25

114.50

114.50

86.50

216.25

Please Reference Our Invoice Number on your Payment
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Sultan, Sara 1/10/2024 2.75 173.00 475.75
January Council Materials - Continued working on slide deck for data
snapshot overview. Review and address feedback from team. Working
session with internal team to discuss progress and next steps.

Sultan, Sara 1/16/2024 .50 173.00 86.50
Working session with team to discuss Council material development.
Sultan, Sara 1/18/2024 1.25 173.00 216.25

January Council Materials - Updated and delivered final slide deck of data
snapshot walkthrough. Working session with internal team regarding
same.
Sultan, Sara 1/23/2024 .50 173.00 86.50

Working session with team to review data snapshot presentation and
walkthrough talking points.

Sultan, Sara 1/24/2024 .50 173.00 86.50
Prepare talking points for data snapshot presentation with team.

Sultan, Sara 1/26/2024 .50 173.00 86.50
Working session with team to discuss outcomes from Council meeting

Sultan, Sara 1/30/2024 .50 173.00 86.50

Working session with team, discussed Council meeting follow-ups and
upcoming meeting material development
Sultan, Sara 1/31/2024 .50 173.00 86.50

Working session with internal team, discussed updates on material
development for Council meeting

Totals 59.50 12,274.00
Total Labor 12,274.00
Total this Task $12,274.00
Task 03 Other Council Responsibilities
Professional Personnel
Hours Rate Amount
Caesar, Adrian 1/10/2024 .25 201.00 50.25
EERMC re-branded templates and website rollout planning
Totals .25 50.25
Total Labor 50.25
Total this Task $506.75
Total this Phase $14,598.25
Phase 005 Research, Analysis, and Other Council Su
Professional Personnel
Hours Rate Amount
Johnson, Craig 1/31/2024 .50 214.00 107.00
EERMC Legal Services RFP - final review and provide feedback to OER.
Ross, Samuel 1/16/2024 .25 229.00 57.25
rescheduling with Peter and Sue due to Council mtg date change
Ross, Samuel 1/23/2024 1.25 229.00 286.25
prep for, attend 1-on-1 call with Peter to prep for Counicl mtg
Ross, Samuel 1/24/2024 .50 229.00 114.50

Reply to Councilor AnderBois Q on C-Team SOW

Please Reference Our Invoice Number on your Payment
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Ross, Samuel 1/25/2024 2.75 229.00 629.75
prep for, attend meeting with Steve Lasher and Priscilla; prep for ExCom,
Council meeting with Harry
Totals 5.25 1,194.75
Total Labor 1,194.75
Total this Phase $1,194.75
Phase 006 Administrative
Total this Phase $41.50
Total this Project $47,166.50
Total this Report $47,166.50

Please Reference Our Invoice Number on your Payment

Page 15



Margie Lynch/Core Energy Insights, Inc.
4445 E. Hoback River Road, Jackson, WY 83001

INVOICE
TO : Optimal Energy Inc. Invoice Number: CEI RI 1-2024
10600 Route 116, Suite 3 Invoice Date:  February 5, 2024
Hinesburg, VT 05461 OEI Project #: 7590

Work Performed for RI Energy Efficiency & Resource Management Council

Description of Services Amount

Services Performed 01/01/24 through 01/31/24

Hours Hourly Rate Amount Due
LABOR - Regular Hours 4.75 $199.00 $945.25
LABOR - Travel Hours 0.00 $99.50 $0.00
Travel Expenses $0.00

(See attached travel expense form for details.)

TOTAL DUE $945.25




Margie Lynch/Core Energy Insights, Inc.

Services Performed 01/01/24 through 01/31/24

001 - EE Program Planning & Implementation

001-02
Implementation
001-01 Oversight & 001-03 Sub-Total | Sub-Total

Council Plan Education 006-00 Regular Travel Total

Date Description of Services Representation | Development Initiatives Administrative | Travel Time Hrs. Hrs. Hours
1/9/24 ]2024 work planning meeting w/res team 1.00 0.00 0.00 0.00
1/23/24 |Equity Working Group meeting preparations 2.00 1.00 0.00 1.00
1/30/2024)Prepared for and participated in Equity Working Group meeting 1.75 2.00 0.00 2.00
0.00 0.00 0.00
0.00 0.00 0.00
Total Hours 0.00 4.75 0.00 0.00 0.00 4.75 0.00 4.75
Total Amount $0.00 $945.25 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $945.25 0.00 | $945.25




EcoMetric Consulting, LLC
41 Leopard Road, Suite 104

paoh P 19501 INVOICE

610.400.8600
ECOMETRIC admin@ecometricconsulting.com

BILLED TO TOTAL DUE

Sam Ross

B ——. $360.50

10600 Route 116, Suite 3
Hinesburg, VT 05461

Project Name RI EERMC Consultant Invoice Date 02/05/2024
Project # 7525 Due Date 03/06/2024
Invoice # 1029-P1-24 Payment Terms Net 30
Billing Period 12/30/2023-01/26/2024
“rasinumber | pescripton | Amount |
001-02 Implementation Oversight & Plan Development $360.50
Subtotal $360.50
Invoice Total $360.50

Budget Summary

Task Number Budget Previous Billings Total Spent

Task 001-02 $150,000.00 $41,757.00 $42,117.50 $107,882.50

TBD TBD $0.00 $0.00

Contract Balance $107,882.50




Invoice Number

Period 12/30/2023 - 01/26/2024
Project Person Title Month Hours Rate Amount
RI EERMC Consultant  Implementation Oversight & Plan D¢ Salil Gogte Partner 2024-01 0 $220.00 $ =
RI EERMC Consultant  Implementation Oversight & Plan D¢ Michael Frischmann Partner 2024-01 0 $220.00 $ -
RI EERMC Consultant  Implementation Oversight & Plan D¢ Michael Honeychuck Managing Consultant 2024-01 1.75 $206.00 $ 360.50
RI EERMC Consultant  Implementation Oversight & Plan D¢ Bitul Sinha Managing Consultant 2024-01 0 $206.00 $ -
RI EERMC Consultant  Implementation Oversight & Plan D¢ Cory Read Data Scientist 2024-01 0 $206.00 $ =
RI EERMC Consultant  Implementation Oversight & Plan D¢ Jake Fuller Managing Consultant 2024-01 0 $206.00 $ -
RI EERMC Consultant  Implementation Oversight & Plan D¢ Mary George Sr Engineer 2024-01 0 $166.00 $ =
RI EERMC Consultant  Implementation Oversight & Plan D¢ Kyle McKenna Managing Consultant 2024-01 0 $206.00 $ -
Total 1.75 $ 360.50
Project Person Title Month Hours Rate Amount
RI EERMC Consultant 0 Salil Gogte Partner 2024-01 0 $220.00 $ =
RI EERMC Consultant 0 Michael Frischmann Partner 2024-01 0 $220.00 $ -
RI EERMC Consultant 0 Michael Honeychuck Managing Consultant 2024-01 0 $206.00 $ =
RI EERMC Consultant 0 Bitul Sinha Managing Consultant 2024-01 0 $206.00 $ -
Rl EERMC Consultant 0 2024-01 0 $ =

$

Total



fname local_date hours task notes
RICE22N087 M&YV Report Review
1/4/2024 1.25 Invoice & discussions
Michael Ho Implementation Oversigh Emails

Michael Hol 1/16/2024 0.5 Implementation Oversigh Emails about RIG sample design




GDR Consulting
576 Rutland St
Carlisle MA 01741

INVOICE
TO : Optimal Energy Inc. Invoice Number: 1RI
10600 Route 116, Suite 3 Invoice Date:  February 4, 2024
Hinesburg, VT 05461 OEI Project #: 7590

Work Performed for RI Energy Efficiency & Resource Management Council

Description of Services Amount

Services Performed 1/01/24 through 1/31/24

Hours Hourly Rate Amount Due
LABOR - Regular Hours 0.25 $212.00 $53.00
LABOR - Travel Hours 0.00 $106.00 $0.00
Travel Expenses $0.00

(See attached travel expense form for details.)

TOTAL DUE $53.00




GDR Consulting

Services Performed 1/01/24 through 1/31/24

001 - EE Program Planning & Implementation

001-02 005-00
001-01 Implementation 001-03 Research, Sub-Total | Sub-Total
Council Oversight & Plan Education Analysis & other 006-00 Regular Travel Total
Date Description of Services Representation | Development Initiatives Council Support| Administrative | Travel Time Hrs. Hrs. Hours
1/5/2024 |Review of RI HPIN training requirements 0.25 0.25 0.00 0.25
1/9/2024 | Attend monthly Residential Team call 1.00 1.00 1.00
Total Hours 0.00 1.25 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 1.25 0.00 1.25
Total Amount $0.00 $265.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00] $265.00 0.00 [ $265.00




Rachel Sholly
48 Hudson Street, Providence, Rl 02909

TO : Optimal Energy Inc.
10600 Route 116, Suite 3
Hinesburg, VT 05461

INVOICE
Invoice Number: 73
Invoice Date: February 4, 2024
OEI Project #: 7590

Work Performed for RI Energy Efficiency & Resource Management Council

Description of Services Amount
Services Performed 1/01/2024 through 1/31/2024
Hours Hourly Rate Amount Due
LABOR - Regular Hours 30.50 $166.00 $5,063.00
LABOR - Admin Hours 0.50 $83.00 $41.50
LABOR - Travel Hours 0.00 $83.00 $0.00

Travel Expenses
(See attached travel expense form for details.)

TOTAL DUE

$0.00

$5,104.50



Rachel Sholly
Services Performed 1/01/2024 through 1/31/2024

001 - EE Program Planning &
Implementation

004 - Council Sponsored Meetings & Materials

001:02 004-02 005-00
Implementation 001-03 004-01 Develop 004-03 Research, 006-00 Sub-Total | o 1\ Total | Sub-Total | Total
Oversight & Education Meeting . Other Council . L. . Regular .
Plan Initiatives Attendance Technllcal Responsibilities Analys.|s & other| Administrative Hrs. Travel Hrs.|Admin Hrs.| Hours
Materials Council Support
Date Description of Services Development
Call re: public awareness campaign RFP language; Sent
01/04/24 |EdComm mtg reminder 0.75 0.75 0.00 0.00 0.75
EdComm mtg; Updated URI contract incl. review of
relevant mtg minutes; Call w/legal re: revisions to public
01/05/24 |awareness campaign RFP 2.50 2.50 0.00 0.00 2.50
Updated URI contract, related correspondence; Updating
01/08/24 |branded templates 3.00 3.00 0.00 0.00 3.00
Reviewed & responded to RFP edits from legal;
01/09/24 |Updating branded templates 5.75 5.75 0.00 0.00 5.75
C-team planning re: data snapshot, URI contract
01/10/24 |extension, public awareness campaign RFP 0.50 0.50 0.00 0.00 0.50
Reviewed & responded to additional RFP edits from
legal; Thorough review & edits to RFP & timeline; Travel
01/11/24 |work plan; C-team check-in re: rebrand roll-out & RFP 4.75 4.75 0.00 0.00 4.75
Finalized & sent RFP & timeline scenarios; Reviewed
Advocacy invoices, updated spreadsheet; Compiled &
01/12/24 |sent final website feedback 3.25 3.25 0.00 0.00 3.25
01/16/24 |Updated org chart for SOW 0.50 0.00 0.00 0.50 0.50
01/17/24 |slides 1.00 2.50 3.50 0.00 0.00 3.50
Updated data snapshots & slides; C-team planning re:
Council mtg materials, RFP, website, rebrand
01/18/24 |presentation 1.00 1.00 0.00 0.00 1.00
Reviewed & responded to legal edits to URI contract;
Reviewed & responded to mtg survey slides; Followed
01/19/24 |up w/Advocacy re: website updates 0.75 0.25 1.00 0.00 0.00 1.00
C-team planning re: RFP, website, Council mtg; Website
edits feedback; Correspondence w/legal counsel re: RFP
01/24/24 | & contract 0.75 0.75 0.00 0.00 0.75
Finalized RFP, update timeline, related correspondence;
Drafted EdComm agenda for OER review; Reviewed
01/25/24 |previously developed web copy 2.00 2.00 0.00 0.00 2.00
01/26/24 |Finalized URI contract; Energy expo planning 1.00 1.00 0.00 0.00 1.00
01/30/24 |Sent final RFP timeline to C-team, OER & review team 0.75] 0.75 0.00 0.00 0.75
0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00
Total Hours 0.00 27.75 0.00 2.75 0.00 0.00 0.50 30.50 0.00 0.50 31.00
Total Amount $0.00 $4,606.50 $0.00 $456.50 $0.00 $0.00 $41.50] $5,063.00 $0.00 $41.50| $5,104.50|




Make Payable to: Jennifer Chiodo
JLC Consulting

52 Bent Creek Road

Hinesburg, VT 05416

INVOICE
TO : Optimal Energy Inc. Invoice Number: R-24.01
10600 Route 116, Suite 3 Invoice Date: January 31, 2024
Hinesburg, VT 05461 okl project #: (NG

Work Performed for Rl Energy Efficiency & Resource Management Council

Description of Services Amount

Services Performed01/01/24 through 01/31/24

Hours Hourly Rate Amount Due
LABOR - Regular Hours 2.00 $206.00 $412.00
LABOR - Travel Hours 0.00 $103.00 $0.00
Travel Expenses $0.00

(See attached travel expense form for details.)

TOTAL DUE $412.00




Make Payable to: Jennifer Chiodo

Services Performed01/01/24 through 01/31/24

UuUl = =

Program
Planning &
001-02
Implementation
Oversight & | syb-Total | Sub-Total
Plan Regular Travel Total
Date Description of Services Development Hrs. Hrs. Hours
1/18/24 |RI C-team call, prep and follow up 2.00 2.00 0.00 2.00
0.00 0.00 0.00
0.00 0.00 0.00
0.00 0.00 0.00
Total Hours 2.00 2.00 0.00 2.00
Total Amount $412.00 $412.00 0.00 | $412.00




Ralph Prahl
7001 Stanhope Place, University Park FL 34201

INVOICE
TO : Optimal Energy Inc. Invoice Number: 47
10600 Route 116, Suite 3 Invoice Date:  February 1, 2024
Hinesburg, VT 05461 OEI Project #: 7590

Work Performed for RI Energy Efficiency & Resource Management Council

Description of Services Amount

Services Performed 1/01/24 through 1/31/24

Hours Hourly Rate Amount Due
LABOR - Regular Hours 3.00 $212.00 $636.00
LABOR - Travel Hours 0.00 $106.00 $0.00
Travel Expenses $0.00

(See attached travel expense form for details.)

TOTAL DUE $636.00




Ralph Prahl
Services Performed 1/01/24 through 1/31/24

002 - System Reliability

001 - EE Program Planning & Implementation Procurement
001-02 002-02 005-00 Sub-
001-01 Implementation 001-03 002-01 Plan Research, Sub-Total Total
Council Oversight & Plan Education Council Development & | Analysis & other 006-00 Regular Travel Total
Date Description of Services Representation | Development Initiatives Representation Oversight Council Support| Administrative | Travel Time Hrs. Hrs. Hours
1/11/2024]C&I custom impact evals 0.25 0.25 0.00 0.00
1/15/2024|RIG sample memo 1.50 1.50 0.00 0.25
1/16/2024|RIG study 0.25 0.25 0.00 1.50
1/17/2024|RIG study call 0.75 0.75 0.00 0.25
1/30/2024|RIG study 0.25 0.25 0.00 0.75
0.00 0.00 0.25
0.00 0.00 0.00
#REF! 0.00 | #REF!
0.00 0.00 0.00
0.00 0.00 0.00
0.00 0.00 0.00
0.00 0.00 0.00
Total Hours 0.00 3.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 #REF! 0.00 | #REF!
Total Amount $0.00 $636.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00|] #REF! 0.00 | #REF!




Energy Futures Group, Inc.
PO Box 587
Hinesburg, VT 05461

INVOICE
TO : Optimal Energy Inc. Invoice Number: 6138
10600 Route 116, Suite 3 Invoice Date:  February 5, 2024
Hinesburg, VT 05461 OEI Project #: 7525

Work Performed for RI Energy Efficiency & Resource Management Council

Description of Services Amount

Services Performed 1/1/2024 through 1/31/2024

Hours Hourly Rate Amount Due
LABOR - Regular Hours 2.25 $212.00 $477.00
LABOR - Travel Hours 0.00 $106.00 $0.00
Travel Expenses $0.00

(See attached travel expense form for details.)

TOTAL DUE $477.00




Enerqy Futures Group, Inc.

Services Performed 1/1/2024 through 1/31/2024

001 - EE Program Planning & Implementation

001-02 005-00
001-01 Implementation 001-03 Research, Sub-Total | Sub-Total

Council Oversight & Plan Education Analysis & other 006-00 Regular Travel Total

Date Description of Services Representation | Development Initiatives Council Support| Administrative | Travel Time Hrs. Hrs. Hours
1/9/2024 Res team check in. 1.00 0.00 0.00 0.00
1/18/2024 C&I sector meeting 1.25 1.00 0.00 1.00
0.00 0.00 0.00
Total Hours 0.00 2.25 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 2.25 0.00 2.25
Total Amount $0.00 $477.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $477.00 0.00 | $477.00




INVOICE 0 Optirrl.al

Federal Tax ID# 03-0351557 ENERGY

AN NW‘E COMPANY

Remit checks to: Remit ACH transfer to: Remit Wire Transfers to:
Optimal Energy, LLC ABA Routing Number 063100277 ABA Routing Number 026009593
PO Box 74008680 Account Number 898052466590 Account Number 898052466590
Chicago, IL 60674-8680 Email ACH/Wire remittance details to RemittanceNotifications@nv5.com Swift Code INTL. BOFAUS3N

March 14, 2024

) Project No: 863224-0007590.00
Steven Chybowski Invoice No: 000000378840
Rhode Island Office of Energy Resources
Professional Services from February 1, 2024 to February 29,2024 = _ _ _ _ _ _ _ _ _ _ __ ____
Phase _ _ _ _ | oo1_ _ EE Prg Planning & Implementation Oversig_ _ _ _ _ _ _ _ _ _ _ o - - -
Task 01 Council Representation
Professional Personnel
Hours Rate Amount
Caesar, Adrian 1.50 201.00 301.50
Johnson, Craig 5.75 214.00 1,230.50
Ross, Samuel 3.25 229.00 744.25
Totals 10.50 2,276.25
Total Labor 2,276.25
Total this Task $2,276.25
Task 02 Implementation Oversight and Plan Develo
Professional Personnel
Hours Rate Amount
Caesar, Adrian 17.25 201.00 3,467.25
Johnson, Craig 29.50 214.00 6,313.00
Ross, Samuel 5.00 229.00 1,145.00
Sultan, Sara 53.25 173.00 9,212.25
Totals 105.00 20,137.50
Total Labor 20,137.50
Consultants
GLENN REED DBA: GDR CONSULTING 795.00
JENNIFER L. CHIODO DBA: JLC CONSULTING 515.00
CORE ENERGY INSIGHTS INC. 1,044.75
RALPH PRAHL 689.00
Total Consultants 3,043.75 3,043.75
Total this Task $23,181.25

Task 03 Education Initiatives

Please Reference Our Invoice Number on your Payment



Project 863224-0007590.00  Rhode Island EERMC - 2024 Invoice 000000378840
Professional Personnel
Hours Rate Amount
Caesar, Adrian .25 201.00 50.25
Johnson, Craig 1.50 214.00 321.00
Sultan, Sara 6.00 173.00 1,038.00
Totals 7.75 1,409.25
Total Labor 1,409.25
Consultants
RACHEL SHOLLY 4,316.00
Total Consultants 4,316.00 4,316.00
Total this Task $5,725.25
Total this Phase $31,182.75
Phase 002 System Reliability Procurement
Task 02 Plan Development and Oversight
Professional Personnel
Hours Rate Amount
Johnson, Craig 1.00 214.00 214.00
Totals 1.00 214.00
Total Labor 214.00
Total this Task $214.00
Total this Phase $214.00
Phase 003 Regulatory Proceedings
Task 02 Develop Technical Materials
Professional Personnel
Hours Rate Amount
Caesar, Adrian 1.75 201.00 351.75
Johnson, Craig 4.75 214.00 1,016.50
Ross, Samuel 8.25 229.00 1,889.25
Sultan, Sara 10.50 173.00 1,816.50
Totals 25.25 5,074.00
Total Labor 5,074.00
Total this Task $5,074.00
Total this Phase $5,074.00
Phase 004 Council Sponsored Meetings and Materials
Task 01 Meeting Attendance
Professional Personnel
Hours Rate Amount
Caesar, Adrian 2.25 201.00 452.25
Johnson, Craig 3.00 214.00 642.00
Sultan, Sara 2.00 173.00 346.00
Totals 7.25 1,440.25
Total Labor 1,440.25

Please Reference Our Invoice Number on your Payment

Page 2



Project 863224-0007590.00  Rhode Island EERMC - 2024 Invoice 000000378840
Total this Task $1,440.25
Task 02 Develop Technical Materials
Professional Personnel
Hours Rate Amount
Caesar, Adrian 3.25 201.00 653.25
Johnson, Craig 11.75 214.00 2,514.50
Ross, Samuel 5.00 229.00 1,145.00
Sultan, Sara .50 173.00 86.50
Totals 20.50 4,399.25
Total Labor 4,399.25
Total this Task $4,399.25
Task 03 Other Council Responsibilities
Professional Personnel
Hours Rate Amount
Johnson, Craig 2.50 214.00 535.00
Ross, Samuel 1.00 229.00 229.00
Totals 3.50 764.00
Total Labor 764.00
Consultants
RACHEL SHOLLY 1,286.50
Total Consultants 1,286.50 1,286.50
Total this Task $2,050.50
Total this Phase $7,890.00
Phase 005 Research, Analysis, and Other Council Su
Professional Personnel
Hours Rate Amount
Caesar, Adrian 2.25 201.00 452.25
Johnson, Craig 6.50 214.00 1,391.00
Ross, Samuel 1.50 229.00 343.50
Totals 10.25 2,186.75
Total Labor 2,186.75
Total this Phase $2,186.75
Phase 006 Administrative
Consultants
RACHEL SHOLLY 20.75
Total Consultants 20.75 20.75
Total this Phase $20.75
Phase 007 EERMC Intern
Please Reference Our Invoice Number on your Payment Page 3
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Reimbursable Expenses
Misc Reimbursable Expense
2/6/2024 THE UNIVERSITY OF RHODE  Subconsultant 3,250.00
ISLAND
Total Reimbursables 3,250.00 3,250.00
Total this Phase $3,250.00
Billing Limits Current Prior To-Date
Total Billings 49,818.25 47,166.50 96,984.75
Limit 817,025.00
Remaining 720,040.25
Total this Invoice $49,818.25
Billings To Date
Current Prior Total
Labor 37,901.25 38,966.25 76,867.50
Consultant 8,667.00 8,200.25 16,867.25
Expense 3,250.00 0.00 3,250.00
Totals 49,818.25 47,166.50 96,984.75

Please Reference Our Invoice Number on your Payment
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B|II|ng Backup Friday, March 15, 2024
NV5, Inc. Invoice 000000378840 Dated 3/14/2024 1:44:49 PM
Phase 001 EE Prg Planning & Implementation Oversig
Task 01 Council Representation
Professional Personnel

Hours Rate Amount
Caesar, Adrian 2/1/2024 1.50 201.00 301.50

February EE TWG meeting - IRA planning, 2024 TWG topics, PUC rulings
and compliance filing

Johnson, Craig 2/1/2024 1.50 214.00 321.00
EE TWG attendance
Johnson, Craig 2/13/2024 1.00 214.00 214.00
Bi-weekly check-in with RIE and OER.
Johnson, Craig 2/27/2024 1.50 214.00 321.00
Bi-weekly check-in call with RIE/OER.
Johnson, Craig 2/29/2024 1.75 214.00 374.50
EE TWG meeting attendance.
Ross, Samuel 2/27/2024 1.50 229.00 343.50
RIE/OER check in, prep re: same w/Craig
Ross, Samuel 2/29/2024 1.75 229.00 400.75
prep for, attend RI TWG
Totals 10.50 2,276.25
Total Labor 2,276.25
Total this Task $2,276.25
Task 02 Implementation Oversight and Plan Develo
Professional Personnel
Hours Rate Amount
Caesar, Adrian 2/2/2024 1.50 201.00 301.50

EE TWG debrief and next steps - cost of supply and benefit-cost analysis
methodology, IRA funding coordination, federal funding and SBC
balancing; 2024 C&I and Res data report template development and
instructional guide; C&I Sector Team coordination and follow-up updates
from January

Caesar, Adrian 2/7/2024 1.00 201.00 201.00
2024 C&I and Residential Data Report and instructional guide
development

Caesar, Adrian 2/8/2024 .25 201.00 50.25

RI C&l Lighting quarterly meeting prep/discussion - 2025 lighting
impacts, codes and standards updates, lighting measure opportunities,
EM&YV coordination
Caesar, Adrian 2/9/2024 1.50 201.00 301.50
Quarterly C&I Lighting call - data dashboard review, potential new
lighting measures, Codes & Standards impacts on lighting savings/impact
factors, 2025 EM&V studies for lighting AMLs; C&I EM&V call and C&I
Sector Team call agenda development
Caesar, Adrian 2/13/2024 1.00 201.00 201.00
RI C&I/Res/IES data report 2024 template development - formula
updates, linking to 2024 BCR models, chart reformatting; RI Energy 2023
Q4 Report review

Please Reference Our Invoice Number on your Payment
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Caesar, Adrian 2/14/2024 1.75 201.00 351.75
RI Energy 2023 Q4 Report comps to preliminary 2023 year-end data;
Monthly C&I EM&V call; 2024 Data Report template development -
program-level savings sheet updates, BC model measure mapping; EWG
2024 kickoff mtg. notes review

Caesar, Adrian 2/15/2024 3.00 201.00 603.00
RI data snapshot updates - RIE Q4 Report; EBCx , MBCx, and MA C&1
working group presentation/paper review; C&I sector team call prep and
notetaking/follow-ups

Caesar, Adrian 2/20/2024 2.00 201.00 402.00
Consultant Team working session - EWG strategy, updated 2024 data
report development, EERMC priorities revisions; Comprehensive Measure
Life review study SOW review and C-Team comments for Cadeo/RIE

Caesar, Adrian 2/22/2024 1.00 201.00 201.00
C-Team working session - updated 2024 C&I/Res and cross-sector data
report development

Caesar, Adrian 2/23/2024 .50 201.00 100.50
C-Team working session - sector data reporting template updates, cost of
supply analysis methodology

Caesar, Adrian 2/27/2024 2.25 201.00 452.25
C-Team working session - February EWG prep, RI Res/C&I 2024 data
reporting updates; February EWG meeting and breakout session;
RICE2022n087 updates site report review

Caesar, Adrian 2/29/2024 1.50 201.00 301.50
RI EE TWG mtg. materials review - PUC IRA calc requests, AESC updates
and results; follow-ups on Measure life review Phase II SOW - lighting
AML updates, C&I custom measure life calcs; EM&V study tracker review;
RICEYP22 custom site report review

Johnson, Craig 2/1/2024 2.00 214.00 428.00
Sector Team Work - Plan out schedule for year for res meetings. Plan out
schedule for one on one check-ins with Spencer, emails re: same.

Johnson, Craig 2/5/2024 1.50 214.00 321.00
2025 EE Plan - Begin developing first draft of Council priorities document.

Johnson, Craig 2/6/2024 2.50 214.00 535.00
2025 EE Plan - Continue work on first draft of Council priorities document.

Johnson, Craig 2/7/2024 2.00 214.00 428.00
2025 EE Plan - Continue work on developing first draft of Council
priorities document.

Johnson, Craig 2/8/2024 2.00 214.00 428.00
Monthly residential sector team call, associated meeting prep and debrief.
Continue work on first draft of Council priorities for 2025 Plan, discussion
with Sam re: same.

Johnson, Craig 2/9/2024 4.25 214.00 909.50
Council Priorities for 2025 Plan - Review Sam's comments and continue
work on first draft document. Working session with Sam to strategize on
priority organization. Continue work on document.

Johnson, Craig 2/12/2024 3.50 214.00 749.00
First Draft Council Priorities - finish drafting memo and send to OER.

Johnson, Craig 2/14/2024 .75 214.00 160.50
Res Sector Team - Review meeting notes from February sector team
meeting, highlight key follow-up items and distribute to meeting
attendees.

Johnson, Craig 2/15/2024 1.00 214.00 214.00
Review RIE Q4 Report.

Johnson, Craig 2/16/2024 1.50 214.00 321.00
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Council Priorities - Review notes from Councilors at meeting re: priorities
development. Coordinate and send request for additional feedback from
Councilors. Research on guidance and best practices for how savings and
program spending are booked by RIE.

Johnson, Craig 2/20/2024 1.25 214.00 267.50
Check-in with team on Council Priorities development and snapshot
updates. EWG - meeting with Margie and Emily Koo to prep for afternoon
discussion with RIE and GHHI. Meeting with RIE and GHHI to review and
discuss agenda for next week's EWG meeting.

Johnson, Craig 2/22/2024 1.50 214.00 321.00
Working session with internal team- discussed monthly data reports and
RIE IRA analysis. Equity Work Group - pre-EWG meeting prep with OER
and Acadia Center.

Johnson, Craig 2/26/2024 .75 214.00 160.50
Sector team - monthly check-in with Spencer, associated meeting prep.

Johnson, Craig 2/27/2024 2.25 214.00 481.50
Working session with Sam and Adrian, discussed rate and bill impact
discussion with RIE tomorrow, IRA analysis in prep for TWG on Thursday,
and prep for EWG meeting today. Prep for EWG meeting - review
materials.

Johnson, Craig 2/28/2024 2.25 214.00 481.50
Continue review of RIE IRA analysis and draft memo. Res Sector Team -
work on draft agenda for March meeting. Future of Rate and Bill Impacts
Analysis call w/ RIE, meeting prep.

Johnson, Craig 2/29/2024 .50 214.00 107.00
Finish initial review and comment on RIE IRA analysis and draft memo.

Ross, Samuel 2/2/2024 .75 229.00 171.75
team check in mtg re: work for next wk; EE TWG debrief with Adrian

Ross, Samuel 2/20/2024 1.00 229.00 229.00
debrief Council meeting, other activities from last week. Coord team
efforts this wk and prioritize areas for my direct review.

Ross, Samuel 2/21/2024 1.50 229.00 343.50
working sessions on various tasks, incl. educ next steps and cost of
supply analyisis; 1-on-1 project catch up with Craig

Ross, Samuel 2/23/2024 1.00 229.00 229.00
check in on status of various deliverables/workstreams; coord coverage
of Sara's work for her outage next wk

Ross, Samuel 2/28/2024 .75 229.00 171.75
check in w/team on data work, other ongoing tasks; prep for, attend
discussionon rate and bill impact analysis

Sultan, Sara 2/1/2024 4.00 173.00 692.00
Completed Elec BCR mapping for Res.
Created Gas BC model template for Res data report.
Begin working on gas BCR model mapping.

Sultan, Sara 2/2/2024 .50 173.00 86.50
Meeting with Adrian to discuss remaining data report template work.

Sultan, Sara 2/5/2024 1.50 173.00 259.50
Updated lookup tables in Res and data report.

Sultan, Sara 2/6/2024 4.00 173.00 692.00
Completed manual mapping for new measures in Res and C&I data
report.
Reviewed instructional guide for next steps.

Sultan, Sara 2/7/2024 4.00 173.00 692.00

Attended working session with Adrian for data report updating.
Begin updating program sheets and added new measures.
Completed C&I Gas program sheets.

Please Reference Our Invoice Number on your Payment
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Sultan, Sara 2/8/2024 4.00 173.00 692.00
Continued to work on updating program sheets and adding new
measures for C&I data reports. Completed most programs and begin
working on Res data reports.
Sultan, Sara 2/12/2024 3.50 173.00 605.50
Data report updates; adding new measures to program sheets.
Sultan, Sara 2/13/2024 4.00 173.00 692.00
Data report updates; continue adding new measures to program sheets,
updating formulas.
Sultan, Sara 2/14/2024 4.50 173.00 778.50
Working session for data report updates. Data report updates; adding
new measures to Res program sheets and comparing the final sum. Q4
Comparison and data snapshot update
Sultan, Sara 2/15/2024 4.75 173.00 821.75
Continue data report updates; adding new measures to program sheets
and comparing the final sum.
Completed both Res and C&I report templates. Updated template for
sankey figures in snapshot using Q4 data, crated sankey diagrams and
updated the snapshot.
Sultan, Sara 2/16/2024 .50 173.00 86.50
Extracted relevant updates from variety of RI newsletters and updates to
inform upcoming quarterly newsletter.
Sultan, Sara 2/19/2024 1.00 173.00 173.00
Reviewed instructional guide for next steps on updating data reports and
begin working on cross sector report.
Sultan, Sara 2/20/2024 3.50 173.00 605.50
Continued working on data reports update. Check-in with team on
Council Priorities development and snapshot updates.
Sultan, Sara 2/21/2024 4.50 173.00 778.50
Continued working on data reports update. RI-C check in
Sultan, Sara 2/22/2024 4.00 173.00 692.00
Completed cross sector data report update for 2024. Working session
with Adrian on cross sector workbook updates.
Sultan, Sara 2/23/2024 3.50 173.00 605.50
Updated Res and C&l data reports, linked charts and data to cross sector
report.
RI-C check in
Sultan, Sara 2/23/2024 1.00 173.00 173.00
Cost of supply analysis comments
Sultan, Sara 2/23/2024 .50 173.00 86.50
RI-C check in
Totals 105.00 20,137.50
Total Labor 20,137.50
Total this Task $23,181.25
Task 03 Education Initiatives
Professional Personnel
Hours Rate Amount
Caesar, Adrian 2/21/2024 .25 201.00 50.25
Consultant Team check-in - EERMC branding and communications,
climate awareness RFP status update
Johnson, Craig 2/1/2024 .50 214.00 107.00
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Review EdCom Materials. Discussion on Council's website update.

Johnson, Craig 2/7/2024 .25 214.00 53.50
Check-in with Rachel on EERMC rebrand efforts

Johnson, Craig 2/14/2024 .25 214.00 53.50
Check-in with Rachel on status of Advocacy's website updates for Council.

Johnson, Craig 2/21/2024 .50 214.00 107.00

Working session with Rachel and Sam to check-in on variety of education
related items, including vendor bids for EE and Climate Awareness
campaign RFP, Council rebranding, Education Committee meeting
coverage, and Council's Annual Report.

Sultan, Sara 2/21/2024 2.00 173.00 346.00
Attend EC4 meeting and write up summary for inclusion in Council
Newsletter.
Sultan, Sara 2/22/2024 3.00 173.00 519.00
Begin working on final writeup for newsletter from the compiled notes.
Sultan, Sara 2/23/2024 1.00 173.00 173.00
Completed newsletter writeup and sent out for review
Totals 7.75 1,409.25
Total Labor 1,409.25
Total this Task $5,725.25
Total this Phase $31,182.75
Phase 002 System Reliability Procurement
Task 02 Plan Development and Oversight
Professional Personnel
Hours Rate Amount
Johnson, Craig 2/15/2024 1.00 214.00 214.00
Review RIE slides and filing document for connected solutions SRP
investment proposal.
Totals 1.00 214.00
Total Labor 214.00
Total this Task $214.00
Total this Phase $214.00
Phase 003 Regulatory Proceedings
Task 02 Develop Technical Materials
Professional Personnel
Hours Rate Amount
Caesar, Adrian 2/20/2024 .50 201.00 100.50

Consultant Team working session -future of gas docket modeling analysis
and results review

Caesar, Adrian 2/22/2024 .50 201.00 100.50
Future of gas docket modeling results comments
Caesar, Adrian 2/27/2024 .25 201.00 50.25

Future of Gas Docket final results review and C-Team comments on
efficiency modeling

Please Reference Our Invoice Number on your Payment
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Caesar, Adrian 2/28/2024 .50 201.00 100.50
C-Team working session - comments on E3 future of gas model results
presentation
Johnson, Craig 2/12/2024 1.00 214.00 214.00
Begin review of draft materials for Future of Gas Stakeholder meeting.
Johnson, Craig 2/13/2024 1.00 214.00 214.00
Continue review of draft materials for Future of Gas Stakeholder meeting
that was postponed.
Johnson, Craig 2/16/2024 .25 214.00 53.50
Demand Response Docket - coordinate with Council's legal team to
ensure proper paperwork is filed with PUC to ensure Council may
participate as a party in the docket.
Johnson, Craig 2/20/2024 .50 214.00 107.00
Check-in with team on Future of Gas materials review and coordinate
next steps. Discussed coverage/upcoming meeting dates. Communicated
team availability to docket facilitator.
Johnson, Craig 2/22/2024 .50 214.00 107.00
Future of Gas - Continue review of technical analysis draft results deck.
Johnson, Craig 2/23/2024 1.00 214.00 214.00
Future of Gas - continue review and work on putting together list of
comments for technical analysis draft results deck.
Johnson, Craig 2/26/2024 .25 214.00 53.50
Quick check-in with Sam on review of Future of Gas technical results
review and comments.
Johnson, Craig 2/29/2024 .25 214.00 53.50
Final discussion with Sam re: feedback on FoG technical analysis draft
results.
Ross, Samuel 2/22/2024 .25 229.00 57.25
begin detailed review of FoG Draft Results
Ross, Samuel 2/26/2024 .50 229.00 114.50
check in on future of gas
Ross, Samuel 2/28/2024 5.50 229.00 1,259.50
extended detailed review and comments of draft FoG results, initial draft
of priority comments; listen in in E3 presentation on gas
decommissioning in CA for context of how similar results may be
presented
Ross, Samuel 2/29/2024 2.00 229.00 458.00
review, clean up comments, revised and final corresp and key comments
sent to E3 and team re: FoG draft results
Sultan, Sara 2/2/2024 4.50 173.00 778.50
Meeting with team to discuss action items for review of future of gas
documents. Future of gas input assumptions review.
Sultan, Sara 2/5/2024 1.50 173.00 259.50
Reviewed Future of Gas input compendium.
Sultan, Sara 2/19/2024 4.00 173.00 692.00
Continue review on future of gas materials
Sultan, Sara 2/20/2024 .50 173.00 86.50
Check-in with team on future of gas docket modeling analysis and results
review
Totals 25.25 5,074.00
Total Labor 5,074.00
Total this Task $5,074.00
Total this Phase $5,074.00
Please Reference Our Invoice Number on your Payment Page 10
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Phase 004 Council Sponsored Meetings and Materials
Task 01 Meeting Attendance
Professional Personnel
Hours Rate Amount
Caesar, Adrian 2/15/2024 2.25 201.00 452.25
February EERMC meeting
Johnson, Craig 2/2/2024 1.00 214.00 214.00
Attend EERMC Education Committee meeting
Johnson, Craig 2/15/2024 2.00 214.00 428.00
February Council meeting.
Sultan, Sara 2/15/2024 2.00 173.00 346.00
February EERMC meeting
Totals 7.25 1,440.25
Total Labor 1,440.25
Total this Task $1,440.25
Task 02 Develop Technical Materials
Professional Personnel
Hours Rate Amount
Caesar, Adrian 2/5/2024 .50 201.00 100.50
February EERMC mtg. materials development - updated EERMC 2024
calendar
Caesar, Adrian 2/6/2024 .50 201.00 100.50
February EERMC mtg. materials development - status check in, EERMC
calendar, 2025 EERMC priorities, Monthly data snapshot
Caesar, Adrian 2/8/2024 1.50 201.00 301.50
February EERMC mtg. materials finalization - EERMC 2024 calendar,
monthly data snapshot presentation, EERMC 2025 priorities
Caesar, Adrian 2/14/2024 .25 201.00 50.25
February EERMC mtg. prep - updated Council website, Monthly data
snapshot updates
Caesar, Adrian 2/15/2024 .25 201.00 50.25
Data snapshot PDF export development
Caesar, Adrian 2/21/2024 .25 201.00 50.25
EERMC monthly data snapshot feedback review and updated word/excel
template development
Johnson, Craig 2/2/2024 1.50 214.00 321.00
February Council Materials - Review draft February agenda, begin
working on material development assignments. Begin work on Council
priorities document.
Johnson, Craig 2/7/2024 2.50 214.00 535.00
February Materials - Review updated slides for Data Snapshot
Walkthrough and EERMC Calendar, provide feedback to Adrian.
Developed draft of briefing memo for Council meeting.
Johnson, Craig 2/8/2024 2.75 214.00 588.50

February Council Materials - Check-in with team on timeline for
deliverables. Review and finalize data snapshot, Council re-brand, C-
Team SOW, EERMC Calendar Update, and Briefing Memo materials.
Review supplemental materials for posting. Discussion with Sam re:
Council priorities presentation materials.
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Johnson, Craig 2/9/2024 4.75 214.00 1,016.50
February Council Materials - Work on drafting slides for first draft of
council priorities presentation. Review and discuss with Sam. Finalize
materials.

Johnson, Craig 2/14/2024 .25 214.00 53.50
February Council Meeting - Check-in with internal team to discuss
presentation roles.

Ross, Samuel 2/1/2024 .25 229.00 57.25
cont. coord for Council materials

Ross, Samuel 2/2/2024 .25 229.00 57.25
cont. coord for Council materials

Ross, Samuel 2/6/2024 .50 229.00 114.50
coord plan for Council materials this wk

Ross, Samuel 2/8/2024 1.50 229.00 343.50

review initial edits, responses from Craig on Council prioriites; review and
affirm plan for finalization of other materials
Ross, Samuel 2/9/2024 2.50 229.00 572.50
collaborative review & edits on Council prioriites approach, materials
finalization Plan w/Craig

Sultan, Sara 2/14/2024 .50 173.00 86.50
Discussion with team on council meeting presentation roles.
Totals 20.50 4,399.25
Total Labor 4,399.25
Total this Task $4,399.25
Task 03 Other Council Responsibilities
Professional Personnel
Hours Rate Amount
Johnson, Craig 2/7/2024 .25 214.00 53.50
Check-in with Rachel on EERMC Annual Report development
Johnson, Craig 2/16/2024 .50 214.00 107.00

EE Implementation RFP - Review notes from Councilors at meeting re:
selection of councilors for scoring advisors, draft up important questions
to answer to help Councilors determine if they'd like to participate, and
coordinate with Steve re: same.
Johnson, Craig 2/20/2024 1.25 214.00 267.50
EE Administrator RFP - check-in with Sam on outcomes from Council
meeting, review Steve responses to questions for Councilors, coordinate
check-in with OER. Begin drafting e-mail to Councilors. Meeting with OER
re: same.
Johnson, Craig 2/22/2024 .50 214.00 107.00
EERMC Annual Report - check-in meeting with RIE and OER to discuss
roles and timelines.

Ross, Samuel 2/20/2024 1.00 229.00 229.00
prep for, attend mtg w/Steve re: RI EE RFP next steps for EERMC
Totals 3.50 764.00
Total Labor 764.00
Total this Task $2,050.50
Total this Phase $7,890.00
Phase 005 Research, Analysis, and Other Council Su
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Professional Personnel
Hours Rate Amount
Caesar, Adrian 2/28/2024 2.25 201.00 452.25
EC4 Advisory Board meeting - future of gas docket discussion, legislative
updates; review and summary of 2024 Building Decarb Act
Johnson, Craig 2/5/2024 .50 214.00 107.00
Review e-mail from Councilor Case re: EE TWG meeting, draft and send
summary, discussion with Sam re: same.
Johnson, Craig 2/8/2024 1.50 214.00 321.00
Councilor briefing and check-ins with Bob Izzo and Harry Oakley.
Johnson, Craig 2/9/2024 .50 214.00 107.00
Councilor briefing check-in with Harry Oakley to discuss proposed C-Team
SOW.
Johnson, Craig 2/12/2024 .25 214.00 53.50
Councilor briefing - coordinate check-in meetings with Councilors Case,
AnderBois, De La Cruz, and Oakley.
Johnson, Craig 2/14/2024 2.25 214.00 481.50
Councilor briefing meetings with Councilor AnderBois, Case, and De La
Cruz. Associated meeting prep.
Johnson, Craig 2/15/2024 1.25 214.00 267.50
Pre-Council meeting prep with Councilor Oakley
Johnson, Craig 2/29/2024 .25 214.00 53.50
Review OER draft responses to Legal Services RFP questions, emails re:
same.
Ross, Samuel 2/8/2024 1.50 229.00 343.50
C-Team Chck in's with Bob and Harry (separate)
Totals 10.25 2,186.75
Total Labor 2,186.75
Total this Phase $2,186.75
Phase 006 Administrative
Total this Phase $20.75
Phase 007 EERMC Intern
Total this Phase $3,250.00
Total this Project $49,818.25
Total this Report $49,818.25
Please Reference Our Invoice Number on your Payment Page 13



EcoMetric Consulting, LLC
41 Leopard Road, Suite 104

paoh P 19501 INVOICE

610.400.8600
ECOMETRIC admin@ecometricconsulting.com

BILLED TO TOTAL DUE

Sam Ross

optme Enery- s $2,163.00

10600 Route 116, Suite 3
Hinesburg, VT 05461

Project Name RI EERMC Consultant Invoice Date 03/11/2024
Project # 7525 Due Date 04/10/2024
Invoice # 1029-P2-24 Payment Terms Net 30
Billing Period 01/27/2024 - 02/29/2024
“rasinumber | pescripton | Amount_|
001-02 Implementation Oversight & Plan Development $2,163.00
Subtotal $2,163.00
Invoice Total $2,163.00

Budget Summary

Task Number Budget Previous Billings Total Spent

Task 001-02 $150,000.00 $42,117.50 $44,280.50 $105,719.50

TBD TBD $0.00 $0.00

Contract Balance $105,719.50




Invoice Number

1029-P2-24

Period 01/27/2024 - 02/29/2024
Project Person Title Month Hours Rate Amount
RI EERMC Consultant  Implementation Oversight & Plan D Salil Gogte Partner 2024-02 0 $220.00 $ =
RI EERMC Consultant  Implementation Oversight & Plan D Michael Frischmann Partner 2024-02 0 $220.00 $ -
RI EERMC Consultant  Implementation Oversight & Plan D Michael Honeychuck  Managing Consultant 2024-02 6.5 $206.00 $ 1,339.00
RI EERMC Consultant  Implementation Oversight & Plan D Bitul Sinha Managing Consultant 2024-02 4 $206.00 $ 824.00
RI EERMC Consultant  Implementation Oversight & Plan D Cory Read Data Scientist 2024-02 0 $206.00 $ =
RI EERMC Consultant  Implementation Oversight & Plan D Jake Fuller Managing Consultant 2024-02 0 $206.00 $ -
RI EERMC Consultant  Implementation Oversight & Plan D Mary George Sr Engineer 2024-02 0 $166.00 $ =
RI EERMC Consultant  Implementation Oversight & Plan D Kyle McKenna Managing Consultant 2024-02 0 $206.00 $ -
Total 10.50 $ 2,163.00
Project Person Title Month Hours Rate Amount
RI EERMC Consultant 0 Salil Gogte Partner 2024-02 0 $220.00 $ =
RI EERMC Consultant 0 Michael Frischmann Partner 2024-02 0 $220.00 $ -
RI EERMC Consultant O Michael Honeychuck  Managing Consultant 2024-02 0 $206.00 $ =
RI EERMC Consultant 0 Bitul Sinha Managing Consultant 2024-02 0 $206.00 $ -
RI EERMC Consultant 0 2024-02 0 $ -
$

Total



fname local_date hours task notes

Bitul Sinha 2/20/2024 4 Implementation Oversigh Measure Life study workplan review
Michael Hol 1/31/2024 1 Implementation Oversigh Invoice & discussions

Michael Ho 2/1/2024 0.5 Implementation Oversigh Emails

Michael Ho 2/5/2024 0.5 Implementation Oversigh Invoice & discussions

Michael Ho 2/9/2024 1.5 Implementation Oversigh Quarterly C&I lighting meeting & prep




Ralph Prahl
7001 Stanhope Place, University Park FL 34201

INVOICE
TO : Optimal Energy Inc. Invoice Number: 48
10600 Route 116, Suite 3 Invoice Date: March 1, 2024
Hinesburg, VT 05461 OEI Project #: 7590

Work Performed for RI Energy Efficiency & Resource Management Council

Description of Services Amount

Services Performed 2/01/24 through 2/29/24

Hours Hourly Rate Amount Due
LABOR - Regular Hours 3.25 $212.00 $689.00
LABOR - Travel Hours 0.00 $106.00 $0.00
Travel Expenses $0.00

(See attached travel expense form for details.)

TOTAL DUE $689.00




Ralph Prahl
Services Performed 2/01/24 through 2/29/24

001 - EE Program Planning & Implementation

001-02 005-00
001-01 Implementation 001-03 Research, Sub-Total | Sub-Total

Council Oversight & Plan Education Analysis & other| 006-00 Regular Travel Total

Date Description of Services Representation | Development Initiatives Council Support| Administrative | Travel Time Hrs. Hrs. Hours
2/7/2024|C&I ltg issue from Dan M 0.25 0.25 0.00 0.00
2/8/2024|C&I lighting issues 0.50 0.50 0.00 0.25
2/9/2024|C&1 ltg call; C&I mtg prep 0.75 0.75 0.00 0.50
2/14/2024|C&l studies call; measure life study 0.75 0.75 0.00 0.75
2/20/2024|measure life study 0.50 0.50 0.00 0.75
2/21/2024|measure life study 0.25 0.25 0.00 0.50
2/28/2024|custom electric impact, standards study 0.25 0.00 0.00 0.25
0.00 0.00 0.00
Total Hours 0.00 3.25 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 3.25 0.00 3.25
Total Amount $0.00 $689.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $689.00 0.00 | $689.00




Make Payable to: Jennifer Chiodo
JLC Consulting

52 Bent Creek Road

Hinesburg, VT 05416

INVOICE
TO : Optimal Energy Inc. Invoice Number: R-24.02
10600 Route 116, Suite 3 Invoice Date:  February 29, 2024
Hinesburg, VT 05461 OEl Project #: 7590

Work Performed for RI Energy Efficiency & Resource Management Council

Description of Services Amount

Services Performed 02/01/24 through 02/29/24

Hours Hourly Rate Amount Due
LABOR - Regular Hours 2.50 $206.00 $515.00
LABOR - Travel Hours 0.00 $103.00 $0.00
Travel Expenses $0.00

(See attached travel expense form for details.)

TOTAL DUE $515.00




Make Payable to: Jennifer Chiodo

Services Performed 02/01/24 through 02/29/24

001 - EE Program Planning & Implementation

001-02 005-00
001-01 Implementation 001-03 Research, Sub-Total | Sub-Total

Council Oversight & Plan Education Analysis & other, 006-00 Regular Travel Total

Date Description of Services Representation | Development Initiatives Council Support| Administrative | Travel Time Hrs. Hrs. Hours
2/12/24 |Compile and provide CIWG and EBCx materials for RIE review 1.00 1.00 0.00 1.00
2/14/2024|R1 C&I check in call prep and call 1.50 1.50 0.00 1.50
0.00 0.00 0.00
0.00 0.00 0.00
0.00 0.00 0.00
Total Hours 0.00 2.50 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 2.50 0.00 2.50
Total Amount $0.00 $515.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $515.00 0.00 | $515.00




GDR Consulting
576 Rutland St
Carlisle MA 01741

INVOICE
TO : Optimal Energy Inc. Invoice Number: 2R
10600 Route 116, Suite 3 Invoice Date: March 5, 2024
Hinesburg, VT 05461 OEI Project #: 7590

Work Performed for Rl Energy Efficiency & Resource Management Council

Description of Services Amount

Services Performed 2/1/24 through 2/29/24

Hours Hourly Rate Amount Due
LABOR - Regular Hours 3.75 $212.00 $795.00
LABOR - Travel Hours 0.00 $106.00 $0.00
Travel Expenses $0.00

(See attached travel expense form for details.)

TOTAL DUE $795.00




GDR Consulting

Services Performed 2/1/24 through 2/29/24

001 - EE Program Planning & Implementation

001-02
Implementation
001-01 Oversight & 001-03 Sub-Total | Sub-Total
Council Plan Education 006-00 Regular Travel Total
Date Description of Services Representation | Development Initiatives Administrative | Travel Time Hrs. Hrs. Hours
Attend Quarterly NEEP Electrification meeting and follow up on
2/7/2024 |new CEE HP resources. Time split with CT, MA and internal
professional development 0.50 0.50 0.00 0.50
2/8/2024 |Attend monthly Residential and IE call w/RIE 1.00 1.00 0.00 1.00
9/20/2024 Review and comment on Measure life SOW. Review of BCR
model to assess level of program activity for listed measures 2.00 2.00 0.00 2.00
212312024 Review and distribute Boston Globe article on health issues from
improper maintenance of HPs. Follow up with external SMEs 0.25 0.25 0.00 0.25
0.00 0.00 0.00
Total Hours 0.00 3.75 0.00 0.00 0.00 3.75 0.00 3.75
Total Amount $0.00 $795.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $795.00 0.00 | $795.00




Rachel Sholly
48 Hudson Street, Providence, RI 02909

INVOICE
TO : Optimal Energy Inc. Invoice Number: 74
10600 Route 116, Suite 3 Invoice Date: March 5, 2024
Hinesburg, VT 05461 OEI Project #: 7590

Work Performed for Rl Energy Efficiency & Resource Management Council

Description of Services Amount

Services Performed 2/01/2024 through 2/29/2024

Hours Hourly Rate Amount Due
LABOR - Regular Hours 33.75 $166.00 $5,602.50
LABOR - Admin Hours 0.25 $83.00 $20.75
LABOR - Travel Hours 0.00 $83.00 $0.00
Travel Expenses $0.00

(See attached travel expense form for details.)

TOTAL DUE $5,623.25



Rachel Sholly

Services Performed 2/01/2024 through 2/29/2024

001 - EE Program Planning &
Implementation

004 - Council Sponsored Meetings & Materials

001-02 004-02 005-00
Implementation |~ _ 001-03 004-01 Develop 00403 1 Research, 006-00 Sub-Total | o Total | Sub-Total |  Total
Oversight & Education Meeting R Other Council . .. . Regular .
L Technical .. ..... _|Analysis & other| Administrative Travel Hrs.|Admin Hrs.| Hours
Plan Initiatives Attendance Materials Responsibilities Council Support Hrs.
Date Description of Services Development
02/01/24 |Website meeting w/Advocacy 0.25 0.25 0.00 0.00 0.25
EdComm mtg incl prep & follow-up; Finalized & sent URI
contract; Confirmed proposal review team; Expo mtg &
follow-up correspondence; Reviewed URI & RIBA
invoices, related correspondence; Council website launch
02/02/24 |planning 5.75 5.75 0.00 0.00 5.75
Researched & compiled vendor list for legal RFP; Sent
02/05/24 |annual report kick-off email 3.50 3.50 0.00 0.00 3.50
Updated annual report table of contents; Planning for
March EdComm mtg; Updated data snapshot template;
Reviewed Advocacy invoice & related correspondence;
02/06/24 |Updated annual report word doc template 3.00 2.25 5.25 0.00 0.00 5.25
C-team planning re: mtg materials, website, LEAD dates,
annual report; Correspondence re: Council agenda
planning, LEAD dates, website transfer; Reviewed &
suggested edits to vendor question responses; Drafted
02/07/24 |rebrand update slides 5.00 5.00 0.00 0.00 5.00
Finalized rebrand slides, sent to C-team; Created logo
02/08/24 |versions in vector format 1.00 1.00 0.00 0.00 1.00
02/09/24 |Energy Expo planning 0.50 0.50 0.00 0.00 0.50
C-team planning re: Council mtg prep; Council mtg
02/14/24 |presentation prep, related correspondence 3.25 3.25 0.00 0.00 3.25
02/15/24 |Council mtg presentation & attendance 1.00 1.00 0.00 0.00 1.00
Compiled & sent proposals & instructions to review team;
C-team planning re: edu activities; Sent data snapshot
02/21/24 |templates 1.75 1.75 0.00 0.00 1.75
Sent draft EdComm agenda; EAComm mtg prep; Annual
report planning call; Dropped off annual reports with OER
02/22/24 |for expo 1.00 2.00 3.00 0.00 0.00 3.00
Correspondence re: proposal review, website, expo,
events contract; Updated RFP timeline; Compiled & sent
EdComm agenda & materials; Correspondence re: LEAD
02/27/24 |session room reservation 2.00 0.25 2.00 0.00 0.25 2.25
02/29/24 |Drafted & sent EdComm mtg prep notes 1.50 1.50 0.00 0.00 1.50
Total Hours 0.00 26.00 0.00 0.00 7.75 0.00 0.25 33.75 0.00 0.25 34.00
Total Amount $0.00 $4,316.00 $0.00 $0.00 $1,286.50 $0.00 $20.75] $5,602.50 $0.00 $20.75| $5,623.25




Margie Lynch/Core Energy Insights, Inc.
4445 E. Hoback River Road, Jackson, WY 83001

INVOICE
TO : Optimal Energy Inc. Invoice Number: CEI RI 2-2024
10600 Route 116, Suite 3 Invoice Date: March 4, 2024
Hinesburg, VT 05461 OEI Project #: 7525

Work Performed for Rl Energy Efficiency & Resource Management Council

Description of Services Amount

Services Performed 02/01/24 through 02/29/24

Hours Hourly Rate Amount Due
LABOR - Regular Hours 5.25 $199.00 $1,044.75
LABOR - Travel Hours 0.00 $99.50 $0.00
Travel Expenses $0.00

(See attached travel expense form for details.)

TOTAL DUE $1,044.75



Margie Lynch/Core Energy Insights, Inc.

Services Performed 02/01/24 through 02/29/24

001 - EE Program Planning & Implementation

001-02
Implementation
001-01 Oversight & 001-03 Sub-Total | Sub-Total

Council Plan Education Regular Travel Total

Date Description of Services Representation | Development Initiatives Hrs. Hrs. Hours
2/8/24 |Participated in Res Sector Team meeting 1.00 0.00 0.00 0.00
2/20/24 JEquity Working Group prep meetings 1.75 1.00 0.00 1.00
2/22/2024|Continued Equity Work Group preps 1.00 1.75 0.00 1.75
2/27/2024|Participated in Equity Working Group meeting 1.50 1.00 0.00 1.00
1.50 0.00 1.50
5.25 0.00 5.25

Total Hours 0.00 5.25 0.00 5.25 0.00 5.25
Total Amount $0.00 $1,044.75 $0.00] $1,044.75 0.00 | $1,044.75




DESAUTEL BROWNING LAwW

EsT. 2015 - NEWPORT, RI

38 Bell A , Suite B
Newgo(rat\,“lfhozi/:r}:lilndu(l)gs40 I NVO I C E

Invoice # 288
Date: 04/10/2024
Due On: 05/10/2024

RI Energy Efficiency Resource Management Council

00001-RI Energy Efficiency Resource Management Council

Legal Counsel to EERMC.

Type Date Notes Quantity Rate Total
Service  03/01/2024 Attention to PIM filing. 040 $275.00 $110.00
Service  03/05/2024 Review recent docket filings for EE. 0.60 $275.00 $165.00
Service  03/06/2024 Drafting Documents: Reviewed and Summarized 0.50 $275.00 $137.50

Docket No. 24-06-EE Responses to PUC set 1
Service  03/07/2024 Attention to EE SRP docket filing. 040 $275.00 $110.00
Service  03/12/2024 Review new LCP Standards decision from PUC. 0.90 $275.00 $247.50
Attention to service list request.
Service  03/12/2024 24-06-EE Data Requests. 0.50 $275.00 $137.50
Service 03/13/2024 Data Requests, comments filed Docket 24-06-EE. 0.80 $275.00 $220.00
Service  03/14/2024 Attention to SRP filing. 0.20 $275.00 $55.00
Service  03/18/2024 Emails: EE docket re: Rl Energy filing. 0.40 $275.00 $110.00
Service  03/19/2024 Attention to materials for meeting. 0.30 $275.00 $82.50
Service  03/22/2024 Attention to filing for EE docket. 0.70 $275.00 $192.50
Service  03/26/2024 Attn to status and recent filing. 0.20 $275.00 $55.00
Service  03/26/2024 Attn to emails from client. RR Public Awareness 0.70 $275.00 $192.50
contract.
Service  03/26/2024 Physical filing of Samuel Ross testimony with RIPUC 220 $275.00 $605.00
Service  03/27/2024 RR of additional changes to PivotPath agreement from 0.40 $275.00 $110.00

Page 1 of 2



Invoice # 288 - 04/10/2024

client. Review and incorporate same into redlines.

Service  03/27/2024 Attention to Open Meeting. Contract review and emails 0.50 $275.00 $137.50
re: same.

Service  04/02/2024 Attention to filings in EE docket. 0.40 $275.00 $110.00

Service 04/03/2024 Review, revise RFP contract. Attention to EERMC 1.00 $275.00 $275.00

policy materials. Emails re: same.
Attention to SRP filings and intervention.

Service  04/04/2024 Drafting Documents: Draft motion to intervene for PUC 0.60 $275.00 $165.00
docket 23-47-EE

Service  04/04/2024 Attention to motion to intervene and SRP filings. 2.00 $275.00 $550.00

Service  04/09/2024 Attention to docket deadlines. Emails with C-Team re: 0.50 $275.00 $137.50

contract for PivotPoint.

Total $3,905.00
Detailed Statement of Account
Other Invoices

Invoice Number Due On Amount Due Payments Received Balance Due
294 05/30/2024 $2,117.50 $0.00 $2,117.50

Current Invoice
Invoice Number Due On Amount Due Payments Received Balance Due
288 05/10/2024 $3,905.00 $0.00 $3,905.00
Outstanding Balance $6,022.50
Total Amount Outstanding $6,022.50

Please make all amounts payable to: Desautel Browning Law

Please pay within 30 days.

Page 2 of 2



DESAUTEL BROWNING LAwW

EsT. 2015 - NEWPORT, RI

38 Bell A , Suite B
Newgo(rat\,“lfhozi/:r}:lilndu(l)gs40 I NVO I C E

Invoice # 294
Date: 04/30/2024
Due On: 05/30/2024

RI Energy Efficiency Resource Management Council

00001-RI Energy Efficiency Resource Management Council

Legal Counsel to EERMC.

Type Date Notes Quantity Rate Total
Service  04/09/2024 Emails: C-Team re: contract options. 0.40 $275.00 $110.00
Service  04/10/2024 Review updated By-Laws. Emails with C-Team. 0.70 $275.00 $192.50
Service  04/12/2024 Review of Documents: EE docket filings. Exec 0.50 $275.00 $137.50

Committee meeting materials.
Service  04/15/2024 Attn to status. 0.10 $275.00 $27.50
Service  04/15/2024 Review of Documents: Review of Division Set 2 0.30 $275.00 $82.50
24-06-EE
Service  04/16/2024 Review emails and materials for APRA request. Review 1.30 $275.00 $357.50

materials and state law.

Service  04/17/2024 Review and revise materials for APRA response. 1.00 $275.00 $275.00
Emails with C-Team re: legislation. Review same.

Service  04/18/2024 C-Team re: legislation. Review same, lobby 290 $275.00 $797.50
regulations, and reply.
Executive Committee meeting.

Service  04/25/2024 Attention to SRP deadline, confirming no testimony 0.50 $275.00 $137.50
being filed. Emails with C-Team re: same.

Total $2,117.50

Page 1 of 2



Invoice # 294 - 04/30/2024

Detailed Statement of Account

Other Invoices

Invoice Number Due On Amount Due Payments Received Balance Due

288 05/10/2024 $3,905.00 $0.00 $3,905.00

Current Invoice

Invoice Number Due On Amount Due Payments Received Balance Due
294 05/30/2024 $2,117.50 $0.00 $2,117.50
Outstanding Balance $6,022.50
Total Amount Outstanding $6,022.50

Please make all amounts payable to: Desautel Browning Law

Please pay within 30 days.

Page 2 of 2



INVOICE

PivotPath, LLC
930 New Hope Rd Ste 11-628
Lawrenceville, GA 30045

Rhode Island Energy Efficiency Council
Bill to

Rhode Island Energy Efficiency Council
c/o Steven Chybowski

RI Office of Energy Resources

One Capitol Hill

Providence, Rl 02908

Invoice details

Invoice no.: 1789

Terms: Net 30

Invoice date: 05/30/2024
Due date: 06/29/2024

Product or service

Market Research

Strategic Planning

elizabeth@pivotpathdigital.com
+1 (404) 391-3528

P

VOT-PATH

MARKETING STRATEGISTS AND CREATIVE STORYTELLERS.

Ship to
Rachel Sholly

Rhode Island Energy Efficiency Council

Description Qty Rate

Task 1: Literature Review: Gather 5 $150.00
information from existing studies,
reports, and publications relevant to the
project.; Identify best practices and
gaps in current outreach efforts. Existing
Outreach Assessment: Evaluate the
effectiveness of current (or previous)
outreach initiatives; Analyze strategies,
materials, and communication channels
used by OER for engagement; Identify
areas for improvement in existing
outreach efforts. (.75 hour)

Council Interviews: Schedule and
conduct interviews with Council
members to gather their insights and
perspectives; Understand the Council's
goals, challenges, and expectations
regarding outreach (4.25 hours)

Task 2: Strategic Objectives: Define clear 5 $150.00
and measurable goals for the outreach

campaign; Ensure objectives align with

the overall mission and vision of the EEC;

Prioritize objectives based on urgency,

importance, and impact. (1 hour)

Key Messages: Identify the target
audiences; Begin developing concise

Amount

$750.00

$750.00



Creative Services

Project Management

and compelling messages that resonate
with target audiences; Tailor messages to
address the specific needs and
concerns of different audience segments
based on the needs of the Council. (3
hours)

Alignment Workshop Conducting:
Organize and facilitate a workshop to
align stakeholders on strategic
objectives and key messages; Engage
participants in collaborative discussions
to refine objectives and messages; Use
interactive exercises to ensure
stakeholder buy-in and commitment;
Document workshop outcomes and
integrate feedback into the final strategy.
(1 hour)

Task 3: Campaign Conceptualization: 40 $195.00
Develop three distinct and impactful
campaign concepts tailored to the
Energy Efficiency Council's objectives;
Brainstorm creative ideas that resonate
with the target audience and effectively
communicate the benefits of energy
efficiency; Ensure concepts are aligned
with the organization's mission and
strategic goals; Create visual and
thematic elements that unify each
campaign across all platforms. (15)

Design: Ensure all designs adhere to
brand guidelines and maintain a
consistent look and feel; Develop
prototypes and mock-ups for review
and feedback for each campaign;
Incorporate feedback to refine and
finalize design elements. (10)

Campaign Concepting for the Energy
Efficiency Council Campaign Efforts:
Conduct research on successful energy
efficiency campaigns and identify best
practices (Utilizing insights in Task 1);
Utilize insights from the literature review,
supplemental research, and council
interviews to inform each campaign
concept; Create comprehensive plans
for each campaign, outlining key
messages, target audiences,
communication channels, and timelines.
(15 hours)

Project management for April & May 16 $125.00
2024: Four creative and strategic

continuity meetings, including debriefing

document and presentation for market

research (6 hours)

Alignment workshop design (5 hours)

Develop preliminary KPIs document:
Identify key performance indicators

$7,800.00

$2,000.00



(KPIs) for measuring outreach campaign
success; Outline KPIs with metrics for
engagement, reach, and impact; Ensure
KPIs are specific, measurable,
achievable, relevant, and time-bound
(SMART) (5 hours)

Total

Ways to pay
VisA @ DiscevER @ BANK P Payral | venmo

Note to customer

April and May 2024 services for the EEC awareness campaign
efforts

Pay invoice

$11,300.00



INVOICE 0 Optirrl.al

Federal Tax ID# 03-0351557 ENERGY
AN NW‘E COMPANY

Remit checks to: Remit ACH transfer to: Remit Wire Transfers to:
Optimal Energy, LLC ABA Routing Number 063100277 ABA Routing Number 026009593
PO Box 74008680 Account Number 898052466590 Account Number 898052466590
Chicago, IL 60674-8680 Email ACH/Wire remittance details to RemittanceNotifications@nv5.com Swift Code INTL. BOFAUS3N

April 11, 2024

) Project No: 863224-0007590.00
Steven Chybowski Invoice No: 000000382879
Rhode Island Office of Energy Resources
Professional Services from March 1, 2024to March 31,2024 _ _ _ _ _ _ _ _ _ _ _ _ _ _ _ ______
Phase _ _ _ _ | oo1_ _ EE Prg Planning & Implementation Oversig_ _ _ _ _ _ _ _ _ _ _ o - - -
Task 01 Council Representation
Professional Personnel
Hours Rate Amount
Johnson, Craig 4.25 214.00 909.50
Ross, Samuel 2.50 229.00 572.50
Sultan, Sara 1.75 173.00 302.75
Totals 8.50 1,784.75
Total Labor 1,784.75
Consultants
CORE ENERGY INSIGHTS INC. 298.50
Total Consultants 298.50 298.50
Total this Task $2,083.25
Task 02 Implementation Oversight and Plan Develo
Professional Personnel
Hours Rate Amount
Caesar, Adrian 39.00 201.00 7,839.00
Johnson, Craig 22.00 214.00 4,708.00
Ross, Samuel 4.00 229.00 916.00
Sultan, Sara 13.25 173.00 2,292.25
Totals 78.25 15,755.25
Total Labor 15,755.25
Consultants
GLENN REED DBA: GDR CONSULTING 1,113.00
JENNIFER L. CHIODO DBA: JLC CONSULTING 412.00
CORE ENERGY INSIGHTS INC. 547.25
ECOMETRIC CONSULTING, LLC 1,198.50
ENERGY FUTURES GROUP, INC. 583.00
RALPH PRAHL 1,166.00
Total Consultants 5,019.75 5,019.75
Total this Task $20,775.00

Please Reference Our Invoice Number on your Payment



Project 863224-0007590.00  Rhode Island EERMC - 2024 Invoice 000000382879
Task 03 Education Initiatives
Professional Personnel
Hours Rate Amount
Johnson, Craig 7.00 214.00 1,498.00
Sultan, Sara 13.50 173.00 2,335.50
Totals 20.50 3,833.50
Total Labor 3,833.50
Consultants
RACHEL SHOLLY 4,067.00
Total Consultants 4,067.00 4,067.00
Total this Task $7,900.50
Total this Phase $30,758.75
Phase 002 System Reliability Procurement
Task 01 Council Representation
Professional Personnel
Hours Rate Amount
Ross, Samuel 1.00 229.00 229.00
Totals 1.00 229.00
Total Labor 229.00
Total this Task $229.00
Task 02 Plan Development and Oversight
Professional Personnel
Hours Rate Amount
Johnson, Craig .25 214.00 53.50
Totals .25 53.50
Total Labor 53.50
Total this Task $53.50
Total this Phase $282.50
Phase 003 Regulatory Proceedings
Task 01 Council Representation
Professional Personnel
Hours Rate Amount
Ross, Samuel 6.00 229.00 1,374.00
Totals 6.00 1,374.00
Total Labor 1,374.00
Total this Task $1,374.00
Task 02 Develop Technical Materials
Professional Personnel
Hours Rate Amount
Johnson, Craig 1.50 214.00 321.00

Please Reference Our Invoice Number on your Payment

Page 2



Project 863224-0007590.00  Rhode Island EERMC - 2024 Invoice 000000382879
Ross, Samuel 3.50 229.00 801.50
Totals 5.00 1,122.50
Total Labor 1,122.50
Total this Task $1,122.50
Total this Phase $2,496.50
Phase 004 Council Sponsored Meeting_s ﬂwd_ MEte_riaf, _________________
Task 01 Meeting Attendance
Professional Personnel
Hours Rate Amount
Johnson, Craig 3.00 214.00 642.00
Ross, Samuel 2.00 229.00 458.00
Sultan, Sara 2.00 173.00 346.00
Totals 7.00 1,446.00
Total Labor 1,446.00
Total this Task $1,446.00
Task 02 Develop Technical Materials
Professional Personnel
Hours Rate Amount
Caesar, Adrian 12.75 201.00 2,562.75
Johnson, Craig 17.50 214.00 3,745.00
Persechini, Melissa .25 86.00 21.50
Ross, Samuel 13.25 229.00 3,034.25
Sultan, Sara 8.00 173.00 1,384.00
Totals 51.75 10,747.50
Total Labor 10,747.50
Total this Task $10,747.50
Task 03 Other Council Responsibilities
Consultants
RACHEL SHOLLY 207.50
Total Consultants 207.50 207.50
Total this Task $207.50
Total this Phase $12,401.00
Phase 005 Research, Analysis, and Other Council Su
Professional Personnel
Hours Rate Amount
Johnson, Craig 2.00 214.00 428.00
Ross, Samuel 3.50 229.00 801.50
Totals 5.50 1,229.50
Total Labor 1,229.50
Total this Phase $1,229.50
Phase 006 Administrative

Please Reference Our Invoice Number on your Payment

Page 3



Project 863224-0007590.00  Rhode Island EERMC - 2024 Invoice 000000382879
Professional Personnel
Hours Rate Amount
Johnson, Craig .50 86.00 43.00
Totals .50 43.00
Total Labor 43.00
Reimbursable Expenses
Misc Reimbursable Expense
3/27/2024 WP Engine 120.75
Total Reimbursables 120.75 120.75
Total this Phase $163.75
Phase 007 EERMC Intern
Additional Fees
Monthly Intern Fee March 2024 2,675.00
Total Additional Fees 2,675.00 2,675.00
Total this Phase $2,675.00
Billing Limits Current Prior To-Date
Total Billings 50,007.00 96,984.75 146,991.75
Limit 817,025.00
Remaining 670,033.25
Total this Invoice $50,007.00
Billings To Date
Current Prior Total
Labor 37,618.50 76,867.50 114,486.00
Consultant 9,592.75 16,867.25 26,460.00
Expense 120.75 3,250.00 3,370.75
Add-on 2,675.00 0.00 2,675.00
Totals 50,007.00 96,984.75 146,991.75

Please Reference Our Invoice Number on your Payment

Page 4



Project 863224-0007590.00  Rhode Island EERMC - 2024 Invoice 000000382879

B|II|ng Backup Thursday, April 11, 2024
NV5, Inc. Invoice 000000382879 Dated 4/11/2024 12:34:40 PM
Phase 001 EE Prg Planning & Implementation Oversig
Task 01 Council Representation
Professional Personnel
Hours Rate Amount
Johnson, Craig 3/12/2024 1.75 214.00 374.50
Bi-weekly check-in with RIE/OER, associated meeting prep with Sam.
Johnson, Craig 3/26/2024 1.00 214.00 214.00
Bi-weekly check-in meeting with RIE and OER
Johnson, Craig 3/27/2024 1.50 214.00 321.00
Attend EE EWG meeting.
Ross, Samuel 3/12/2024 .50 229.00 114.50
OER/RIE check in
Ross, Samuel 3/28/2024 2.00 229.00 458.00
prep for, attend, present at EE TWG
Sultan, Sara 3/28/2024 1.75 173.00 302.75
TWG meeting
Totals 8.50 1,784.75
Total Labor 1,784.75
Total this Task $2,083.25
Task 02 Implementation Oversight and Plan Develo
Professional Personnel
Hours Rate Amount
Caesar, Adrian 3/6/2024 .75 201.00 150.75
RI Appliance Strds. Gross SavingsSOW review/comments
Caesar, Adrian 3/7/2024 5.25 201.00 1,055.25

2024 data Res/IES/C&I reporting development - BC model-actual
measure mapping review, 2024 expected savings and spending
performance forecast development, program and sector data visualization
updates
Caesar, Adrian 3/8/2024 4.50 201.00 904.50
2024 data Res/IES/C&I reporting development - reclassified measure list
sorting, 2024 expected savings and spending performance forecast
development, program and sector data visualization updates, 2023 cost-
to-achieve calcs, C&I installed measures data QA/QC and RIE request;
RIE Q4 highlights review
Caesar, Adrian 3/11/2024 2.50 201.00 502.50
RI Energy PUC IRA response analysis; 2024 historical quarterly tracking
workbook and 2024 C&I/Res data report template updates; 2023 Q4
highlights and YE data review; gas vs. non gas equipment mapping
Caesar, Adrian 3/12/2024 2.00 201.00 402.00

2023 Q4 highlights and YE data review - historical quarterly tracking
savings/spending achievement updates
Caesar, Adrian 3/13/2024 3.00 201.00 603.00
Updated EM&V study tracker review; C&I EM&YV call prep and notetaking;
Q4 2023 C&I program data analysis - program level savings and spending
achievement, cost to achieve comps, lighting-non-lighting and gas-non
gas equipment savings distribution
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Caesar, Adrian 3/14/2024 2.50 201.00 502.50
Q4 2023 C&I program data analysis - measure category savings and
spending, top saving measures and actual achievement; March C&I
sector team meeting coordination/agenda planning; updated Measure
Life review SOW review and comments
Caesar, Adrian 3/18/2024 .50 201.00 100.50

March C&I sector team meeting coordination; Res/C&I program data
review - Feb 2024
Caesar, Adrian 3/19/2024 1.00 201.00 201.00
February Res/C&I program data report development and QA/QC
Caesar, Adrian 3/22/2024 2.75 201.00 552.75
March EERMC mtg. debrief - updates to quarterly data presentations and
data snapshots, EE TWG and FOG docket meetings and coverage; IES SF
impact evaluation SOW review and comments; C&I sector team agenda
development
Caesar, Adrian 3/25/2024 1.25 201.00 251.25
C&I Sector team call prep - MA PA 2022-2024 mid-term modifications to
C&I programs; 2024 Equity metrics and strategies review. C-Team
working session - planning for updates to RI data reporting into EEC
branding format.
Caesar, Adrian 3/26/2024 3.75 201.00 753.75
C& sector team call prep and follow-ups; RIE recommended equity
metrics and strategies review, recommendations for SBDI metrics and
community engagement; C&I data report measure mapping updates; C&I
data reporting check-in w/ RIE; EM&V study tracker review and Res
EM&V call agenda
Caesar, Adrian 3/27/2024 4.00 201.00 804.00
C-Team working session - RIE data reporting and tracking update with
iEnergy; Residential EM&V call/follow-ups; updated EM&V study tracker
review; March RI EWG meeting
Caesar, Adrian 3/28/2024 3.00 201.00 603.00
March RI EE Technical Working Group mtg. and materials review;
Historical program quarterly tracking workbook working session - EERMC
rebranding and formatting updates; RI appliance Gross savings
evaluation SOW discussion
Caesar, Adrian 3/29/2024 2.25 201.00 452.25
C-Team working session - EERMC rebranding and formatting updates for
data reporting tools, EE TWG and Future of Gas docket debrief; C&I data
report development - drill-down charts for sector/program-level sheets,
electric and gas measure mapping updates; RI Appliance standards gross
savings study - comments and follow-up with RIE
Johnson, Craig 3/1/2024 .25 214.00 53.50

Residential sector team - draft and distribute agenda for March sector
team meeting. Review materials.
Johnson, Craig 3/7/2024 1.50 214.00 321.00
Res Sector Team - Monthly sector team meeting and associated meeting
prep.
Johnson, Craig 3/8/2024 1.25 214.00 267.50
Sector Teams - Review and consolidate notes from March res sector team
meeting, distribute follow-up action items to sector team attendees, and
coordinate assignments with subcontractors. Council Priorities - Work on
second draft of priorities, discussion with Sam re: same. RIE IRA Analysis
- discussion with Sam re: draft memo comments, prep final comments to
send to Company
Johnson, Craig 3/11/2024 1.50 214.00 321.00
EE Plan Council Priorities - Work on second draft of priorities memo for
Council, email/coordinate review and next steps with Sam re: same. RIE
IRA Analysis - complete review, clean up comments, and send to RIE.

Please Reference Our Invoice Number on your Payment
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Johnson, Craig 3/13/2024 1.75 214.00
IRA Analysis - discussion with team on RIE IRA analysis. Council Priorities
for 2025 EE Plan - review Sam edits and redlines, work on responses to
and further iteration of second draft, discussions with Sam re: same.

Johnson, Craig 3/14/2024 6.00 214.00
Appliance Recycling SOW Review - Review Glenn comments and layer on
my own comments, prep document to send back to RIE. Q4/Year-End
Data review - review residential program data to inform content for
march council meeting presentation, develop analytical content.

Johnson, Craig 3/18/2024 1.50 214.00
EM&V - Review Ralph's comments on IESF Impact Evaluation SOW,
respond to open question. Res Sector Team - Coordinate w/ Spencer on
check-in meeting. Check-in with Margie and Emily Koo for advanced prep
on next weeks EWG meeting, email correspondence with GHHI re: same.

Johnson, Craig 3/20/2024 1.75 214.00
Attend IES Q1 Best Practices meeting. Monthly Data Snapshots - review
and work with Sara to finalize electric and gas february data snapshots.

Johnson, Craig 3/21/2024 2.75 214.00
Res Sector Data review - review December data to inform additional
talking points about drivers of major highlights from year-end report,
including IE program performance and HVAC performance.

Johnson, Craig 3/22/2024 .50 214.00
Data reporting and visualization - discussion with team on strategies for
improving readability of data presented to Councilors. IRA Analysis -
discussion about and coordination with RIE on underlying analysis.

Johnson, Craig 3/25/2024 1.25 214.00
Res Sector Team - Prep for and attend check-in call with Spencer -
review meeting notes from last meeting and begin drafting agenda and
materials for next res sector team meeting. Quarterly program tracking -
discussion with Kaeley and Adrian about reviewing existing reporting
infrastructure and updating templates.

Johnson, Craig 3/26/2024 .50 214.00
RIE IRA analysis - discussion with Sam about motivation for informal data
request to RIE, draft and send follow-up response to RIE. EWG - Review
materials distributed for upcoming EWG meeting, follow-up with Margie
and Emily Koo re: same.

Johnson, Craig 3/27/2024 1.00 214.00
Data Reporting - Discussion with Adrian re: updated data reporting
infrastructure from RIE and how that might impact our internal tracking
tools. Res Sector Team - Develop draft agenda and materials for April
sector team meeting, distribute to meeting attendees.

Johnson, Craig 3/29/2024 .50 214.00
Review data reporting updates with Adrian.

Ross, Samuel 3/8/2024 .75 229.00
Council priorities review & next steps

Ross, Samuel 3/11/2024 2.00 229.00
review, edit EERMC priorities memo

Ross, Samuel 3/22/2024 .75 229.00
EERMC debrief, discuss team plans for next week and transition mgmt.

Ross, Samuel 3/26/2024 .50 229.00
coord team assignments for wk

Sultan, Sara 3/13/2024 1.00 173.00
RI-C check in to discuss council materials and cost of supply

Sultan, Sara 3/19/2024 4.50 173.00
Completed Feb Res and C&I Data reports, Historical tracking workbook,
and sent to Adrian for review.

374.50

1,284.00

321.00

374.50

588.50

107.00

267.50

107.00

214.00

107.00

171.75

458.00

171.75

114.50

173.00

778.50
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Sultan, Sara 3/20/2024 6.50 173.00 1,124.50
Updated data snapshot and revised template for 2024
Created sankey diagrams and sent for review
Revised data reports and data snapshot
Recreated sankeys and added to snapshot
Used word template to create pdfs for snapshot
Sultan, Sara 3/26/2024 .50 173.00 86.50
RI-C check in
Sultan, Sara 3/29/2024 .75 173.00 129.75
RI-C check in
Totals 78.25 15,755.25
Total Labor 15,755.25
Total this Task $20,775.00
Task 03 Education Initiatives
Professional Personnel
Hours Rate Amount
Johnson, Craig 3/1/2024 .25 214.00 53.50
Review EdCom meeting agenda and materials
Johnson, Craig 3/4/2024 1.75 214.00 374.50
Council Website - call with OER, Advocacy, and state IT to discuss
website launch next steps. Follow-up call with Steve re: same. EE &
Climate Awareness Campaign RFP scoring committee meeting. Review
scores.
Johnson, Craig 3/8/2024 .50 214.00 107.00
EE & Climate Awareness Campaign - Review proposal scoring and
distribute thoughts and next steps re: scoring, interviews, and post
interview follow-ups. Follow-up with OER and URI on public events SOW,
budget, and contract.
Johnson, Craig 3/11/2024 1.50 214.00 321.00
EE & Climate Awareness Campaign RFP - Interviews with potential
vendors. Debrief call with scoring committee
Johnson, Craig 3/12/2024 .25 214.00 53.50
EE & Climate Awareness Campaign RFP - Review total scoring and cost
proposals.
Johnson, Craig 3/13/2024 .75 214.00 160.50
EERMC/URI Public Events Contract check-in call. Follow-up with Peter on
comments re: updated scope for URI.
Johnson, Craig 3/15/2024 .75 214.00 160.50
Review EE & Climate Awareness Campaign RFP vendor recommendation
memo, provide comments. Review updates and finalize memo.
Johnson, Craig 3/19/2024 .50 214.00 107.00
Council Newsletter - review latest draft and provide feedback to Sara.
Johnson, Craig 3/26/2024 .50 214.00 107.00
EE & Climate Awareness Campaign - Review draft contract terms with
selected vendor, provide feedback.
Johnson, Craig 3/27/2024 .25 214.00 53.50
Review latest redlines on EE and Climate Awareness Campaign RFP draft
contract language, emails with OER and Council legal team regarding
same.
Sultan, Sara 3/13/2024 1.50 173.00 259.50
Updated the Newsletter template.
Rewrote previously finalized news article to optimize length and wrote a
new article to be included.
Please Reference Our Invoice Number on your Payment Page 8
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Sultan, Sara 3/14/2024 4.50 173.00 778.50

Summarized FOG and TWG meeting to include in newsletter.
Wrote summary of climate pollution reduction grant.
Added the articles to the new template and formatted in canva.

Sultan, Sara 3/18/2024 4.50 173.00 778.50

Wrote EC4 listening session summary for newsletter.

Read priority climate action plan's draft submitted by EC4 and
summarized key information for newsletter. Formatted the page 5 and 6
to include key details.

Added a news article from Heat Pump technology news.

Finalized the Newsletter and sent for review

Sultan, Sara 3/20/2024 1.50 173.00 259.50
Revised the newsletter
Sultan, Sara 3/26/2024 .50 173.00 86.50
Read weekly newsletters and took notes.
Sultan, Sara 3/29/2024 1.00 173.00 173.00
Newsletter writing and formatting process guide
Totals 20.50 3,833.50
Total Labor 3,833.50
Total this Task $7,900.50
Total this Phase $30,758.75
Phase 002 System Reliability Procurement
Task 01 Council Representation
Professional Personnel
Hours Rate Amount
Ross, Samuel 3/20/2024 1.00 229.00 229.00
SRP TWG meeting
Totals 1.00 229.00
Total Labor 229.00
Total this Task $229.00
Task 02 Plan Development and Oversight
Professional Personnel
Hours Rate Amount
Johnson, Craig 3/8/2024 .25 214.00 53.50

Review notes/comments from Councilor De La Cruz and constituents re:
RIE DR proposal, emails with Sam re: same.

Totals .25 53.50
Total Labor 53.50
Total this Task $53.50
Total this Phase $282.50
Phase 003 Regulatory Proceedings
Task 01 Council Representation

Please Reference Our Invoice Number on your Payment Page 9



Project 863224-0007590.00  Rhode Island EERMC - 2024 Invoice 000000382879
Professional Personnel
Hours Rate Amount
Ross, Samuel 3/6/2024 1.50 229.00 343.50
“remote listening to final portion of FoG Stakeholder Committee Meeting
Ross, Samuel 3/21/2024 4.50 229.00 1,030.50
Future of Gas Stakeholder Committee meeting, prep and follow up re:
same
Totals 6.00 1,374.00
Total Labor 1,374.00
Total this Task $1,374.00
Task 02 Develop Technical Materials
Professional Personnel
Hours Rate Amount
Johnson, Craig 3/12/2024 .25 214.00 53.50
Review PUC Order on updated LCP Standards.
Johnson, Craig 3/13/2024 .25 214.00 53.50
Docket 24-06-EE - Begin drafting potential testimony to provide in docket.
Johnson, Craig 3/20/2024 .50 214.00 107.00
Review and comment on draft testimony in ConnectedSolutions docket,
develop exhibit list.
Johnson, Craig 3/21/2024 25 214.00 53.50
Docket 24-06-EE - Update exhibit list, prepare and distribute testimony
and exhibits to Marisa for filing.
Johnson, Craig 3/22/2024 .25 214.00 53.50
Docket 24-06-EE - Initial review of DPUC testimony.
Ross, Samuel 3/13/2024 1.50 229.00 343.50
review others' comments on FoG draft results
Ross, Samuel 3/20/2024 2.00 229.00 458.00
draft DR prefiled testimony
Totals 5.00 1,122.50
Total Labor 1,122.50
Total this Task $1,122.50
Total this Phase $2,496.50
Phase 004 Council Sponsored Meetings and Materials
Task 01 Meeting Attendance
Professional Personnel
Hours Rate Amount
Johnson, Craig 3/1/2024 1.00 214.00 214.00
Attend EERMC EdCom meeting
Johnson, Craig 3/21/2024 2.00 214.00 428.00
March Council meeting attendance
Ross, Samuel 3/21/2024 2.00 229.00 458.00
Attend, present at EERMC meeting
Sultan, Sara 3/21/2024 2.00 173.00 346.00
Please Reference Our Invoice Number on your Payment Page 10
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EEC march meeting
Totals 7.00
Total Labor

1,446.00

Total this Task

Task 02 Develop Technical Materials
Professional Personnel

Hours Rate

Caesar, Adrian 3/7/2024 .25 201.00
March EERMC mtg. prep - 2023 year-end review, Climate Awareness RFP
status updates, future of gas docket modeling results and comments

Caesar, Adrian 3/8/2024 2.25 201.00
March EERMC mtg. materials development - 2023 Q4/year-end data
review, 2024 data snapshot template development, Climate Awareness
RFP status updates, future of gas docket modeling results and comments,
EERMC priorities for 2025 Plan

Caesar, Adrian 3/12/2024 1.00 201.00
March EERMC mtg. materials development - 2023 Q4 presentation

Caesar, Adrian 3/13/2024 1.75 201.00
C-Team working session - March EERMC mtg. materials development -
2023 Q4 presentation, EERMC 2025 priorities, updated EERMC newsletter
and template, Dec/Feb program data snapshots, EdComm/climate
awareness updates

Caesar, Adrian 3/14/2024 3.25 201.00
C-Team working session - March EERMC mtg. materials development -
2023 Q4 presentation, EERMC 2025 priorities, updated EERMC newsletter
and template, Dec/Feb program data snapshots, Q2 2024 preview for
EERMC; 2023 Q4 results presentation; reformatting into updated EEC
templates

Caesar, Adrian 3/15/2024 2.50 201.00
C-Team working session - March EERMC mtg. materials
development/finalization - formatting updates, C-Team Q4 2023
presentation, 2024 EEC calendar presentation

Caesar, Adrian 3/19/2024 1.00 201.00
March EERMC mtg. materials development - EEC calendar slides, notes
for 2023 preliminary YE performance

Caesar, Adrian 3/20/2024 .75 201.00
March EERMC mtg. materials development - February Data snapshots, Q4
2023 performance presentation coordination with RIE

Johnson, Craig 3/7/2024 .25 214.00
March Meeting materials - review notes from call with Steve and Brett re:
likely topics for March and begin working on assignments to staff.

Johnson, Craig 3/8/2024 1.75 214.00
March Meeting materials - continue work on drafting assignments to
staff, update tracking resources, review and work on updating materials
to new Council templates. Discussion with team re: same. Review and
send comments back to OER on updated draft agenda.

Johnson, Craig 3/12/2024 .75 214.00
March Council Materials - Review updated agenda and discuss material
development with team. Send suggested edits for agenda items to Steve.

Johnson, Craig 3/13/2024 .75 214.00
March Meeting Materials - Check-in with team on material development.
Council Priorities document and slides - finish and publish document,
review initial set of slides.

Amount
50.25

452.25

201.00

351.75

653.25

502.50

201.00

150.75

53.50

374.50

160.50

160.50

1,446.00
$1,446.00
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Johnson, Craig 3/14/2024 4.25 214.00
March Council Meeting Materials - Check-in with team on status of
material development. Working session with Sam on Council priority slide
development. Update and finish slides for council priorities and Q4/Prelim
year-end report. Review and provide feedback on Annual Report, Electric
DR, and Future of Gas slides. Package up and deliver materials to OER.

Johnson, Craig 3/15/2024 1.75 214.00
March Council Meeting Materials - Work on and finalize Q4/Prelim year-
end presentation, discussion with Sam/Adrian re: same. Review and
incorporate RIE slides.

Johnson, Craig 3/19/2024 2.75 214.00
March Meeting Materials - Draft briefing memo. Draft Quarterly Preview
Memo. Review update to Calendar update.

Johnson, Craig 3/20/2024 3.00 214.00
March Meeting Materials - Review Sam comments on quarterly preview
memo. Review and update Council calendar update. Review and update
Q4 deck and quarterly preview memo. Review and finalize additional
materials, including newsletter, data snapshots, and testimony
documents. Discussions with team re: same.

Johnson, Craig 3/21/2024 1.50 214.00
March Meeting Prep - Working session with Sara to walk through talking
points on Q4 presentation. Work on talking points for Q4 presentation
and Council priorities.

Johnson, Craig 3/22/2024 .25 214.00
Coordinate with team on next couple months of meetings and likely
upcoming deliverables, including LEAD session agenda brainstorming.

Johnson, Craig 3/27/2024 .50 214.00
Prepare draft agenda and topics for upcoming April EEC and ExCom
meetings, Spring LEAD session, and May EEC meeting.

Persechini, Melissa 3/15/2024 .25 86.00
March EERMC mtg. materials devleopment - updated EEC calendar and
formatting

Ross, Samuel 3/8/2024 .50 229.00
Council agenda review, materials assignments

Ross, Samuel 3/12/2024 4.00 229.00
morning coord mtg for Council materials; develop DR presentation; finish
read through and edits to Council priorities deck

Ross, Samuel 3/13/2024 2.75 229.00
morning check in on materials progress; begin developing FoG deck

Ross, Samuel 3/14/2024 4.50 229.00
morning meeting re: next steps on Council materias; finish FoG deck;
address comments on DR deck and finalize; review comments deck with
Craig and finalize; address comments on FoG deck and finalize

Ross, Samuel 3/15/2024 .50 229.00
morning check in to confirm status and next steps on Council materials

Ross, Samuel 3/19/2024 .50 229.00
check in on status of remaining Council materials

Ross, Samuel 3/20/2024 .50 229.00
manage finalization of remaining supplemental council materials

Sultan, Sara 3/11/2024 2.00 173.00
Updated cross sector historical tracking workbook based on Q4 data.
Begin working on presentation.

Sultan, Sara 3/12/2024 2.50 173.00
Worked on developing presentation for council meeting

Sultan, Sara 3/12/2024 .50 173.00
RI-C team check-in to discuss council materials and meeting agenda

909.50

374.50

588.50

642.00

321.00

53.50

107.00

21.50

114.50

916.00

629.75

1,030.50

114.50

114.50

114.50

346.00

432.50

86.50
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Sultan, Sara 3/14/2024 .50 173.00 86.50
RI-C check in to discuss council materials
Sultan, Sara 3/20/2024 1.00 173.00 173.00
Council materials check-in meeting
Presentation review and prep
Sultan, Sara 3/21/2024 1.50 173.00 259.50
Check in with Craig for talking points and presentation dry run
Wrote transcript for presentation
Totals 51.75 10,747.50
Total Labor 10,747.50
Total this Task $10,747.50
Task 03 Other Council Responsibilities
Total this Task $207.50
RACHEL SHOLLY
Total this Phase $12,401.00
Phase 005 Research, Analysis, and Other Council Su
Professional Personnel
Hours Rate Amount
Johnson, Craig 3/7/2024 .25 214.00 53.50
Legal Services RFP - discussion with Steve re: responses to bidder
questions.
Johnson, Craig 3/12/2024 .50 214.00 107.00
Draft and send e-mail to Councilors individually to provide update on
need for scoring advisors for EE Admin RFP and need for scoring
committee members for EERMC Legal Services RFP.
Johnson, Craig 3/21/2024 .75 214.00 160.50
Pre-Council meeting prep with Councilor Oakley.
Johnson, Craig 3/27/2024 .50 214.00 107.00
EERMC Legal RFP - coordinate with Steve on selection, messaging, and
timeline for scoring committee.
Ross, Samuel 3/19/2024 1.50 229.00 343.50
C-team 2-on-1 meeting with Sue and Peter; continued discussion of FOG
with Peter
Ross, Samuel 3/21/2024 1.00 229.00 229.00
prep for EERMC meeting with Councilor Oakley
Ross, Samuel 3/27/2024 1.00 229.00 229.00
review and corresp w/Peter re: fugitive gas emissions
Totals 5.50 1,229.50
Total Labor 1,229.50
Total this Phase $1,229.50
Phase 006 Administrative
Professional Personnel
Hours Rate Amount
Johnson, Craig 3/27/2024 .50 86.00 43.00
Council Website - Discussion with Steve re: C-Team needs for updating
billing for Council Website.
Totals .50 43.00
Total Labor 43.00
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Total this Phase $163.75
Total this Project $47,332.00
Total this Report $47,332.00
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Energy Futures Group, Inc.
PO Box 587
Hinesburg, VT 05461

INVOICE
TO : Optimal Energy Inc. Invoice Number: 6245
10600 Route 116, Suite 3 Invoice Date: April 10, 2024
Hinesburg, VT 05461 OEI Project #: 7525

Work Performed for Rl Energy Efficiency & Resource Management Council

Description of Services Amount

Services Performed 3/1/2024 through 3/31/2024

Hours Hourly Rate Amount Due
LABOR - Regular Hours 2.75 $212.00 $583.00
LABOR - Travel Hours 0.00 $106.00 $0.00
Travel Expenses $0.00

(See attached travel expense form for details.)

TOTAL DUE $583.00




Enerqy Futures Group, Inc.

Services Performed 3/1/2024 through 3/31/2024

001 - EE Program Planning & Implementation

001-02
Implementation 005-00
001-01 Oversight & 001-03 Research, Sub-Total | Sub-Total
Council Plan Education Analysis & other 006-00 Regular Travel Total
Date Description of Services Representation | Development Initiatives Council Support| Administrative | Travel Time Hrs. Hrs. Hours
3/7/2024 Res sector meeting 1.00 0.00 0.00 0.00
3/8/2024 Appliance recycling RFP 0.25 1.00 0.00 1.00
3/26/2024 C&l sector meeting; follow-ups 1.25 0.25 0.00 0.25
3/27/2024 Res sector meeting email 0.25 1.25 0.00 1.25
0.00 0.00 0.00
0.00 0.00 0.00
0.00 0.00 0.00
Total Hours 0.00 2.75 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 2.75 0.00 2.75
Total Amount $0.00 $583.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00] $583.00 0.00 | $583.00




Margie Lynch/Core Energy Insights, Inc.
4445 E. Hoback River Road, Jackson, WY 83001

INVOICE
TO : Optimal Energy Inc. Invoice Number: CEI Rl 3-2024
10600 Route 116, Suite 3 Invoice Date: April 2, 2024
Hinesburg, VT 05461 OEI Project #: 7525

Work Performed for Rl Energy Efficiency & Resource Management Council

Description of Services Amount

Services Performed 03/01/24 through 03/31/24

Hours Hourly Rate Amount Due
LABOR - Regular Hours 4.25 $199.00 $845.75
LABOR - Travel Hours 0.00 $99.50 $0.00
Travel Expenses $0.00

(See attached travel expense form for details.)

TOTAL DUE $845.75




Margie Lynch/Core Energy Insights, Inc.

Services Performed 03/01/24 through 03/31/24

002 - System Reliability

001 - EE Program Planning & Implementation Procurement 003 - Regulatory Proceedings 004 - Council Sponsored Meetings & Materials
001-02 005-00
Implementation 002-02 003-02 004-02 Research,
001-01 Oversight & 001-03 002-01 Plan 003-01 Develop 004-01 Develop 004-03 Analysis & Sub-Total | Sub-Total
Council Plan Education Council Development & Council Technical Meeting Technical Other Council other Council 006-00 Regular Travel Total
Date Description of Services Representation | Development Initiatives Representation Oversight Representation Manuals Attendance Materials Responsibilities Support Administrative | Travel Time Hrs. Hrs. Hours
3/7/24 |Participated in Res Sector Team meeting 1.00 0.00 0.00 0.00
3/11/24 JReviewed Feb. Equity Working Group meeting notes 0.50 1.00 0.00 1.00
3/18/2024|EWG preps w/Stakeholder Koo 0.50 0.50 0.00 0.50
Prepared for and participated in EWG prep meeting w/RI Energy
3/20/2024 |staff 0.75 0.50 0.00 0.50
3/27/2024|Participated in Equity Working Group meeting 1.50 0.75 0.00 0.75
1.50 0.00 1.50
0.00 0.00 0.00
0.00 0.00 0.00
0.00 0.00 0.00
0.00 0.00 0.00
0.00 0.00 0.00
0.00 0.00 0.00
0.00 0.00 0.00
0.00 0.00 0.00
0.00 0.00 0.00
0.00 0.00 0.00
0.00 0.00 0.00
0.00 0.00 0.00
0.00 0.00 0.00
0.00 0.00 0.00
0.00 0.00 0.00
0.00 0.00 0.00
0.00 0.00 0.00
0.00 0.00 0.00
0.00 0.00 0.00
0.00 0.00 0.00
0.00 0.00 0.00
0.00 0.00 0.00
0.00 0.00 0.00
0.00 0.00 0.00
0.00 0.00 0.00
0.00 0.00 0.00
0.00 0.00 0.00
0.00 0.00 0.00
0.00 0.00 0.00
0.00 0.00 0.00
0.00 0.00 0.00
0.00 0.00 0.00
0.00 0.00 0.00
0.00 0.00 0.00
0.00 0.00 0.00
0.00 0.00 0.00
0.00 0.00 0.00
Total Hours 1.50 2,75 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 4.25 0.00 4.25
Total Amount $298.50 $547.25 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $845.75 0.00 $845.75
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Ralph Prahl
7001 Stanhope Place, University Park FL 34201

INVOICE
TO : Optimal Energy Inc. Invoice Number: 49
10600 Route 116, Suite 3 Invoice Date: April 1, 2024
Hinesburg, VT 05461 OEI Project #: 7590

Work Performed for Rl Energy Efficiency & Resource Management Council

Description of Services Amount

Services Performed 3/01/24 through 3/31/24

Hours Hourly Rate Amount Due
LABOR - Regular Hours 5.50 $212.00 $1,166.00
LABOR - Travel Hours 0.00 $106.00 $0.00
Travel Expenses $0.00

(See attached travel expense form for details.)

TOTAL DUE $1,166.00



Ralph Prahl
Services Performed 3/01/24 through 3/31/24

001 - EE Program Planning & Implementation

001-02 005-00
Implementation Research,
001-01 Oversight & 001-03 Analysis & Sub-Total
Council Plan Education other Council 006-00 Sub-Total Travel

Date Description of Services Representation | Development Initiatives Support Administrative | Travel Time |Regular Hrs. Hrs. | Total Hours
3/1/2024 standards study; custom electric study; measure life study 0.75 0.75 0.00 0.00
3/4/2024|standards study 0.25 0.25 0.00 0.75

appl recycling issue from Glenn; check-in call; measure life

3/13/2024|study 1.25 1.25 0.00 0.25
3/17/2024|LI impact eval 0.50 0.50 0.00 1.25
3/17/2024|LI impact eval 1.25 1.25 0.00 0.50
3/21/2024(1E impact eval 0.50 0.50 0.00 1.25
3/27/2024|check-in call 0.75 0.00 0.00 0.50
3/28/2024|appl standards study 0.25 0.75 0.00 0.75
0.25 0.00 0.25
0.00 0.00 0.00
0.00 0.00 0.00
0.00 0.00 0.00
Total Hours 0.00 5.50 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 5.50 0.00 5.50
Total Amount $0.00 $1,166.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00] $1,166.00 0.00 $1,166.00




Make Payable to: Jennifer Chiodo
JLC Consulting

52 Bent Creek Road

Hinesburg, VT 05416

INVOICE
TO : Optimal Energy Inc. Invoice Number: R-24.03
10600 Route 116, Suite 3 Invoice Date: March 31, 2024
Hinesburg, VT 05461 OEl project #: |GG

Work Performed for RI Energy Efficiency & Resource Management Council

Description of Services Amount

Services Performed 03/01/24 through 03/31/24

Hours Hourly Rate Amount Due
LABOR - Regular Hours 2.00 $206.00 $412.00
LABOR - Travel Hours 0.00 $103.00 $0.00
Travel Expenses $0.00

(See attached travel expense form for details.)

TOTAL DUE $412.00




Make Payable to: Jennifer Chiodo

Services Performed 03/01/24 through 03/31/24

\"Av | = =

Program
Planning &
001-02
Implementation
Oversight & | sub-Total |Sub-Total
Plan Regular Travel Total
Date Description of Services Development Hrs. Hrs. Hours
3/26/24 |RI sector call, review MTMs, and follow up 2.00 2.00 0.00 2.00
0.00 0.00 0.00
0.00 0.00 0.00
Total Hours 2.00 2.00 0.00 2.00
Total Amount $412.00 $412.00 0.00 $412.00




Rachel Sholly
48 Hudson Street, Providence, RI 02909

INVOICE
TO : Optimal Energy Inc. Invoice Number: 75
10600 Route 116, Suite 3 Invoice Date: April 2, 2024
Hinesburg, VT 05461 OEI Project #: 7590

Work Performed for Rl Energy Efficiency & Resource Management Council

Description of Services Amount

Services Performed 3/01/2024 through 3/31/2024

Hours Hourly Rate Amount Due
LABOR - Regular Hours 25.75 $166.00 $4,274.50
LABOR - Admin Hours 0.00 $83.00 $0.00
LABOR - Travel Hours 0.00 $83.00 $0.00
Travel Expenses $0.00

(See attached travel expense form for details.)

TOTAL DUE $4,274.50



Rachel Sholly

Services Performed 3/01/2024 through 3/31/2024

001 - EE Program Planning &
Implementation

004 - Council Sponsored Meetings & Materials

| I°°1'°t2t_ 001-03 004-01 004-02 004-03 R°05'00h Sub-Total
mpliementation - - - esearcn, ub-lota
gversight & Education Meeting Devel_op Other Council Analysis & 909-00 . Regular Sub-Total SUbjTOtal Total
. Technical e . Administrative Travel Hrs.|Admin Hrs.| Hours
Plan Initiatives Attendance Materials Responsibilities | other Council Hrs.
Date Description of Services Development Support
Reviewed proposals submitted for public awareness
03/03/24 |campaign RFP 2.00 2.00 0.00 0.00 2.00
Website call w/State IT; Compiled scores,
03/04/24 |correspondence re: proposal review 1.75 1.75 0.00 0.00 1.75
Correspondence re: proposal review; Worked on
branded templates; Call w/OER re: proposal review,
03/05/24 |related correspondence 2.75 2.75 0.00 0.00 2.75
Worked on branded templates; Drafted emails to
request vendor interviews; Finalized & shared template
docs w/C-team & OER; Correspondence re: energy
03/06/24 |expo, URI contract, vendor interviews 2.25 2.25 0.00 0.00 2.25
03/11/24 |Vendor interview coordination 0.25 0.25 0.00 0.00 0.25
Energy Expo planning & feedback; Compiled updated
proposal review team scores, related correspondence;
03/12/24 |Drafted annual report slides for council mtg 0.50 1.00 1.50 0.00 0.00 1.50
Calculated final review scores, related correspondence;
Public events SOW call w/URI, emailed notes & docs to
EdComm for feedback; Drafted & shared vendor
03/13/24 |recommendation memo 3.50 3.50 0.00 0.00 3.50
Correspondence re: edits to vendor recommendation
03/15/24 |[memo 0.25 0.25 0.00 0.00 0.25
Budget analysis for public events SOW, related
03/19/24 |correspondence 1.25 1.25 0.00 0.00 1.25
C-team planning re: Council mtg & edu activities; Energy
03/20/24 |expo planning; Correspondence w/OER re: edu activities 2.50 2.50 0.00 0.00 2.50
Council mtg prep attendance - annual report
presentation & vendor vote; Correspondence w/bidders,
03/21/24 |URI 1.00 0.25 1.25 0.00 0.00 1.25
Energy expo planning call; Informed bidders of vendor
selection; Correspondence w/C-team re: templates &
03/22/24 |brand consistency 1.50 1.50 0.00 0.00 1.50
03/25/24 |Drafted PivotPath contract & sent for internal review 1.25 1.25 0.00 0.00 1.25
Reviewed feedback & updated PivotPath contract;
03/26/24 |Energy Expo media promo coordination 1.00 1.00 0.00 0.00 1.00
Drafted EdComm agenda; Correspondence re:
03/27/24 |PivotPath contract, EdComm mtg coordination 1.50 1.50 0.00 0.00 1.50
Correspondence re: PivotPath contract, website launch,
new logo, annual report first draft, energy expo media
03/28/24 |coordination, public events 1.25 1.25 0.00 0.00 1.25
Total Hours 0.00 24.50 0.00 0.00 1.25 0.00 0.00 25.75 0.00 0.00 25.75
Total Amount $0.00 $4,067.00 $0.00 $0.00 $207.50 $0.00 $0.00] $4,274.50 $0.00 $0.00( $4,274.50




GDR Consulting
576 Rutland St
Carlisle MA 01741

INVOICE
TO : Optimal Energy Inc. Invoice Number: 3R
10600 Route 116, Suite 3 Invoice Date: April 3, 2024
Hinesburg, VT 05461 OEIl Project #: 7590

Work Performed for RI Energy Efficiency & Resource Management Council

Description of Services Amount

Services Performed 3/1/24 through 3/31/24

Hours Hourly Rate Amount Due
LABOR - Regular Hours 5.25 $212.00 $1,113.00
LABOR - Travel Hours 0.00 $106.00 $0.00
Travel Expenses $0.00

(See attached travel expense form for details.)

TOTAL DUE $1,113.00



GDR Consulting

Services Performed 3/1/24 through 3/31/24

001 - EE Program Planning & Implementation

001-02
Implementation 005-00
001-01 Oversight & 001-03 Research, Sub-Total
Council Plan Education Analysis & other 006-00 Regular | Sub-Total Total
Date Description of Services Representation | Development Initiatives Council Support| Administrative | Travel Time Hrs. |Travel Hrs. Hours
3/4/2024 |Review and comment on Standards gross savings SOW 0.25 0.25 0.00 0.25
3/8/2024 [Initial review and comments on RIE appliance BCR inputs 0.50 0.50 0.00 0.50
Initial review of appliance recycling SOW and questions to Ralph
3/12/2024 |Prahl 1.00 1.00 0.00 1.00
3/13/2024 |Complete review and comments of appliance recycling SOW 0.25 0.25 0.00 0.25
Review and comment on |IE-SF impact and process evaluation
3/20/2024 draft SOW 0.75 0.75 0.00 0.75
3/21/2024 Complete review and comment on IE-SF impact and process
evaluation draft SOW 0.75 0.75 0.00 0.75
3/27/2024 |Attend monthly RI EMV call, meeting prep 1.00 1.00 0.00 1.00
3/28/2024 |Follow up as to whether Standards Gross savings study is needed 0.75 0.75 0.00 075
Total Hours 0.00 5.25 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 5.25 0.00 5.25
Total Amount $0.00 $1,113.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00] $1,113.00 0.00 | $1,113.00




EcoMetric Consulting, LLC
41 Leopard Road, Suite 104

paoh P 19501 INVOICE

610.400.8600
ECOMETRIC admin@ecometricconsulting.com

BILLED TO TOTAL DUE

Sam Ross

optme Enery- s $1,198.50

10600 Route 116, Suite 3
Hinesburg, VT 05461

Project Name RI EERMC Consultant Invoice Date 04/06/2024
Project # 7525 Due Date 05/06/2024
Invoice # 1029-P3-24 Payment Terms Net 30
Billing Period 03/01/2024 - 03/31/2024
“rasinumber | pescripton | Amount |
001-02 Implementation Oversight & Plan Development $1,198.50
Subtotal $1,198.50
Invoice Total $1,198.50

Budget Summary

Task Number Budget Previous Billings Total Spent

Task 001-02 $150,000.00 $44,280.50 $45,479.00 $104,521.00

TBD TBD $0.00 $0.00

Contract Balance $104,521.00




Invoice Number

1029-P3-24

Period 03/01/2024 - 03/31/2024
Project Person Title Month Hours Rate Amount
RI EERMC Consultant Implementation Oversight & Plan D Salil Gogte Partner 2024-03 1 $220.00 $ 220.00
RI EERMC Consultant  Implementation Oversight & Plan D Michael Frischmann Partner 2024-03 0 $220.00 $ -
RI EERMC Consultant Implementation Oversight & Plan D Michael Honeychuck ~ Managing Consultant 2024-03 4.75 $206.00 $ 978.50
RI EERMC Consultant  Implementation Oversight & Plan D Bitul Sinha Managing Consultant 2024-03 0 $206.00 $ -
RI EERMC Consultant  Implementation Oversight & Plan D Cory Read Data Scientist 2024-03 0 $206.00 $ =
RI EERMC Consultant  Implementation Oversight & Plan D Jake Fuller Managing Consultant 2024-03 0 $206.00 $ -
RI EERMC Consultant Implementation Oversight & Plan D Mary George Sr Engineer 2024-03 0 $166.00 $ =
RI EERMC Consultant  Implementation Oversight & Plan D Kyle McKenna Managing Consultant 2024-03 0 $206.00 $ -
Total 5.75 $ 1,198.50
Project Person Title Month Hours Rate Amount
RI EERMC Consultant 0 Salil Gogte Partner 2024-03 0 $220.00 $ =
RI EERMC Consultant 0 Michael Frischmann Partner 2024-03 0 $220.00 $ -
RI EERMC Consultant 0 Michael Honeychuck  Managing Consultant 2024-03 0 $206.00 $ =
RI EERMC Consultant 0 Bitul Sinha Managing Consultant 2024-03 0 $206.00 $ -
RI EERMC Consultant 0 2024-03 0 $ -
$

Total



fname local_date hours task notes
RICE22N054 Evaluation Report review

Michael Hol e, L5 Implementation Oversigh Emails

Michael Hol 3/9/2024 0.5 Implementation Oversigh Invoice & emails

Michael Hol 3/13/2024 0.75 Implementation Oversigh Monthly C&| meeting with RIE & C-Team
Michael Ho 3/25/2024 0.5 Implementation Oversigh Invoice estimate

Michael Ho 3/27/2024 1 Implementation Oversigh Monthly residential call with RIE and C-Team




Xt WPEeNngine
DaR J

Billed From:

WP Engine, Inc.

504 Lavaca Street
Suite 1000

Austin TX 78701
United States

Tax ID #: 27-3155665

Invoice

Invoice #: INV06514890
Invoice Date: Mar 27, 2024
Account #: 729772 eermc
Account Name: eermc

Billed To:

Rhode Island EERMC

Steven Chybowski
30 Fisher Ave.
Warwick, Rl 02886
United States

Terms Due Date
On Receipt|Mar 27, 2024
Description Type Serv. Start Serv. End Qty Amount (USD)
Additional Site Service 3/27/2024 11/2/2024 1 $120.75
Total Charges: $120.75
Total Sales Tax: $0.00
Total Credits Applied: ($0.00)
Total Payments Received: ($120.75)
Balance Due: $0.00

Payment Instructions:

Payment must be made by credit card.
Updates to the credit card on your account may be
made by an account user with Owner or Billing

permissions at my.wpengine.com under the My
Account tab.

Invoice Aging Summary

For inquiries regarding this transaction, please email billing@wpengine.com.

Current Due 30 Days Past Due

60 Days Past Due

90 Days Past Due

120+ Days Past Due

Total Aging

$0.00 $0.00

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00




Accounting Office
Rhode Island College
600 Mount Pleasant Avenue, Bldg # 5
Providence Rl 02908
(401) 456-8076 / (401) 456-4659

Invoice
Group Invoice Number: E16699

Rachel Sholly Invoice Date: 5/16/2024
RI Office of Energy Resources Due Date: 6/15/2024
1 Capitol Hill, 4th floor Event Name: RI Energy 2024 Council Retreats
Providence, RI 02908 Reservation No.: 163945
USA Phone: 401-580-2901

Fax:

Event Type: Meeting

Bookings / Details

Customer Number: 672

Quantity

Price

Amount

Please include invoice number on all correspondence. Make checks payable to Rhode Island College. For online
credit card payments go to www.ric.edu/ARpayments. For Billing questions please use the phone/fax numbers above.

Monday, April 29, 2024

1:00 PM - 4:00 PM RI Energy 2024 Council Retreats (Confirmed) DDC Donovan Dining 201 - President's Dining

Room
Room Charge: ($30.00 per Half Day) 1 $30.00 $30.00
Less 66% Discount -$19.80
Dining Services Catering:
12:30 PM - 4:00 PM Delivery for 20
Coffee Regular (Gallon) (serves 15) 1 $20.00 $20.00
Bottled Water (8 oz) (serves 1) 15 $1.65 $24.75
Pepsi Cola 120z. (serves 1) 4 $1.65 $6.60
Diet Pepsi 12 oz. (serves 1) 3 $1.65 $4.95
Schweppes Ginger Ale 12 oz. (serves 1) 3 $1.65 $4.95
Finger Sandwich Assortment Il (serves 30) 1 $60.00 $60.00
Vegetable Platter -w- Ranch Dressing (serves 10) 1 $30.00 $30.00
Party Size Cookies House, Assorted (serves 12) 2 $12.00 $24.00
Additional items not available in Catering Guide 1
Vegetarian Delight Wrap (serves 1) 3 $7.50 $22.50
AV Equipment:
Podium/Screen/AV Cart access 1
USS Staff:
12:30 PM - 4:00 PM Academic Space Support
Event Tech Check For Presenters(3.5 hours @ $0.00/hr) 1
AV Equipment $0.00
Dining Services Catering $197.75
Room Charge $10.20
USS Staff $0.00
Subtotal $207.95

5/21/2024 3:11 PM SF

Page 1 of 2



Accounting Office Invoice Number: E16699

Bookings / Details Quantity Price Amount
Grand Total $207.95

Payment Terms: Net 30

5/21/2024 3:11 PM SF Page 2 of 2



INVOICE 0 Optirrl.al

Federal Tax ID# 03-0351557 ENERGY

AN NW‘E COMPANY

Remit checks to: Remit ACH transfer to: Remit Wire Transfers to:
Optimal Energy, LLC ABA Routing Number 063100277 ABA Routing Number 026009593
PO_ Box 74008680 Account Number 898052466590 Account Number 898052466590
Chicago, IL 60674-8680 Email ACH/Wire remittance details to RemittanceNotifications@nv5.com Swift Code INTL. BOFAUS3N
May 16, 2024
) Project No: 863224-0007590.00
Steven Chybowski Tnvoice No: 000000388329
Rhode Island Office of Energy Resources
Professional Services from April 1, 2024 to April 30, 2024
Phase 001 EE Prg Planning & Implementation Oversig
Task 01 Council Representation
Professional Personnel
Hours Rate Amount
Johnson, Craig 1.00 214.00 214.00
Totals 1.00 214.00
Total Labor 214.00
Consultants
CORE ENERGY INSIGHTS INC. 547.25
Total Consultants 547.25 547.25
Total this Task $761.25
Task 02 Implementation Oversight and Plan Develo
Professional Personnel
Hours Rate Amount
Caesar, Adrian 30.25 201.00 6,080.25
Johnson, Craig 13.50 214.00 2,889.00
Ross, Samuel 4.50 229.00 1,030.50
Totals 48.25 9,999.75
Total Labor 9,999.75
Consultants
GLENN REED DBA: GDR CONSULTING 424.00
JENNIFER L. CHIODO DBA: JLC CONSULTING 309.00
CORE ENERGY INSIGHTS INC. 248.75
ECOMETRIC CONSULTING, LLC 838.00
ENERGY FUTURES GROUP, INC. 636.00
RALPH PRAHL 636.00
Total Consultants 3,091.75 3,091.75
Total this Task $13,091.50

Task 03 Education Initiatives

Please Reference Our Invoice Number on your Payment



Project 863224-0007590.00  Rhode Island EERMC - 2024 Invoice 000000388329
Professional Personnel
Hours Rate Amount
Johnson, Craig 5.25 214.00 1,123.50
Ross, Samuel .50 229.00 114.50
Totals 5.75 1,238.00
Total Labor 1,238.00
Consultants
RACHEL SHOLLY 4,772.50
Total Consultants 4,772.50 4,772.50
Total this Task $6,010.50
Total this Phase $19,863.25
Phase 002 System Reliability Procurement
Task 01 Council Representation
Professional Personnel
Hours Rate Amount
Johnson, Craig 1.00 214.00 214.00
Ross, Samuel 1.50 229.00 343.50
Totals 2.50 557.50
Total Labor 557.50
Total this Task $557.50
Task 02 Plan Development and Oversight
Professional Personnel
Hours Rate Amount
Johnson, Craig .50 214.00 107.00
Totals .50 107.00
Total Labor 107.00
Total this Task $107.00
Total this Phase $664.50
Phase 003 Regulatory Proceedings
Task 01 Council Representation
Professional Personnel
Hours Rate Amount
Johnson, Craig 4.50 214.00 963.00
Totals 4.50 963.00
Total Labor 963.00
Total this Task $963.00
Task 02 Develop Technical Materials
Professional Personnel
Hours Rate Amount
Johnson, Craig 10.50 214.00 2,247.00

Please Reference Our Invoice Number on your Payment

Page 2



Project 863224-0007590.00  Rhode Island EERMC - 2024 Invoice 000000388329
Ross, Samuel .75 229.00 171.75
Totals 11.25 2,418.75
Total Labor 2,418.75
Total this Task $2,418.75
Total this Phase $3,381.75
Phase 004 Council Sponsored Meetings and Materials
Task 01 Meeting Attendance
Professional Personnel
Hours Rate Amount
Caesar, Adrian 1.25 201.00 251.25
Johnson, Craig 7.00 214.00 1,498.00
Totals 8.25 1,749.25
Total Labor 1,749.25
Consultants
RACHEL SHOLLY 830.00
Total Consultants 830.00 830.00
Total this Task $2,579.25
Task 02 Develop Technical Materials
Professional Personnel
Hours Rate Amount
Caesar, Adrian 6.25 201.00 1,256.25
Johnson, Craig 15.75 214.00 3,370.50
Ross, Samuel 2.50 229.00 572.50
Totals 24.50 5,199.25
Total Labor 5,199.25
Consultants
RACHEL SHOLLY 332.00
Total Consultants 332.00 332.00
Total this Task $5,531.25
Task 03 Other Council Responsibilities
Professional Personnel
Hours Rate Amount
Johnson, Craig 3.50 214.00 749.00
Totals 3.50 749.00
Total Labor 749.00
Consultants
RACHEL SHOLLY 2,739.00
Total Consultants 2,739.00 2,739.00
Total this Task $3,488.00
Total this Phase $11,598.50
Phase 005 Research, Analysis, and Other Council Su

Please Reference Our Invoice Number on your Payment

Page 3



Project 863224-0007590.00  Rhode Island EERMC - 2024 Invoice 000000388329
Professional Personnel
Hours Rate Amount
Caesar, Adrian 1.50 201.00 301.50
Johnson, Craig 11.75 214.00 2,514.50
Ross, Samuel 2.50 229.00 572.50
Totals 15.75 3,388.50
Total Labor 3,388.50
Total this Phase $3,388.50
Phase 006 Administrative
Professional Personnel
Hours Rate Amount
Johnson, Craig 3.00 86.00 258.00
Totals 3.00 258.00
Total Labor 258.00
Consultants
RACHEL SHOLLY 83.00
Total Consultants 83.00 83.00
Total this Phase $341.00
Phase 007 EERMC Intern
Additional Fees
Monthly Intern Fee March 2024 2,675.00
Total Additional Fees 2,675.00 2,675.00
Total this Phase $2,675.00
Billing Limits Current Prior To-Date
Total Billings 41,912.50 146,991.75 188,904.25
Limit 817,025.00
Remaining 628,120.75
Total this Invoice $41,912.50
Billings To Date
Current Prior Total
Labor 26,842.00 114,486.00 141,328.00
Consultant 12,395.50 26,460.00 38,855.50
Expense 0.00 3,370.75 3,370.75
Add-on 2,675.00 2,675.00 5,350.00
Totals 41,912.50 146,991.75 188,904.25

Please Reference Our Invoice Number on your Payment

Page 4



Project 863224-0007590.00  Rhode Island EERMC - 2024

Invoice

000000388329

Billing Backup

Thursday, May 16, 2024

NV5, Inc. Invoice 000000388329 Dated 5/16/2024 2:31:24 PM
Phase 001 EE Prg Planning & Implementation Oversig
Task 01 Council Representation
Professional Personnel
Hours Rate Amount
Johnson, Craig 4/9/2024 1.00 214.00 214.00
Bi-Weekly check-in with RIE/OER
Totals 1.00 214.00
Total Labor 214.00
Total this Task $761.25

Task 02 Implementation Oversight and Plan Develo
Professional Personnel

Hours Rate
Caesar, Adrian 4/1/2024 .50 201.00

EM&V study review/coordination - Automated RTU Swarmstat results
report, CINC process evaluation

Caesar, Adrian 4/2/2024 3.00 201.00
C-Team working session - EEC data reporting template updates; C&I data
report development - program-level historical performance comps,
electric and gas savings disaggregation, measure-code mapping QA/QC;
updated EEC data reporting template/formatting review

Caesar, Adrian 4/4/2024 .25 201.00
Monthly C-Team Optimal-EcoMetric EM&V check-in - CINC and CI Custom
process evaluation review, Appliance standards gross savings study SOW

Caesar, Adrian 4/5/2024 2.50 201.00
EM&V study review/comments - CINC Process Evaluation SOW; RIE Plan
outline memo review initial review

Caesar, Adrian 4/9/2024 1.00 201.00
EM&V study review/coordination - CINC process evaluation, Custom C&I
approach study

Caesar, Adrian 4/10/2024 3.00 201.00
C-Team working session - updates to RI data reporting formats and
templates; C&I EM&V meeting and study tracker review/updates; 2025
EE Plan outline memo review; 2024 RIE Equity metrics and strategies and
EWG meeting #3 notes review

Caesar, Adrian 4/11/2024 .50 201.00
EM&YV study review - C&I Custom Approach evaluation
Caesar, Adrian 4/12/2024 4.50 201.00

EM&V study review/comments - C&I Custom Approach evaluation;
SwarmStat Automated RTU demo final report and results calcs; internal
EMV study tracker updates; C-Team working session - RI data reporting
format updates and data snapshots/report development; Preliminary Q1
program data review; 2025 Plan Outline Memo review and comments

Caesar, Adrian 4/15/2024 4.50 201.00

Preliminary Q1 Resi/C&I data report development; Preliminary Q1 Data
Snapshot development

Amount
100.50

603.00

50.25

502.50

201.00

603.00

100.50

904.50

904.50

Please Reference Our Invoice Number on your Payment

Page 5



Project 863224-0007590.00  Rhode Island EERMC - 2024 Invoice 000000388329

Caesar, Adrian 4/16/2024 2.00 201.00 402.00
Preliminary Q1 Resi/C&I data report review; 2025 annual EE Plan - Plan
outline memo review and comments

Caesar, Adrian 4/17/2024 .50 201.00 100.50
2025 EE Plan - Plan Outline memo review and EEc/C-Team comments
consolidation

Caesar, Adrian 4/18/2024 3.25 201.00 653.25
C-Team working session - updated EEC data graphics, upstream GHG
emissions analysis/research; corrected C&I gas data review and QA/QC;
updated C&I data report and prelim Q1 Gas Data Snapshot development

Caesar, Adrian 4/22/2024 1.50 201.00 301.50
Preliminary Q1 C&I Program data review and questions to RIE; detailed
quarterly residential program data request; Plan Outline memo comments
consolidation and proposed edits for RIE

Caesar, Adrian 4/24/2024 .75 201.00 150.75
EM&V study tracker review; Monthly Residential EM&V mtg.

Caesar, Adrian 4/25/2024 .75 201.00 150.75
C&I Sector Team coordination - May meeting schedule; preliminary Q1
program data report updates

Caesar, Adrian 4/26/2024 1.50 201.00 301.50
2025 Annual Plan outline memo review; final C-Team comments on 2025
Plan outline memo

Caesar, Adrian 4/29/2024 .25 201.00 50.25
EEC data reporting graphics updates

Johnson, Craig 4/2/2024 1.75 214.00 374.50
Review residential data report. Review comments from 2024 EE plan for
residential to inform discussion points at sector team meeting on
Thursday.

Johnson, Craig 4/4/2024 3.25 214.00 695.50
Monthly Res & IES Sector team meeting, associated meeting prep
including assembling discussion topics for focus during 2025 EE Plan
development.

Johnson, Craig 4/8/2024 .50 214.00 107.00
RIE IRA Analysis - follow-up with RIE on status of sharing background
analysis. Res Sector Team - Review notes from last week's monthly
meeting, identify follow-up items and distribute to meeting attendees.

Johnson, Craig 4/12/2024 .25 214.00 53.50
Monthly Data Snapshots - discuss update process and timeline with
Adrian.

Johnson, Craig 4/18/2024 1.25 214.00 267.50
Review RIE Plan outline memo.

Johnson, Craig 4/22/2024 2.50 214.00 535.00
Res Sector Team - monthly check-in with Spencer, prep for meeting.
Monthly data review. Annual Plan Outline Memo - continue review memo
and begin drafting comments.

Johnson, Craig 4/24/2024 .25 214.00 53.50
Res Sector Team - coordinate with internal team on prep meetings for
next week sector team meeting.

Johnson, Craig 4/26/2024 3.50 214.00 749.00
EE Plan Outline Memo - Final review and comment on 2025 EE Plan
outline memo, review and consolidate comments from rest of team, prep
for and deliver to RIE. Res sector team - review march monthly data
report, draft and distribute agenda for May sector team meeting.

Johnson, Craig 4/30/2024 .25 214.00 53.50
Equity Working Group - Review updates from GHHI, fill out poll for next
meeting, coordinate with Bryan re: opportunities for input.

Please Reference Our Invoice Number on your Payment Page 6
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Ross, Samuel 4/2/2024 .50 229.00 114.50
coord team tasks and workstreams for wk
Ross, Samuel 4/9/2024 2.00 229.00 458.00
team check in; prep for OER/RIE check in; begin review of Plan Outline
Memo
Ross, Samuel 4/12/2024 .50 229.00 114.50
Team check in incl. work planning for next year
Ross, Samuel 4/16/2024 1.50 229.00 343.50

check in on work streams for this wk; plan outline memo cont. review
and comment

Totals 48.25 9,999.75
Total Labor

Total this Task

Task 03 Education Initiatives
Professional Personnel

Hours Rate Amount
Johnson, Craig 4/3/2024 .75 214.00 160.50

Check-in meeting with Rachel to discuss updates on Education items,
including updates on energy expo, public awareness campaign
contracting and kickoff, LEAD session topics, Council's annual report, EEC
Public Events, and EEC website update.

Johnson, Craig 4/5/2024 .50 214.00 107.00
Prep for Council Education Committee meeting.
Johnson, Craig 4/9/2024 .25 214.00 53.50

EE & Climate Awareness Campaign contracting - review and respond to
update from Rachel.

Johnson, Craig 4/10/2024 .75 214.00 160.50
Check-in meeting with Rachel on variety of education items including EE
& Climate awareness campaign contracting and next steps, outcomes
from last education committee meeting, energy expo follow up, and URI
contracting.

Johnson, Craig 4/17/2024 .25 214.00 53.50
EE & Climate Awareness Campaign RFP - Coordinate pre-meeting prep
with Rachel and Steve.

Johnson, Craig 4/19/2024 2.25 214.00 481.50
Kickoff meeting with PivotPath, pre-meeting prep with Rachel and Steve,
read through bid package materials to prep for kickoff meeting.

Johnson, Craig 4/22/2024 .25 214.00 53.50
Council website as part of rebranding effort - follow-up on status of
website transfer and go-live.

Johnson, Craig 4/30/2024 .25 214.00 53.50
Follow-up with Rachel on review of URI's education proposal and
education committee meeting.

Ross, Samuel 4/16/2024 .50 229.00 114.50
Social media next steps
Totals 5.75 1,238.00
Total Labor

Total this Task

Total this Phase

Phase 002 System Reliability Procurement

9,999.75
$13,091.50

1,238.00
$6,010.50

$19,863.25

Please Reference Our Invoice Number on your Payment
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Project 863224-0007590.00  Rhode Island EERMC - 2024 Invoice 000000388329
Task 01 Council Representation
Professional Personnel
Hours Rate Amount
Johnson, Craig 4/17/2024 1.00 214.00 214.00
SRP TWG meeting attendance.
Ross, Samuel 4/17/2024 1.50 229.00 343.50
SRP TWG, prep re: same
Totals 2.50 557.50
Total Labor 557.50
Total this Task $557.50
Task 02 Plan Development and Oversight
Professional Personnel
Hours Rate Amount
Johnson, Craig 4/16/2024 .25 214.00 53.50
Coordinate with Sam and Peter re: responses to discussion questions
from RIE for SRP TWG meeting.
Johnson, Craig 4/17/2024 .25 214.00 53.50
SRP Investment Proposal - Coordinate stakeholder review meeting.
Totals .50 107.00
Total Labor 107.00
Total this Task $107.00
Total this Phase $664.50
Phase 003 Regulatory Proceedings
Task 01 Council Representation
Professional Personnel
Hours Rate Amount
Johnson, Craig 4/25/2024 4.50 214.00 963.00
Future of Gas Stakeholder Committee Meeting attendance.
Totals 4.50 963.00
Total Labor 963.00
Total this Task $963.00
Task 02 Develop Technical Materials
Professional Personnel
Hours Rate Amount
Johnson, Craig 4/4/2024 .50 214.00 107.00

Coordinate with Marisa on SRP 3YP intervener notice and cost-

effectiveness report filing. Create final version of SRP Cost Effectiveness

report for filing.

Please Reference Our Invoice Number on your Payment
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Project 863224-0007590.00  Rhode Island EERMC - 2024 Invoice

000000388329

Johnson, Craig 4/5/2024 .25 214.00 53.50

Review RIE Reply Testimony in Docket 24-06-EE, discussion with Sam re:
next steps and plan for filing surrebutal.

Johnson, Craig 4/8/2024 2.00 214.00 428.00
Docket 24-06-EE - Draft surrebuttal testimony and review RIE rebuttal
testimony.

Johnson, Craig 4/12/2024 .25 214.00 53.50

Check-in with Sam on various docket items - SRP 3YP and electric DR
SRP investment proposal.

Johnson, Craig 4/24/2024 4.00 214.00 856.00
Review recording and notes form last FoG meeting and stakeholder
comments in prep for stakeholder meeting tomorrow. Listen to last
stakeholder meeting.

Johnson, Craig 4/25/2024 1.75 214.00 374.50
Continue review of past FoG stakeholder meeting recording and
stakeholder comments in prep for today's FOG meeting.

Johnson, Craig 4/26/2024 .25 214.00 53.50
Docket 23-47-EE - Coordinate and confirm with Council's legal that
Council is not intending on submitting testimony.

Johnson, Craig 4/29/2024 1.50 214.00 321.00
Future of Gas Docket - Review recording and notes from past meetings.
Ross, Samuel 4/5/2024 .75 229.00 171.75
review RIE rebuttal testimony; discuss plan with Craig
Totals 11.25 2,418.75
Total Labor 2,418.75
Total this Task $2,418.75
Total this Phase $3,381.75
Phase 004 Council Sponsored Meetings and Materials
Task 01 Meeting Attendance
Professional Personnel
Hours Rate Amount
Caesar, Adrian 4/18/2024 1.25 201.00 251.25
April EEC Meeting
Johnson, Craig 4/5/2024 1.00 214.00 214.00
Council Education Committee meeting attendance.
Johnson, Craig 4/18/2024 2.75 214.00 588.50
EEC ExCom and full EEC meeting attendance.
Johnson, Craig 4/29/2024 3.25 214.00 695.50
Council LEAD Session meeting attendance.
Totals 8.25 1,749.25
Total Labor 1,749.25
Total this Task $2,579.25
Task 02 Develop Technical Materials

Professional Personnel
Hours Rate Amount

Please Reference Our Invoice Number on your Payment
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Project 863224-0007590.00  Rhode Island EERMC - 2024 Invoice 000000388329
Caesar, Adrian 4/2/2024 .50 201.00 100.50
C-Team working session - SR check-in w/EEC Chair, EEC social media and
branding strategy, April EEC mtg. materials prep
Caesar, Adrian 4/9/2024 .50 201.00 100.50
C-Team working session - April EEC mtg. materials development
Caesar, Adrian 4/10/2024 .75 201.00 150.75
April EERMC mtg. materials development - EEC calendar slides, EWG
update memo, EERMC LEAD Session agenda
Caesar, Adrian 4/11/2024 .75 201.00 150.75
C-Team working session - EERMC mtg. prep; April EERMC mtg. materials
finalization - EEC calendar slides, EWG update memo, EEC LEAD Session
agenda, EEC briefing memo
Caesar, Adrian 4/16/2024 .75 201.00 150.75
EEC social media post and content planning working session; April EEC
mtg. materials update - March EEC mtg follow ups
Caesar, Adrian 4/17/2024 .50 201.00 100.50
C-Team working session - EEC website updates, April EEC mtg. prep and
materials review
Caesar, Adrian 4/18/2024 1.25 201.00 251.25
EEC mtg. materials updates - Plan development calendar, Gas Data
Snapshot
Caesar, Adrian 4/23/2024 .75 201.00 150.75
C-Team Working sessions - EEC social media development strategy and
posting schedule, EEC data reporting graphics and formatting
Caesar, Adrian 4/24/2024 .50 201.00 100.50
C-Team working session - EEC mtg. follow ups; research on contractor
satisfaction surveys/studies for EEC annual report recommendations
Johnson, Craig 4/2/2024 .50 214.00 107.00
Working session with internal team to review and discuss deliverables
needed for April Council meeting. Review and update internal tracking
resources.
Johnson, Craig 4/3/2024 .50 214.00 107.00
April Council Meeting Material - Coordinate deliverables for EWG update
memo and Council attendance with Margie. April EdCom Meeting -
Review agenda, provide feedback, and discuss potential supporting
material needs.
Johnson, Craig 4/9/2024 1.00 214.00 214.00
April Meeting Material - Discuss assignments with internal team. LEAD
Session Agenda - Discuss agenda and strategy for Future of Gas update
with Sam. Review content for Council Budget materials, coordinate with
Steve re: same. Follow-up with RIE re: March Council meeting follow-ups
and distribution of those to Councilors.
Johnson, Craig 4/10/2024 1.50 214.00 321.00
April Meeting Materials - Review draft of EWG update memo to Council,
send feedback to Margie. Draft Councilor Briefing Memo. Finalize EWG
Update Memo.
Johnson, Craig 4/11/2024 5.25 214.00 1,123.50
April Meeting Materials - Organize deliverables for today and discussions
with team about the same. Update and finalize Briefing memo for both
Council and ExCom meetings. Finalize EWG update memo. Review,
comment on, and finalize slides for Council Annual Report update. Draft
memo on RIE follow-ups from March meeting, share with RIE. Review,
comment on, and finalize draft agenda for April LEAD session.
Johnson, Craig 4/12/2024 .25 214.00 53.50
April Council Materials - check-in with team on any outstanding materials
and plans for presentation coverage next week.
Johnson, Craig 4/15/2024 .25 214.00 53.50
Please Reference Our Invoice Number on your Payment Page 10
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April Meeting Materials - Coordinate with Rachel on updates to Annual
Report materials. Coordinate with Adrian on updates to data snapshots.
Johnson, Craig 4/16/2024 .25 214.00 53.50
April Council Materials - Coordinate with Adrian and Brett re: RIE EEC
follow-up memo.
Johnson, Craig 4/17/2024 .50 214.00 107.00
April Meeting Materials - check-in and coordinate with Adrian and Rachel
on presentation roles for April Council and ExCom meetings.
Johnson, Craig 4/18/2024 1.50 214.00 321.00
April EEC and ExCom Meeting Materials - Review C-Team and RIE
materials, prep comments and talking points, discussion with Adrian re:
same. Coordinate with team on meeting follow-up tasks.
Johnson, Craig 4/22/2024 .25 214.00 53.50
Coordinate with Rachel on LEAD session agenda.
Johnson, Craig 4/23/2024 .75 214.00 160.50
LEAD Session - Review and provide feedback on draft agenda, develop
materials for future of gas update topic. Coordinate with Councilor Case
on agenda.
Johnson, Craig 4/26/2024 3.25 214.00 695.50
LEAD and May Agenda Materials - Coordinate deliverables with Adrian
and Rachel. Draft slides and prep talking points for future of gas updates
at LEAD session.
Ross, Samuel 4/4/2024 .50 229.00 114.50
review and affirm Council material development approach for Apr. mtg
Ross, Samuel 4/9/2024 1.00 229.00 229.00
coord materials dev. for Apr. EERMC Mtg
Ross, Samuel 4/12/2024 .50 229.00 114.50
Council materials check in and review
Ross, Samuel 4/16/2024 .50 229.00 114.50
review and confirm plan for Council meeting this wk, disc. same w/team
Totals 24.50 5,199.25
Total Labor 5,199.25
Total this Task $5,531.25
Task 03 Other Council Responsibilities
Professional Personnel
Hours Rate Amount
Johnson, Craig 4/9/2024 .25 214.00 53.50
Council Annual Report - Follow-up with Rachel and Brendan on first draft
of materials.
Johnson, Craig 4/11/2024 1.00 214.00 214.00
Work on draft updates to Council's Annual Report content.
Johnson, Craig 4/12/2024 2.00 214.00 428.00
Continue work on draft updates to Council's Annual Report content.
Discussion and coordination with Rachel re: same.
Johnson, Craig 4/30/2024 .25 214.00 53.50
Council Annual Report - review latest updates from Rachel and RIE,
coordinate with Rachel on next steps for C-Team updates.
Totals 3.50 749.00
Total Labor 749.00
Total this Task $3,488.00
Please Reference Our Invoice Number on your Payment Page 11
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Total this Phase $11,598.50
Phase 005 Research, Analysis, and Other Council Su
Professional Personnel
Hours Rate Amount
Caesar, Adrian 4/24/2024 1.50 201.00 301.50
Attend April EC4 Advisory board meeting, record notes.
Johnson, Craig 4/4/2024 .50 214.00 107.00
Councilor social media plan and tracker - discussion with Kaeley to begin
scoping out tracker and delegate task to fill with upcoming known events
that Councilor Oakley could post about.
Johnson, Craig 4/5/2024 .50 214.00 107.00
Council Legal Services RFP - coordinate with Steve re: bidder scoring and
interview set up. Review scoring committee scores.
Johnson, Craig 4/8/2024 .25 214.00 53.50
Council Legal Services RFP - Coordinate with scoring committee on times
and availability for interviews with potential vendors.
Johnson, Craig 4/9/2024 .50 214.00 107.00
Fugitive methane emissions research - scope research task, discuss with
Sam and Kaeley.
Johnson, Craig 4/10/2024 .50 214.00 107.00
Council ByLaws - Review last iteration from 2023, update with Council
branding language, further updates throughout. Share with legal team for
review.
Johnson, Craig 4/11/2024 1.00 214.00 214.00
Council Legal Services RFP - Review proposals and scoring committee
scores, prep for and attend interview with one of the two bidders.
Johnson, Craig 4/15/2024 1.50 214.00 321.00
Legal Services interview - review interview firms proposal to prep for
interview, attend interview. Coordinate pre-council meeting briefings with
Sue and Peter. Review, fill out, finish, and submit conflict of interst form
for EE Implementation RFP.
Johnson, Craig 4/16/2024 1.00 214.00 214.00
Coordinate with Harry on pre-Council meeting check-in. Council Legal
Services recommendation memo - review memo, provide feedback.
Johnson, Craig 4/17/2024 2.50 214.00 535.00
Review request from stakeholders for Council support on Building Decarb
bill, coordinate with Council's legal re: same. Council member briefing
with Sue and Peter.
Johnson, Craig 4/18/2024 2.50 214.00 535.00
EE Implementation RFP - Kickoff meeting with OER scoring team and
Council scoring advisors, associated meeting prep. Pre-Council meeting
briefing with Chair Oakley. Post-Council meeting debriefs. Discussion with
Council's new legal team about next steps for contracting and project
kickoff.
Johnson, Craig 4/23/2024 .75 214.00 160.50
Coordinate coverage for upcoming EC4 meetings. Coordinate with Emily
Koo on process for getting Council input on Building Decarbinization bill.
Johnson, Craig 4/30/2024 .25 214.00 53.50
EE Implementation RFP support - review notice from Steve re: review
next steps. Fill out scheduling poll, review inbox for materials from state
purchasing.
Ross, Samuel 4/1/2024 1.25 229.00 286.25
prep for, attend 1-on-1 with Chair Oakley
Please Reference Our Invoice Number on your Payment Page 12
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Ross, Samuel 4/4/2024 1.25 229.00 286.25
"finalize and share outcomes from Chair Oakley meeting with C Johnson,
discuss implementation of those considerations; corresp re: Steve Lasher
inquiry to Priscilla.
Totals 15.75 3,388.50
Total Labor 3,388.50
Total this Phase $3,388.50
Phase 006 Administrative
Professional Personnel
Hours Rate Amount
Johnson, Craig 4/10/2024 3.00 86.00 258.00
Work on drafting first iteration of C-Team Quarterly budget update
memo. Budget analysis related to same.
Totals 3.00 258.00
Total Labor 258.00
Total this Phase $341.00
Total this Project $39,237.50
Total this Report $39,237.50

Please Reference Our Invoice Number on your Payment
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Make Payable to: Jennifer Chiodo
JLC Consulting

52 Bent Creek Road

Hinesburg, VT 05416

INVOICE
TO : Optimal Energy Inc. Invoice Number: R-24.04
10600 Route 116, Suite 3 Invoice Date: April 30, 2024
Hinesburg, VT 05461 OEI Project #: 7525

Work Performed for RI Energy Efficiency & Resource Management Council

Description of Services Amount

Services Performed 04/01/24 through 04/30/24

Hours Hourly Rate Amount Due
LABOR - Regular Hours 1.50 $206.00 $309.00
LABOR - Travel Hours 0.00 $103.00 $0.00
Travel Expenses $0.00

(See attached travel expense form for details.)

TOTAL DUE $309.00




Make Payable to: Jennifer Chiodo

Services Performed 04/01/24 through 04/30/24

\"AvA | = =

Program
Planning &
001-02
Implementation
Oversight & | sub-Total | Sub-Total
Plan Regular Travel Total
Date Description of Services Development Hrs. Hrs. Hours
0.00 0.00 0.00
4/25/2024 |RI Plan review 1.50 1.50 0.00 1.50
0.00 0.00 0.00
0.00 0.00 0.00
0.00 0.00 0.00
Total Hours 1.50 1.50 0.00 1.50
Total Amount $309.00 $309.00 0.00 | $309.00




Margie Lynch/Core Energy Insights, Inc.
4445 E. Hoback River Road, Jackson, WY 83001

INVOICE
TO : Optimal Energy Inc. Invoice Number: CEI RI 4-2024
10600 Route 116, Suite 3 Invoice Date: May 1, 2024
Hinesburg, VT 05461 OEI Project #: 7590

Work Performed for Rl Energy Efficiency & Resource Management Council

Description of Services Amount

Services Performed 04/01/24 through 04/30/24

Hours Hourly Rate Amount Due
LABOR - Regular Hours 4.00 $199.00 $796.00
LABOR - Travel Hours 0.00 $99.50 $0.00
Travel Expenses $0.00

(See attached travel expense form for details.)

TOTAL DUE $796.00




Margie Lynch/Core Energy Insights, Inc.

Services Performed 04/01/24 through 04/30/24

001 - EE Program Planning & Implementation

001-02 005-00
001-01 Implementation 001-03 Research, Sub-Total | Sub-Total

Council Oversight & Plan Education Analysis & other, 006-00 Regular Travel Total

Date Description of Services Representation | Development Initiatives Council Support| Administrative | Travel Time Hrs. Hrs. Hours
4/3/24 |Reviewed and responded to RI Energy equity metrics update 0.25 0.00 0.00 0.00
4/4/24 |Prepared for and participated in Res Sector Team meeting 0.75 0.25 0.00 0.25

Prepared update memo to Council regarding Equity Working

4/9/2024 JGroup 1.25 0.75 0.00 0.75
4/10/2024)Revised memo to Council; compiled info on MA MTMs 0.25 0.25 1.25 0.00 1.25
4/18/2024 |Prepared for and participated in EEC meeting 1.25 0.50 0.00 0.50
1.25 0.00 1.25
0.00 0.00 0.00
0.00 0.00 0.00
Total Hours 2.75 1.25 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 4.00 0.00 4.00
Total Amount $547.25 $248.75 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00] $796.00 0.00 | $796.00




Ralph Prahl
7001 Stanhope Place, University Park FL 34201

INVOICE
TO : Optimal Energy Inc. Invoice Number: 50
10600 Route 116, Suite 3 Invoice Date: May 1, 2024
Hinesburg, VT 05461 OEI Project #: 7590

Work Performed for Rl Energy Efficiency & Resource Management Council

Description of Services Amount

Services Performed 4/01/24 through 4/30/24

Hours Hourly Rate Amount Due
LABOR - Regular Hours 3.00 $212.00 $636.00
LABOR - Travel Hours 0.00 $106.00 $0.00
Travel Expenses $0.00

(See attached travel expense form for details.)

TOTAL DUE $636.00




Ralph Prahl

Services Performed 4/01/24 through 4/30/24

001 - EE Program Planning & Implementation

001-02 005-00
001-01 Implementation 001-03 Research, Sub-Total
Council Oversight & Plan Education Analysis & other 006-00 Regular | Sub-Total
Date Description of Services Representation | Development Initiatives Council Support| Administrative | Travel Time Hrs. |Travel Hrs. |Total Hours
0.00 0.00 0.00
4/3/2024|C&I proc eval, Swarmstat report 0.25 0.25 0.00 0.00
custom process eval SOW; Swarmstat report; CINC proc eval
4/5/2024|SOW 1.50 1.50 0.00 0.25
4/9/2024|new cons proc eval 0.25 0.25 0.00 1.50
4/10/2024|check-in call 0.50 0.50 0.00 0.25
4/24/2024|check-in call; res studies 0.50 0.50 0.00 0.50
0.00 0.00 0.00
Total Hours 0.00 3.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 3.00 0.00 3.00
Total Amount $0.00 $636.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $636.00 0.00 $636.00




EcoMetric Consulting, LLC
41 Leopard Road, Suite 104

Paoli, PA 19301 INVOICE

610.400.8600
ECOMETRIC admin@ecometricconsulting.com

BILLED TO TOTAL DUE

Sam Ross

Optimal Energy - NV5 $838 OO
10600 Route 116, Suite 3 :
Hinesburg, VT 05461

Project Name RI EERMC Consultant Invoice Date 05/06/2024
Project # 7525 Due Date 06/05/2024
Invoice # 1029-P4-24 Payment Terms Net 30
Billing Period 04/01/2024 - 04/30/2024
CoskNumber | Descripton | Amount
001-02 Implementation Oversight & Plan Development $838.00
Subtotal $838.00
Invoice Total $838.00

Budget Summary

Task Number Budget Previous Billings Total Spent

Task 001-02 $150,000.00 $45,479.00 $46,317.00 $103,683.00
TBD TBD $0.00 $0.00

Contract Balance $103,683.00




Invoice Number

1029-P4-24

Period 04/01/2024 - 04/30/2024
Project Person Title Month Rate Amount
RI EERMC Consultant  Implementation Oversight & Plan D Salil Gogte Partner 2024-04 1 $220.00 $ 220.00
RI EERMC Consultant  Implementation Oversight & Plan D Michael Frischmann Partner 2024-04 0 $220.00 $ -
RI EERMC Consultant  Implementation Oversight & Plan D Michael Honeychuck ~ Managing Consultant 2024-04 3 $206.00 $ 618.00
RI EERMC Consultant  Implementation Oversight & Plan D Bitul Sinha Managing Consultant 2024-04 0 $206.00 $ -
RI EERMC Consultant  Implementation Oversight & Plan D Cory Read Data Scientist 2024-04 0 $206.00 $ =
RI EERMC Consultant  Implementation Oversight & Plan D Jake Fuller Managing Consultant 2024-04 0 $206.00 $ -
RI EERMC Consultant  Implementation Oversight & Plan D Mary George Sr Engineer 2024-04 0 $166.00 $ =
RI EERMC Consultant  Implementation Oversight & Plan D Kyle McKenna Managing Consultant 2024-04 0 $206.00 $ -
Total 4.00 $ 838.00
Project Person Title Month Rate Amount
RI EERMC Consultant 0 Salil Gogte Partner 2024-04 0 $220.00 $ =
RI EERMC Consultant 0 Michael Frischmann Partner 2024-04 0 $220.00 $ -
RI EERMC Consultant 0 Michael Honeychuck  Managing Consultant 2024-04 0 $206.00 $ =
RI EERMC Consultant O Bitul Sinha Managing Consultant 2024-04 0 $206.00 $ -
RI EERMC Consultant 0 2024-04 0 $ -
$

Total



fname local_date hours task notes

Monthly check-in with Adrian

Michael Hol 4/4/2024 L Implementation Oversigh Invoice & emails

Michael Ho 4/6/2024 0.5 Implementation Oversigh Invoice & emails

C&I Custom Process Evaluation - Draft SOW review

Michael Ho s 1 Implementation Oversigh Emails

Michael Hoi  4/26/2024 0.5 Implementation Oversigh Monthly invoice estimate

Salil Gogte 4/4/2024 1 Implementation Oversigh inv review, budget review, workload adjustments




Rachel Sholly
48 Hudson Street, Providence, RI 02909

INVOICE
TO : Optimal Energy Inc. Invoice Number: 76
10600 Route 116, Suite 3 Invoice Date: May 5, 2024
Hinesburg, VT 05461 OEI Project #: 7590

Work Performed for Rl Energy Efficiency & Resource Management Council

Description of Services Amount

Services Performed 4/01/2024 through 4/30/2024

Hours Hourly Rate Amount Due
LABOR - Regular Hours 52.25 $166.00 $8,673.50
LABOR - Admin Hours 1.00 $83.00 $83.00
LABOR - Travel Hours 0.00 $83.00 $0.00
Travel Expenses $0.00

(See attached travel expense form for details.)

TOTAL DUE $8,756.50



Rachel Sholly
Services Performed 4/01/2024 through 4/30/2024

001 - EE Program Planning &
Implementation

004 - Council Sponsored Meetings & Materials

Date

Description of Services

001-02
Implementation
Oversight &
Plan
Development

001-03
Education
Initiatives

004-01
Meeting
Attendance

004-02
Develop
Technical
Materials

004-03
Other Council
Responsibilities

005-00

Research,

ysis & other

Council Support

Sub-Total
Regular
Hrs.

Sub-Total
Travel Hrs.

Sub-Total
Admin Hrs.

Total
Hours

04/01/24

Updated EdComm agenda; EdComm mtg logistics;
Correspondence re: website launch

1.00

1.00

0.00

0.00

1.00

04/02/24

Compiled EdComm materials, mtg coordination;
Correspondence re: PivotPath contract

1.00

1.00

0.00

0.00

1.00

04/03/24

Sent EdComm materials; C-team call re: edu activities;
EdComm mtg planning w/URI; Compiled & sent prior
LEAD session agendas & topic lists to C-team;
Correspondence w/PivotPath

2.75

2.75

0.00

0.00

2.75

04/04/24

Annual report reminders

0.25

0.25

0.00

0.00

0.25

04/09/24

Reviewed March EdComm meeting minutes; Updated
PivotPath contract, drafted SOS registration language,
related communication; Reviewed RIE annual report
narrative & coordinated on development, updated table of|
contents

0.75

1.75)

2.50

0.00

0.00

2.50

04/10/24

C-team check-in prep; Reviewed Council procurement
guidelines, finalized & sent PivotPath contract, scheduled
kick-off mtg; C-team planning re: Council mtg materials &
edu activities; Reviewed & provided guidance on C-team
program summary graphs; Correspondence re: URI
contract; Calendar logistics for LEAD sessions &
EdComm mtgs; Drafted & sent LEAD session agenda

3.50

1.00

0.25

4.50

0.00

0.25

4.75

04/11/24

Drafted & sent annual report slides

0.50

0.50

0.00

0.00

0.50

04/12/24

Compiling, editing, writing annual report first draft; Annual
report check-in w/C-Team; More compiling, editing,
writing

2.75

2.75

0.00

0.00

2.75

04/15/24

Drafted annual report content, posted final draft to
meeting page

3.00

3.00

0.00

0.00

3.00

04/16/24

Review & feedback on C-team graphs; Energy expo
follow-up

0.50

0.50

0.00

0.00

0.50

04/17/24

C-team planning re: Council mtg, website, contracts,
annual report; Started drafting pre-PivotPath call notes,
LEAD session prompts & slides; Initiated planning for
annual CHP stakeholder mtg

3.00

0.50

3.50

0.00

0.00

3.50

04/18/24

ExComm & EEC mtg - annual report presentation,
budget, other education agenda items; Drafted & sent
notes for PivotPath mtg; Updated LEAD session agenda

3.00

3.00

0.00

0.00

3.00

04/19/24

Prep for PivotPath mtg w/C-team & OER; PivotPath
internal kick-off mtg & started compiling resources email;
Setup admin access to new website

5.00

5.00

0.00

0.00

5.00

04/22/24

Drafted objectives, prompts & resources for LEAD
agenda; CHP mtg planning; Correspondence re: website,
URI contract, PivotPath check-in mtgs

5.25

5.25

0.00

0.00

5.25

04/23/24

Created LEAD mtg on website; Requested missing
Councilor headshots; News & graphics strategy w/Energy|
Fellow; LEAD agenda updating & coordination, drafted
LEAD reminder email, related correspondence; PivotPath
project management coordination

1.25)

1.00

0.25

2.25

0.00

0.25

2.50

04/24/24

C-team planning re: LEAD session, edu activities;
Prepared final LEAD agenda & materials to send;
Correspondence re: website; CHP mtg coordination

2.75

2.75

0.00

0.00

2.75

04/25/24

Updated, finalized & sent LEAD session reminder &
materials

0.75

0.75

0.00

0.00

0.75

04/26/24

Drafted LEAD slides; C-team planning re: LEAD session;
Sent LEAD slides for review; Designed Marisa thank you;
Worked on education website content updates

4.25)

4.25

0.00

0.00

4.25

04/29/24

LEAD session prep; Drafted & sent EdComm agenda;
Correspondence re: edu budget & annual report; Printed
LEAD session materials; LEAD Session

0.75

5.00

0.50

5.75

0.00

0.50

6.25

04/30/24

Sent resources to PivotPath; PivotPath check-in

1.00]

1.00

0.00

0.00

1.00

Total Hours

0.00

28.75

5.00

2.00

16.50

0.00

1.00

52.25

0.00

1.00

53.25

Total Amount

$0.00

$4,772.50

$830.00

$332.00

$2,739.00

$0.00

$83.00

$8,673.50

$0.00

$83.00

$8,756.50




Energy Futures Group, Inc.
PO Box 587
Hinesburg, VT 05461

INVOICE
TO : Optimal Energy Inc. Invoice Number: 6264
10600 Route 116, Suite 3 Invoice Date: May 2, 2024
Hinesburg, VT 05461 OEI Project #: 7525

Work Performed for Rl Energy Efficiency & Resource Management Council

Description of Services Amount

Services Performed 4/1/2024 through 4/30/2024

Hours Hourly Rate Amount Due
LABOR - Regular Hours 3.00 $212.00 $636.00
LABOR - Travel Hours 0.00 $106.00 $0.00
Travel Expenses $0.00

(See attached travel expense form for details.)

TOTAL DUE $636.00




Energy Futures Group, Inc.
Services Performed 4/1/2024 through 4/30/2024

001 - EE Program Planning & Implementation

001-02
Implementation 005-00
001-01 Oversight & 001-03 Research, Sub-Total | Sub-Total

Council Plan Education Analysis & other 006-00 Regular Travel Total

Date Description of Services Representation | Development Initiatives Council Support| Administrative | Travel Time Hrs. Hrs. Hours
4/4/2024|Res sector monthly call 1.00 0.00 0.00 0.00
4/25/2024|Respond to Travis' request re: C&I lighting survey 0.25 1.00 0.00 1.00
4/26/2024|Review mercury law details; provide comments on 2025 EE Plan outline 1.25 0.25 0.00 0.25
4/28/2024|Survey schedule coordination 0.25 1.25 0.00 1.25
4/29/2024|Survey schedule coordination 0.25 0.25 0.00 0.25
0.25 0.00 0.25
0.00 0.00 0.00
0.00 0.00 0.00
0.00 0.00 0.00
Total Hours 0.00 3.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 3.00 0.00 3.00

Total Amount $0.00 $636.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $636.00 0.00 | $636.00




GDR Consulting
576 Rutland St
Carlisle MA 01741

INVOICE
TO : Optimal Energy Inc. Invoice Number: 4RI
10600 Route 116, Suite 3 Invoice Date: May 3, 2024
Hinesburg, VT 05461 OEI Project #: 7590

Work Performed for Rl Energy Efficiency & Resource Management Council

Description of Services Amount

Services Performed 4/1/24 through 4/30/24

Hours Hourly Rate Amount Due
LABOR - Regular Hours 2.00 $212.00 $424.00
LABOR - Travel Hours 0.00 $106.00 $0.00
Travel Expenses $0.00

(See attached travel expense form for details.)

TOTAL DUE $424.00




GDR Consulting
Services Performed 4/1/24 through 4/30/24

001 - EE Program Planning & Implementation

001-02 005-00
001-01 Implementation 001-03 Research, Sub-Total
Council Oversight & Plan Education Analysis & other 006-00 Regular | Sub-Total Total
Date Description of Services Representation | Development Initiatives Council Support| Administrative | Travel Time Hrs. |Travel Hrs. Hours
Participate in monthly Residential and IE Sector Team call with

4/4/2024 |RIE 1.00 1.00 0.00 1.00
4/24/2024 |Participate in monthly Residential EM&V check-in call 0.75 0.75 0.00 0.75
4/30/2024 |Initial review of RIE Q1 data 0.25 0.25 0.00 0.25
Total Hours 0.00 2.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 2.00 0.00 2.00
Total Amount $0.00 $424.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $424.00 0.00 | $424.00




Certificate of Service

I hereby certify that a copy of the cover letter and any materials accompanying this certificate was
electronically transmitted to the individuals listed below.

The paper copies of this filing are being hand delivered to the Rhode Island Public Utilities Commission
and to the Rhode Island Division of Public Utilities and Carriers.

Joanne M. Scanlon

April 2, 2024

Date

Docket No. 23-35-EE — Rhode Island Energy’s EE Plan 2024-2026 Three-
Year Plan and 2024 Annual EEP

Service list updated 10/4/2023

Name /Address

E-mail Distribution List

Phone

The Narragansett Electric Company
d/b/a Rhode Island Energy

Andrew Marcaccio, Esq.

280 Melrose St.

Providence, R1 02907

Leticia C. Pimentel, Esq.

Steve Boyajian, Esq.

Robinson & Cole LLP

One Financial Plaza, 14th Floor
Providence, RI 02903

amarcaccio@pplweb.com;

cobrien@pplweb.com;

jhutchinson@pplweb.com;

jscanlon@pplweb.com;

dmmoreira@rienergy.com;

MOCrayne(@rienergy.com;

BSFeldman@rienergy.com;

ACLi@rienergy.com;

DJTukey(@rienergy.com;

SBriggs@pplweb.com;

BJPelletier@rienergy.com;

JOliveira@pplweb.com;

Teast@rienergy.com;

Masiegal(@rienergy.com;

Cagill@rienergy.com;

sbovajian@rc.com;

LPimentel@rc.com;

HSeddon@rc.com;

401-784-4263

Division of Public Utilities & Carriers
Margaret L. Hogan, Esq.

Margaret.L.Hogan@dpuc.ri.gov;

Christy.hetherington@dpuc.ri.gov;

john.bell@dpuc.ri.gov;

Joel.munoz@dpuc.ri.gov;

Ellen.golde@dpuc.ri.gov;

401-780-2120




Machaela.Seaton@dpuc.ri.gov;

Paul.Roberti@dpuc.ri.gov;

Tim Woolf

Jennifer Kallay

Synapse Energy Economics
22 Pearl Street

Cambridge, MA 02139

twoolf(@synapse-energy.com;

jkallay@synapse-energy.com;

Ellen Cool
Levitan and Associates, Inc.

egc@levitan.com;

RI EERMC

Marisa Desautel, Esq.
Desautel Browning Law
38 Bellevue Ave., Unit H
Newport, RI 02840

marisa@desautelbrowning.com;

Adrian.Caesar@nv5.com;

Craig.Johnson@nv5.com;

Samuel.Ross@nv5.com;

401-477-0023

Office of Energy Resources (OER)
Albert Vitali, Esq.

Dept. of Administration

Division of Legal Services

One Capitol Hill, 4™ Floor
Providence, RI 02908

Albert.Vitali@doa.ri.gov;

Nancy.Russolino@doa.ri.gov;

Christopher.Kearns@energy.ri.gov;

William.Owen(@energy.ri.gov;

Steven.Chybowski@energy.ri.gov;

Nathan.Cleveland@energy.ri.gov;

401-222-8880

Original & 9 copies file w/:

Luly E. Massaro, Commission Clerk
John Harrington, Commission Counsel
Public Utilities Commission

89 Jefferson Blvd.

Warwick, RI 02888

Luly.massaro@puc.ri.gov;

John.Harrington@puc.ri.gov;

Alan.nault@puc.ri.gov;

Todd.bianco@puc.ri.gov ;

Emma.Rodvien@puc.ri.gov;

401-780-2107

Interested Party

Dept. of Human Services
Frederick Sneesby

Frederick.sneesby(@dhs.ri.gov:

RI Infrastructure Bank
Chris Vitale, Esq.,

cvitale@hvlawltd.com;

SUsatine(@riib.org;

Green Energy Consumers Alliance
Larry Chretien, Executive Director

Larry(@massenergy.org;

Amanda Barker

amanda(@greenenergyconsumers.org;

Acadia Center
Emily Koo, Director

EKoo@acadiacenter.org;

401-276-0600 x402
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