S

Andrew S. Marcaccio, Counsel 280 Melrose Street
PPL Services Corporation Providence, RI 02907 .
AMarcaccio@pplweb.com Phone 401-784-4263 Rhode Island Energ y

a PPL company

December 6, 2024

VIA ELECTRONIC MAIL AND HAND DELIVERY

Stephanie De La Rosa, Commission Clerk
Rhode Island Public Utilities Commission
89 Jefferson Boulevard

Warwick, RI 02888

RE: Docket No. 23-35-EE — 2024 Annual Energy Efficiency Program Plan
Quarterly Report of EERMC Invoices — 2024 — Quarter 4

Dear Ms. Massaro:

On behalf of The Narragansett Electric Company d/b/a Rhode Island Energy (the
“Company”), attached please find the 2024 — quarter 4 report showing Energy Efficiency
Resource Management Council (“EERMC”) expenses for work performed by EERMC vendors
in connection with the 2024 energy efficiency program year that were paid by the Company
between October 1, 2024 and December 31, 2024. For the remaining period of December, the
expenses for work performed by EERMC vendors has been estimated, and the EERMC indicated
they will be providing their updated year-end expense forecast to the PUC by December 15,
2024.

This report is being filed in accordance with directives issued by the Public Utilities
Commission (“PUC”) at an open meeting that occurred on January 25, 2022. Specifically, the
PUC directed the Company to file copies of all invoices paid to cover EERMC’s expenses on a
quarterly basis by the 15 of April, July, October, and December.

Please note that consistent with the directives issued by the PUC, the Company will also
send a copy of this report to each member of the EERMC individually via e-mail.

Thank you for your attention to this filing. If you have any questions or concerns, please

do not hesitate to contact me at 401-784-4263.
Sincerely,

FHe A p—

Andrew S. Marcaccio
Enclosures

cc: Docket No. 23-35-EE Service List



2024 EERMC Actual and Projected Expenses

Budget Category CY 2024 Proposed Remaining Balance January February March April August September October November December Notes
Consultant Services $ 817,025.00 $ 137,250.05 $47,166.50 $49,818.25 $49,886.25 $41,912.50 $ 41,619.50 $70,323.75 $78,968.20 $60,625.25 $ 68,664.25 $50,790.50 $ 60,000.00 $ 60,000.00
Legal Counsel $ 75,000.00 $ 18,010.44 $ 3,465.00 $ 1,294.61 $ 3,905.00 $ 2,117.50 $ 550.00 $ 6,692.49 $ 6,248.13 $ 2,559.38 $ 3,026.63 $ 7,130.82 $ 10,000.00 $ 10,000.00
Annual Report and Misc. Printing & Distribution ~ $ 3,000.00 $ 3,000.00
Council Travel and Education and Advancement  $ 900.00 $ 484.10 $ 207.95 $ 207.95
Public Education
2024 Farm Energy Fellow $ 7,500.00 $ - Removed from EERMC Budget at Oct. Meeting
Public Forum & Lecture Series $ 25,025.00 $ - $ 302.76 $ 24,722.24
K 12 Energy Education $ 25,000.00 $ - Removed from EERMC Budget at Oct. Meeting
EE and Climate Awareness Campaign $ 85,000.00 $ 17,058.79 $ 11,300.00 $ 5,988.00 $ 4,231.25 $ 4,526.80 $ 12,275.50 $ 9,619.66 $  10,000.00 $ 10,000.00
2024 Energy Expo $ 40,000.00 $ - $40,000.00
URI 2023 Forum and Lecture Series Invoice $ 1,439.41 $ - $ 1,439.41
EERMC Website $ 350.00 $ - $ 120.75 $ 229.25
TOTAL $ 1,080,239.41 $ 175,803.38

VALUES IN RED ARE ESTIMATES AND HAVE NOT YET BEEN INVOICED FOR 2024

Business Use



Date Approval by

Date Invoice EERMC Executive Date Invoice

Vendor Name Vendor Invoice # Date Range for Time Worked Invoice $ Received Director Received Paid

Pivot Path 1806 Sep-24| $ 12,275.50 10/4/2024 10/4/2024 10/7/2024
Optimal 406631 Aug-24 $ 60,625.25 10/22/2024 10/22/2024 10/24/2024
Handy Law 2379 Sep-24| $ 3,026.63 11/7/2024 11/7/2024 11/11/2024
Optimal 411895 Sep-24 $ 68,664.25 11/13/2024 11/12/2024 11/14/2024
Pivot Path 1811 Oct-24| $ 9,619.66 11/20/2024 11/20/2024 11/22/2024
URI GM-00039139 Oct-24( $ 1,439.41 11/22/2024 11/22/2024 11/25/2024
Optimal 416355 Oct-24| $ 50,790.50 11/27/2024 11/27/2024 11/29/2024

Business Use



#

1.

2.

3.

4.

5.

INVOICE

PivotPath, LLC elizabeth@pivotpathdigital.com
930 New Hope Rd Ste 11-628 +1 (404) 391-3528

Lawrenceville, GA 30045

Bill to
Rachel Sholly
Rhode Island Energy Efficiency Council

Invoice details

Invoice no.: 1806

Terms: Net 15

Invoice date: 09/30/2024
Due date: 10/15/2024

Product or service

Market Research

Strategic Planning

Creative Services

Media Planning

Project Management

Description

Task 1: Literature Review, Supplemental
Research - Strengthening messaging (Reviewing
previous messages and RIE for landing and
social continuity)

Task 2: Strategic Planning; Drafting of landing
page copy, drafting of social media captions,
redrafting of key messages, drafting of audio
script

Continuing to tailor messages to address the
specific needs and concerns of different.
audience segments based on the needs of the
Council.

Task 3: Campaign Conceptualization and Creative
Design — Revising the ""You have the Power""
Creative Ad Visuals"; (10 hours) Developing and
designing the "You Have The Power" landing
page; (15 hours); Final designs and ad sizing (4
hours); Audio Script (2 hours); Social media
captions (6 hours)

Task 4: Adjustments to the existing media plan for
the campaign; Pixels set up, Programmatic Paid
Display set up; Final KPIs based on media plan
to track

September 2024: Attending two meetings (2)
biweekly meetings) and one Council meeting for
approval, Project Coordination, and monthly
report

P

VOT-PATH

MARKETING STRATEGISTS AND CREATIVE STORYTELLERS.

Ship to
Rachel Sholly

Rhode Island Energy Efficiency Council

Qty Rate
2 $150.00
15.67 $150.00
39 $195.00
6.8 $150.00

8 $125.00

Amount

$300.00

$2,350.50

$7,605.00

$1,020.00

$1,000.00


mailto:elizabeth@pivotpathdigital.com
tel:+1 4043913528

Total $12,275.50
Ways to pay

visa @ wm]ﬂ BANK  Broyea venmo

Note to customer
Septembr 2024 Services (all)

View and pay


https://connect.intuit.com/portal/app/CommerceNetwork/view/scs-v1-b9905a7fa49a4445aa80fb5c5ee541802154dfc9ff3e4245be84eec35396f814da0adeeac11c40f1a1044c84119609b8?locale=en_US&cta=pdfbutton

Invoice O al

E NERGY
AN NW\S COMPANY

Remit checks to: Remit ACH transfer to: Remit Wire Transfers to:
Optimal Energy, LLC ABA Routing Number 063100277 ABA Routing Number 026009593
PO Box 74008680 Account Number 898052466590 Account Number 898052466590

Chicago, IL 60674-8680 Email ACH/Wire remittance details to Swift Code INTL. BOFAUS3N
RemittanceNotifications@nv5.com

Rhode Island Office of Energy Resources September 17, 2024
Project No: 6320824-0007590.00
Invoice No: 406631
Project 6320824-0007590.00 Rhode Island EERMC - 2024
Professional Services from August 01, 2024 to August 31, 2024 _  _ _ _ _ _ _ _ _ _ _ _ _ _____
Phase _ _ _ _ | 001 _ _ __ EE Prg Planning & Implementation Qversig _ _ _ _ _ _ _ _ _ _ _ _ _ _ ____
Task 01 Council Representation
Professional Personnel
Hours Rate Amount
Caesar, Adrian 2.00 201.00 402.00
Galluzzo, Jordan 2.00 35.00 70.00
Johnson, Craig 3.00 214.00 642.00
Totals 7.00 1,114.00
Total Labor 1,114.00
Total this Task 1,114.00
Task 02 Implementation Oversight and Plan Develo
Professional Personnel
Hours Rate Amount
Caesar, Adrian 75.00 201.00 15,075.00
Galluzzo, Jordan 46.75 35.00 1,636.25
Johnson, Andrew 15.50 201.00 3,115.50
Johnson, Craig 46.75 214.00 10,004.50
Keating, Griffith 1.75 201.00 351.75
Socks, Matthew 2.00 229.00 458.00
Stein, Annalise 16.50 173.00 2,854.50
Totals 204.25 33,495.50
Total Labor 33,495.50

Please Reference Our Invoice Number on your Payment



Project 6320824- Rhode Island EERMC - 2024 Invoice 406631
0007590.00
Consultants
GDR CONSULTING 2,862.00
CORE ENERGY INSIGHTS INC. 895.50
ENERGY FUTURES GROUP, INC. 2,173.00
RALPH PRAHL 2,438.00
Total Consultants 8,368.50 8,368.50
Total this Task 41,864.00
Task 03 Education Initiatives
Professional Personnel
Hours Rate Amount
Caesar, Adrian .50 201.00 100.50
Galluzzo, Jordan 3.00 35.00 105.00
Johnson, Craig 2.00 214.00 428.00
Totals 5.50 633.50
Total Labor 633.50
Consultants
RACHEL SHOLLY 4,648.00
Total Consultants 4,648.00 4,648.00
Total this Task 5,281.50
Total this Phase 48,259.50
Phase _ _ _ _ _ 002 _ __ ¢ System Reliability Procurement  _ _ _ _ _ _ _ _ _ _ _ _ _ _ __ _ _.
Task 01 Council Representation
Professional Personnel
Hours Rate Amount
Johnson, Craig 1.25 214.00 267.50
McDonald, Cliff 1.25 229.00 286.25
Totals 2.50 553.75
Total Labor 553.75
Total this Task 553.75
Task 02 Plan Development and Oversight
Professional Personnel
Hours Rate Amount
Johnson, Craig .25 214.00 53.50
Totals .25 53.50
Total Labor 53.50
Total this Task 53.50
Total this Phase 607.25
Phase 003 Regulatory Proceedings

Please Reference Our Invoice Number on your Payment

Page 2



Project 6320824- Rhode Island EERMC - 2024 Invoice 406631
0007590.00
Task 01 Council Representation
Professional Personnel
Hours Rate Amount
Johnson, Craig 4.50 214.00 963.00
Totals 4.50 963.00
Total Labor 963.00
Total this Task 963.00
Total this Phase 963.00
Phase _ _ _ __ 004_ _ _ _ ! Coundil Sponsored Meetings and Materials _ _ _ _ _ _ _ _ _ _ _ ___.
Task 01 Meeting Attendance
Professional Personnel
Hours Rate Amount
Caesar, Adrian 2.00 201.00 402.00
Galluzzo, Jordan 1.75 35.00 61.25
Johnson, Craig 2.00 214.00 428.00
Totals 5.75 891.25
Total Labor 891.25
Total this Task 891.25
Task 02 Develop Technical Materials
Professional Personnel
Hours Rate Amount
Caesar, Adrian 17.75 201.00 3,567.75
Galluzzo, Jordan 7.25 35.00 253.75
Johnson, Craig 10.25 214.00 2,193.50
Totals 35.25 6,015.00
Total Labor 6,015.00
Total this Task 6,015.00
Total this Phase 6,906.25
Phase 005 Research, Analysis, and Other Council Su
Professional Personnel
Hours Rate Amount
Caesar, Adrian 1.00 201.00 201.00
Johnson, Craig 4.25 214.00 909.50
Totals 5.25 1,110.50
Total Labor 1,110.50
Total this Phase 1,110.50
Phase 006 Administrative

Please Reference Our Invoice Number on your Payment

Page 3



Project 6320824- Rhode Island EERMC - 2024 Invoice 406631

0007590.00
Consultants
RACHEL SHOLLY 103.75
Total Consultants 103.75 103.75
Total this Phase 103.75
Phase 007 EERMC Intern
Additional Fees
Monthly Intern Fee March 2024 2,675.00
Total Additional Fees 2,675.00 2,675.00
Total this Phase 2,675.00
Billing Limits Current Prior To-Date
Total Billings 60,625.25 380,243.70 440,868.95
Limit 817,025.00
Remaining 376,156.05
Total this Invoice 60,625.25

Billings to Date

Current Prior Total
Labor 44,830.00 274,927.50 319,757.50
Consultant 13,120.25 88,570.45 101,690.70
Expense 0.00 3,370.75 3,370.75
Add-on 2,675.00 13,375.00 16,050.00
Totals 60,625.25 380,243.70 440,868.95

Please Reference Our Invoice Number on your Payment

Page 4



Project 6320824- Rhode Island EERMC - 2024 Invoice 406631

0007590.00
Bllllng BaCkUp Tuesday, September 17, 2024
NV5, Inc. Invoice 406631 Dated 9/17/2024 2:09:27 PM
Project 6320824-0007590.00 Rhode Island EERMC - 2024
Phase 001 EE Prg Planning & Implementation Oversig
Task 01 Council Representation
Professional Personnel

Hours Rate Amount
Caesar, Adrian 8/22/2024 2.00 201.00 402.00
August EE EWG and TWG Meetings

Galluzzo, Jordan 8/14/2024 .50 35.00 17.50

Attended the Rl Energy Efficiency Equity Working Group Agenda
Setting Meeting and took notes.

Galluzzo, Jordan 8/22/2024 1.50 35.00 52.50
Attended August EE EWG Meeting and took detailed notes.
Johnson, Craig 8/13/2024 1.00 214.00 214.00
Biweekly check-in with RIE/OER
Johnson, Craig 8/22/2024 1.00 214.00 214.00
EE TWG Meeting attendance.
Johnson, Craig 8/29/2024 1.00 214.00 214.00
Bi-weekly check-in with RIE and OER
Totals 7.00 1,114.00
Total Labor 1,114.00
Total this Task 1,114.00
Task 02 Implementation Oversight and Plan Develo
Professional Personnel
Hours Rate Amount
Caesar, Adrian 8/1/2024 7.25 201.00 1,457.25

C-Team working session - 2025 annual plan review prep, program
implementation updates and performance; August C&I sector
team call/prep; Internal EM&V check in - custom elec/gas site
reports, upcoming study deliverables, mercury ban impacts and
methodoloty; Heat Exchanger measure calcs and methodology;
corrected first draft 2025 Annual plan review - measure-level,
custom-prescriptive and end use savings/costs, actuals-plan
comps
Caesar, Adrian 8/2/2024 .50 201.00 100.50

2024 May Q2 program data analysis - program/sector and
portfolio savings and spending, YTD performance charts and
forecasts; EM&V study tracker updates

Please Reference Our Invoice Number on your Payment

Page 5



Project

6320824- Rhode Island EERMC - 2024
0007590.00

Invoice

406631

Caesar, Adrian 8/5/2024 3.75 201.00

2024 YTD program performance data review and analysis -
electric and gas portfolios, sector/program-level spending and

savings, year-end forecast extrapolation; 2025 Annual plan second

draft review - C-Team review coordination and distribution of
materials, initial electric and gas BCR Model review, program and
portfolio savings/spending and cost comparisons analysis

Caesar, Adrian 8/6/2024 3.50 201.00

C-Team working session - 2025 Annual Plan review, 2024 program

implementation updates and analysis; 2024 YTD data review and

questions for RIE; 2025 annual plan second draft analysis/review -

program/sector cost and savings comps, measure-level savings
distribution, cost-effectiveness analysis

Caesar, Adrian 8/7/2024 7.25 201.00

2025 annual plan second draft analysis/review - program/sector
cost and savings comps, measure-level savings distribution, cost-
effectiveness analysis, updated Main Text and RIE responses; C-
Team working session - 2025 Annual Plan review, 2024 program
implementation updates and analysis; EM&V study
review/coordination - electric heat market characterization draft
report

Caesar, Adrian 8/8/2024 7.50 201.00

C-Team working session - 2025 Annual Plan review; 2025 annual
plan second draft analysis/review - program/sector cost and
savings comps, measure-level savings and cost inputs, end use
and measure category plan vs. actual comps - savings, TRC and
incentive costs, lighting and gas equipment baseline assumptions;
RICE22N042 custom electric site report review

Caesar, Adrian 8/9/2024 2.00 201.00

C-Team working session - 2025 Annual plan narrative review and
program cost comps workbook; 2025 Annual Plan review - Main
Text redlines and RIE responses to C-Team comments

Caesar, Adrian 8/12/2024 5.00 201.00

2025 Second Draft Plan review/analysis - main text, C&I and EMV
attachments, RIE responses to CTeam comments, C-Team
comments memo development, Elec/Gas cost inputs and baseline
assumptions review

Caesar, Adrian 8/13/2024 4.00 201.00

2025 Second Draft Plan review/analysis - C&I, Resi, EMV, DPA
attachments, RIE responses to CTeam comments, C-Team
comments memo development, RIE responses to CTeam narrative
comments, Elec/Gas cost inputs and baseline assumptions review,
cross-jurisdictional measure input comps and working session - RI
and MA BC models

Caesar, Adrian 8/14/2024 5.00 201.00

753.75

703.50

1,457.25

1,507.50

402.00

1,005.00

804.00

1,005.00

Please Reference Our Invoice Number on your Payment

Page 6



Project 6320824-
0007590.00

Rhode Island EERMC - 2024

Invoice

406631

EMRV study tracker review and C&I EM&V call; review of RIE
responses to C-Team Plan comments - Main text, Res and C&I
attachments, EM&V plan, data-related questions; measure-level
plan data analysis - savings inputs and impact factors, TRC and
incentive deltas, CTA comps; cross-jurisdictional measure input

comps and QA - RI and MA BCR model mapping and TRM source

review. EWG agenda development meeting and follow-up list of

agenda topics for August EWG mtg.
Caesar, Adrian 8/15/2024

2025 Annual Plan analysis and C-Team working sessions - review

5.75

201.00

of RIE responses to C-Team first draft comments, measure-level
cost and impacts review/comps, cross-jurisdictional C&I/Res
measure cost and savings comps, TRC, incentive, and BCR calcs

review
Caesar, Adrian 8/19/2024

7.50

201.00

RIE Q2 Report review; 2025 annual plan analysis and review -
Main Text, Res and C&I program attachments, equity-focused
comments on 2025 narrative, measure-level inputs and impact

factors, TRM-BCR model comps analysis; RICE/RICG22 site report

and comment responses review; RICE PY23 sample
design/condenser coil savings methodology memo review and
discussion - compressor coil cleaning and treatment of NC

measures in sample strata; C&I team comments on second draft

and comment memo development
Caesar, Adrian 8/20/2024

8.25

201.00

2025 annual plan analysis and working sessions - measure-level
impact factor and calcs deltas, TRM-BCR comparisons and
questions for RIE, total resource cost and incentive changes,

program cost category comps, review of repsonses to data-related
questions, summary of narrative comments and flags for C&I/EMV
teams, BCR model formula QA/QC - impact factor/NTG

applications to TRC/savings, non energy impacts; updated
moderate-income survey instrument review and comments

Caesar, Adrian 8/21/2024

C&lI-focused comments Memo on the 2025 Annual Plan Narrative
Second Draft; Equity Working Group coordination - review of RIE

1.75

201.00

responses to July EWG follow-up questions; EM&V study tracker

updates; RICEPY2023 custom impact evaluation follow up call and

NC project analysis review
Caesar, Adrian 8/22/2024

3.25

201.00

August EWG materials review - Year 4 EWG report; 2025 annual
plan review - attachments 5-8 review and comments, program
cost category comps, updated TRM-BCR mapping and comps,
measure-level impacts QA/QC, plan data-related questions and

responses from first draft
Caesar, Adrian 8/30/2024

2.75

201.00

2025 annual plan analysis - mercury ban and lighting measure

impacts, additional questions for RIE on plan assumptions; EM&V

study review/coordination - RICE/RICG PY22 impact evaluation

draft results and report review, RICE2023 updated sample design

memo
Galluzzo, Jordan 8/1/2024

3.00

35.00

1,155.75

1,507.50

1,658.25

351.75

653.25

552.75

105.00

Please Reference Our Invoice Number on your Payment
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Project 6320824- Rhode Island EERMC - 2024
0007590.00

Invoice

406631

Updated RI Electric & Gas Program Level Comps workbook for
impending second draft BC Model numbers.

Galluzzo, Jordan 8/6/2024 5.75 35.00
Updated RI Electric & Gas Program Level Comps workbook with
second draft BC Model numbers. Updated Lifetime Measure
Savings Comps workbook with second draft Plan BC Model
numbers, implemented comparisons of first and second draft
numbers.

Galluzzo, Jordan 8/7/2024 2.00 35.00
Internal working session - discussed 2025 Second Draft Plan Main
Text review task. 2025 Second Draft Plan Review - Assessed
degree of responsiveness of the Company to C-Team comments,
noted where changes were made to address comments and
where changes are still needed.

Galluzzo, Jordan 8/8/2024 7.50 35.00
Internal working session - discussed 2025 Plan Second Draft
review. 2025 Second Draft Plan Review - Continued assessing
degree of responsiveness of the Company to C-Team comments,
noted where changes were made to address comments and
where changes are still needed. Updated 2025 Plan Cost Category
Comparisons workbook with 2025 Plan Second Draft BC Model
numbers, updated cost category comparisons to reference
second draft numbers, updated comparison charts to include
second draft numbers.

Galluzzo, Jordan 8/9/2024 3.00 35.00
Internal working session - discussed 2025 Second Draft Plan
review and created a workbook to track consultant comments.
2025 Second Draft Plan review - tracked consultant comments in
Plan Main Text.

Galluzzo, Jordan 8/12/2024 5.50 35.00
Internal working sessions - discussed progress on 2025 Second
Draft Plan review and next steps. 2025 Second Draft Plan review
- Continued tracking consultant comments in Plan Main Text,
tracked consultant comments in Attachment 2, tracked
consultant comments in Attachment 4.

Galluzzo, Jordan 8/13/2024 1.00 35.00
Finalized 2025 Plan Second Draft Comments Tracker.

Galluzzo, Jordan 8/15/2024 3.50 35.00
Internal working sessions - reviewed planned analysis for 2025
TRM Total Resource Cost Incentive Coverage Analysis. 2025 Plan
Total Resource Cost Incentive Coverage Analysis - created Electric
Measure Deltas analysis, implemented program and sector-level
total resource cost and incentive pivot tables for electric and gas,
implemented program & sector level % total resource cost
coverage tables for electric and gas.

Galluzzo, Jordan 8/19/2024 4.00 35.00

Updated 2025 TRM BCR Model Comps workbook with second draft
Electric and Gas BCR Models and second draft TRM.

201.25

70.00

262.50

105.00

192.50

35.00

122.50

140.00

Please Reference Our Invoice Number on your Payment
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Project 6320824- Rhode Island EERMC - 2024 Invoice 406631
0007590.00

Galluzzo, Jordan 8/20/2024 7.50 35.00 262.50

Internal working session - reviewed all 2025 Plan review analysis
work and discussed next steps where applicable. Began creating
2025 Plan Measure Impacts Comps workbook to assess changes in
all measure level impacts from the 2025 3YP to the 2025 Annual
Plan (Second Draft).
Galluzzo, Jordan 8/21/2024 4.00 35.00 140.00
Internal working session - discussed progress on 2025 Plan
Review. Continued work on the 2025 Plan Measure Impacts

Comps workbook to assess changes in all measure level impacts
from the 2025 3YP to the 2025 Annual Plan (Second Draft).

Johnson, Andrew 8/2/2024 1.50 201.00 301.50
Review of RI energy heat customer characterization Report
Johnson, Andrew 8/6/2024 2.50 201.00 502.50

Electric Heat Characterization Study review and comment
consolidation

Johnson, Andrew 8/8/2024 2.50 201.00 502.50
PY2022 Custom Electric and Gas Site Reports review and
comments

Johnson, Andrew 8/12/2024 1.00 201.00 201.00
Review team comments on Electric Heat Characterization Study

Johnson, Andrew 8/13/2024 1.50 201.00 301.50
Pipe wrap site project review

Johnson, Andrew 8/14/2024 1.50 201.00 301.50
Monthly C&I EM&YV team call.

Johnson, Andrew 8/19/2024 3.00 201.00 603.00
RICE2023 Sample Design Memo Review Meeting and Emails

Johnson, Andrew 8/28/2024 2.00 201.00 402.00
Monthly Residential EM&V team call.

Johnson, Craig 8/6/2024 .50 214.00 107.00

2025 Plan Second Draft - working session with team to outline
review tasks and assignments to kick off second draft review.
Johnson, Craig 8/7/2024 .25 214.00 53.50
2025 Plan Second Draft - discussion with Adrian on review
progress and timeline, review program comps workbook to begin
assessing high level changes from first draft to second draft.

Johnson, Craig 8/12/2024 4.75 214.00 1,016.50
EM&YV - review team comments on electric heat characterization
study. EWG - review e-mail traffic re: EWG next steps, timeline
for first draft of working group report; coordinate with internal
team re: agenda for next EWG meeting. Res Sector Team - Follow
up/prep for Wednesday sector team call. 2025 2nd Draft Plan
Review - Working session with Analise on MA program comps
updates, working session with Adrian to review high-level
program updates, review and monitor team work on plan review
and timeline. Begin review of 2nd draft narrative materials.
Johnson, Craig 8/13/2024 1.00 214.00 214.00
2025 Plan review - quick skim of main text to highlight and pull
out key updates made from first draft to second.

Please Reference Our Invoice Number on your Payment Page 9



Project 6320824-
0007590.00

Rhode Island EERMC - 2024

Invoice

406631

Johnson, Craig 8/14/2024

5.25

214.00

2025 Plan Review - review key narrative and quantitative

feedback at portfolio and C&l levels with Adrian. Continue review

of Main Text and Residential Attachments, including review of

redlines and comment responses from RIE team, work on pulling
out top level items for follow-up with Council. Draft assignments

for Matt, Griff, and Cliff re: Rl Test, BC Model, and Rate and Bill
Impact review. EWG - coordination with internal team re:

coverage and goals for EWG agenda setting meeting. Res Sector
Team - monthly sector team meeting, associated meeting prep.

Johnson, Craig 8/15/2024

5.25

214.00

2025 Plan - Continue read through of second draft Main text,
focus on RIE responses, assessing responsiveness, and framing

out follow-up questions and items.
Johnson, Craig 8/16/2024

2025 Plan - Continue read through of second draft Main text and

6.50

214.00

framing out follow-up questions and items. Begin second read

through Residential text and work on assessing responsiveness to

first draft questions, begin framing up follow-up questions.

Johnson, Craig 8/19/2024

2025 Plan Draft 2 - Continue review of Main Text and Residential

5.00

214.00

attachments, including focus on equity content, income eligible

programs, and multifamily programs. Review team comments and

send compiled comments to RIE for early review. Review RI/MA
comps analysis, coordinate next steps with Annalise.

Johnson, Craig 8/20/2024

3.00

214.00

2025 Plan Draft 2 - Review comments on main text and res

attachments specific to IE and mf programs from Glenn, Richard,
and Margie. Continue own review of Main Text and attachments.

Working session with Adrian and Jordan, review quantitative

analyses, including program level comps, BCR/TRM comps, non-

incentive spend analysis, and TRC/Incentive coverage analysis.
Discussed preliminary findings and established next steps.

Johnson, Craig 8/21/2024

6.00

214.00

EWG - coordinate with internal team re: meeting

attendance tomorrow, review pre-read materials. 2025

Plan - Continue and complete final read through of
Main Text, including reviewing RIE responses to C-

Team comments on first draft, adding follow up
questions, and adding new comments on sections and

content that were not in previous draft.
Johnson, Craig 8/22/2024

6.25

214.00

1,123.50

1,123.50

1,391.00

1,070.00

642.00

1,284.00

1,337.50

Please Reference Our Invoice Number on your Payment
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Project 6320824- Rhode Island EERMC - 2024
0007590.00

Invoice

406631

2025 Plan - Complete narrative review, including Res
Attachment, Definitions, Cross-Program, Rl Test, and
EMV attachments. Final review of RIE responses to
data questions on first draft, assess need for follow up,
draft follow ups and new questions. Review measure
comps analysis, draft new questions about unexpected
changes. Review Glenn data related questions, merge
documents. Review TRM Database update. Review
RIE updated website, including links and layout of EE
program offerings, begin assembling feedback and
share with team internally.

Johnson, Craig 8/23/2024 3.00 214.00
2025 Plan - Discuss Rate/Bill impacts with Cliff. Final
review and merge of c-team comments on Res
attachment and Main Text. Coordinate final deliverable
process and timeline with Adrian.

Keating, Griffith 8/13/2024 .50 201.00
Discussion with Annalise re:RI Measure comparison

Keating, Griffith 8/15/2024 .25 201.00
Review of TRM referenced material

Keating, Griffith 8/16/2024 1.00 201.00
Measure comparison discussion with Annalise

Socks, Matthew 8/22/2024 1.50 229.00
Performing updated 2025 plan and Attachment 4 review.

Socks, Matthew 8/23/2024 .50 229.00
Reviewing draft BCR models for implementation of AESC 2024.

Stein, Annalise 8/8/2024 2.50 173.00
Analyzed and compared measures across Rhode Island and
Massachusetts for Rhode Island's second draft of BCR models.

Stein, Annalise 8/12/2024 3.00 173.00
Reviewed second draft of BCR models and analyzed Rhode Island
against Massachusetts. Reviewed underlying assumptions for
Residential and Income Eligible measures between Rhode Island
and Massachusetts for incentives and savings.

Stein, Annalise 8/13/2024 2.00 173.00
Reviewed second draft of BCR models and analyzed Rhode Island
against Massachusetts. Updated analysis for Commercial and
Industrial sector by normalizing measures by savings.

Stein, Annalise 8/14/2024 2.00 173.00
Reviewed second draft of BCR models and analyzed Rhode Island
against Massachusetts. Reviewed measures to ensure
consistency across initiatives for each measure in the Residential,
Income Eligible, and Commercial and Industrial sectors for Rhode
Island and Massachusetts

Stein, Annalise 8/15/2024 3.50 173.00

642.00

100.50

50.25

201.00

343.50

114.50

432.50

519.00

346.00

346.00

605.50

Please Reference Our Invoice Number on your Payment
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Project 6320824- Rhode Island EERMC - 2024 Invoice 406631
0007590.00
Reviewed second draft of BCR models and analyzed Rhode Island
against Massachusetts. Updated gas analysis for Residential,
Income Eligible, and Commercial and Industrial sectors using
Adjsted Gross Lifetime Gas Savings (MMBtu). Searched for source
workbook RI_2022 Annual PLan Electric H&C Savings
Workbook_06-14-2021 tied to multiple measures. Reviewed
workbook information for applicable measures.
Stein, Annalise 8/16/2024 2.00 173.00 346.00
Reviewed second draft of BCR models and analyzed Rhode Island
against Massachusetts. Normalized gas and electric measures on
a per ton basis and per unit basis for each sector, Residential,
Income Eligible, and Commercial and Industrial.
Stein, Annalise 8/19/2024 1.50 173.00 259.50
Reviewed the assumptions for the 2025 planned Residential and
Income Eligible measures, specifically for the residential gas
programmable thermostat and the income eligible electric
refrigerator replacement.
Totals 204.25 33,495.50
Total Labor 33,495.50
Total this Task 41,864.00
Task 03 Education Initiatives
Professional Personnel
Hours Rate Amount
Caesar, Adrian 8/21/2024 .50 201.00 100.50
C-Team working session - Pivot Path updates, EE and climate
awareness campaign messaging
Galluzzo, Jordan 8/28/2024 1.50 35.00 52.50
Attended 8/28 EC4 Advisory Board Meeting and took detailed
notes for EEC Newsletter.
Galluzzo, Jordan 8/29/2024 .50 35.00 17.50
Began writing August 22 EE EWG meeting write-up for September
EEC Newsletter.
Galluzzo, Jordan 8/30/2024 1.00 35.00 35.00
Continued writing August 2 EE EWG meeting write-up for
September EEC Newsletter.
Johnson, Craig 8/21/2024 .50 214.00 107.00
Check-in with Rachel on Council education items,
including PivotPath EE Climate Awareness campaign
work and upcoming planning activities for URI lecture
series.
Johnson, Craig 8/22/2024 1.00 214.00 214.00
Bi-weekly check-in with PivotPath on EE & Climate
Awareness campaign work.
Johnson, Craig 8/29/2024 .50 214.00 107.00

Please Reference Our Invoice Number on your Payment
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Project 6320824- Rhode Island EERMC - 2024 Invoice 406631

0007590.00
Call with Steve and Rachel to review and discuss vendor payments
Totals 5.50 633.50
Total Labor 633.50
Total this Task 5,281.50
Total this Phase 48,259.50
Phase 002 System Reliability Procurement
Task 01 Council Representation
Professional Personnel
Hours Rate Amount
Johnson, Craig 8/21/2024 1.25 214.00 267.50
SRP TWG meeting attendance
McDonald, Cliff 8/21/2024 1.25 229.00 286.25
SRP, TWG meeting attendance
Totals 2.50 553.75
Total Labor 553.75
Total this Task 553.75
Task 02 Plan Development and Oversight
Professional Personnel
Hours Rate Amount
Johnson, Craig 8/21/2024 25 214.00 53.50

Review SRP TWG meeting agenda, prep and
coordination with Cliff re: same

Totals .25 53.50
Total Labor 53.50
Total this Task 53.50
Total this Phase 607.25
Phase 003 Regulatory Proceedings
Task 01 Council Representation
Professional Personnel
Hours Rate Amount
Johnson, Craig 8/27/2024 4.50 214.00 963.00
Attend Future of Gas Docket Stakeholder Meeting (virtual
attendance)
Totals 4.50 963.00
Total Labor 963.00

Please Reference Our Invoice Number on your Payment
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Project 6320824- Rhode Island EERMC - 2024 Invoice 406631
0007590.00
Total this Task 963.00
Total this Phase 963.00
Phase 004 Council Sponsored Meetings and Materials
Task 01 Meeting Attendance
Professional Personnel
Hours Rate Amount
Caesar, Adrian 8/15/2024 2.00 201.00 402.00
August EEC mtg.
Galluzzo, Jordan 8/15/2024 1.75 35.00 61.25
Virtually attended August EEC Meeting and took notes.
Johnson, Craig 8/15/2024 2.00 214.00 428.00
August Council meeting attendance.
Totals 5.75 891.25
Total Labor 891.25
Total this Task 891.25
Task 02 Develop Technical Materials
Professional Personnel
Hours Rate Amount
Caesar, Adrian 8/2/2024 .25 201.00 50.25
August EEC mtg. materials development/planning - program
implementation updates, 2025 Annual Plan updates
Caesar, Adrian 8/5/2024 2.00 201.00 402.00
August EEC mtg. materials development - EEC budget memo,
2024 program implementation updates
Caesar, Adrian 8/6/2024 3.50 201.00 703.50
August EEC mtg. materials development - EEC budget memo,
potential MPS spending for 2025, 2024 program implementation
updates, 2025 annual plan review
Caesar, Adrian 8/7/2024 2.75 201.00 552.75
C-Team Working session - August EEC mtg. materials
development - 2025 EEC budget memo and 2024 forecasts,
potential MPS spending for 2025, 2025 annual plan review, EEC
calendar
Caesar, Adrian 8/8/2024 3.00 201.00 603.00
C-Team Working sessions - August EEC mtg. materials
development - 2025 annual plan review, 2024 program
implementation updates; RIE working session - 2024 program
data QA/QC and implementation presentation development
Caesar, Adrian 8/10/2024 2.25 201.00 452.25

August EEC mtg. materials development - 2025 EEC budget memo

and 2024 forecasts, 2025 annual plan review, 2024 program
implementation deck

Please Reference Our Invoice Number on your Payment
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Project 6320824- Rhode Island EERMC - 2024

Invoice 406631

0007590.00

Caesar, Adrian 8/12/2024 1.75 201.00 351.75
August EEC mtg materials development/finalization - Council
budget memo and presentation, 2024 program implementation
updates, 2025 Second Draft Annual Plan review, RIE plan updates

Caesar, Adrian 8/13/2024 1.00 201.00 201.00
August EEC mtg materials development/finalization - Council
budget memo and presentation, 2025 Second Draft Annual Plan
review, Briefing memo

Caesar, Adrian 8/14/2024 .75 201.00 150.75
C-Team Working Session/August EEC mtg. prep and 2025 Plan
deck finalization

Caesar, Adrian 8/15/2024 .50 201.00 100.50
August EEC mtg. prep

Galluzzo, Jordan 8/1/2024 .50 35.00 17.50
Internal working session - discussed potential tasks for next week
assisting with the development of meeting materials for the
August EEC Meeting.

Galluzzo, Jordan 8/2/2024 .25 35.00 8.75
Internal working session - discussed progress and assignments for
developing August EEC Meeting materials.

Galluzzo, Jordan 8/6/2024 1.25 35.00 43.75
Internal working sessions - discussed progress and assignments
for developing August EEC meeting materials. Assist development
plan review materials.

Galluzzo, Jordan 8/7/2024 3.50 35.00 122.50
Inserted updated tables and graphs with 2025 Annual Plan
Second Draft data into the 2025 Annual Plan Second Draft
Presentation. Internal working session - discussed progress in
developing August EEC Meeting materials. Reviewed August EEC
Calendar deck.

Galluzzo, Jordan 8/12/2024 .25 35.00 8.75
Updated EEC Calendar Deck with EE EWG meeting 6 date.

Galluzzo, Jordan 8/13/2024 .50 35.00 17.50
Internal working session - discussed progress and next steps on
August EEC Meeting materials.

Galluzzo, Jordan 8/14/2024 .50 35.00 17.50
Internal working session - discussed progress and next steps on
August EEC Meeting materials.

Galluzzo, Jordan 8/15/2024 .50 35.00 17.50
Internal working session - discussed August EEC Meeting
materials.

Johnson, Craig 8/6/2024 .50 214.00 107.00
August Council Materials - Working session with team to review
updates on timing and assignments for materials.

Johnson, Craig 8/7/2024 .25 214.00 53.50
August Council Materials - working session with team to review
latest updates on development of materials

Johnson, Craig 8/8/2024 .50 214.00 107.00

Please Reference Our Invoice Number on your Payment
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Project 6320824- Rhode Island EERMC - 2024 Invoice 406631
0007590.00

August Council Materials - Review draft 2025 Plan 2nd draft deck,
provide comments for team to work on addressing.
Johnson, Craig 8/12/2024 2.25 214.00 481.50
August Council Materials - Review and iterate on Council budget
proposal memo and slide deck, develop content for first draft of
C-Team plan review update, review, edit, and finalize 2024
program implementation update deck. Coordinate with RIE re:
materials for Gas DR Plan update.
Johnson, Craig 8/13/2024 3.75 214.00 802.50
August Council materials - check-in with team to track progress
on material development, outline next steps to finalizing
materials. Reviewed draft materials for 2025 plan update
presentation and continue work on developing content. Review
and finalize EEC Calendar update. Review Adrian draft of briefing
memo, edits and additional content development, finalize
material. Budget proposal - review memo and presentation, edits
and develop additional content accordingly, finalize materials.
Johnson, Craig 8/14/2024 2.25 214.00 481.50
August Meeting Materials - working session with team to review
presentation roles for meeting tomorrow. Work on content
updates for 2025 Plan update presentation, including high level
takeaways, updates from issues flagged on first draft, and
res/income eligible sector highlights.

Johnson, Craig 8/15/2024 .75 214.00 160.50
August Council Materials - prep talking points for meeting
Totals 35.25 6,015.00
Total Labor 6,015.00
Total this Task 6,015.00
Total this Phase 6,906.25
Phase 005 Research, Analysis, and Other Council Su
Professional Personnel
Hours Rate Amount
Caesar, Adrian 8/13/2024 1.00 201.00 201.00
C-Team EEC Councilor briefing call - SA and PGC
Johnson, Craig 8/12/2024 1.25 214.00 267.50

Councilor briefings - coordinate with Harry, Priscilla, Sue, and
Peter re: pre-August meeting briefings. Stakeholder meeting -
coordinate with Sue and Emily re: LCP/Statute review.

Johnson, Craig 8/13/2024 1.25 214.00 267.50
Councilor briefing with Sue and Peter; prep and debrief.
Johnson, Craig 8/14/2024 .50 214.00 107.00

Working session with stakeholders to review and discuss LCP Law
and Act on Climate.

Please Reference Our Invoice Number on your Payment Page 16



Project 6320824- Rhode Island EERMC - 2024

Invoice 406631

0007590.00
Johnson, Craig 8/19/2024 1.00 214.00 214.00
Stakeholder briefing and check-in on plan review with
Acadia Center.
Johnson, Craig 8/29/2024 .25 214.00 53.50
Check-in call with Stakeholder Emily Koo from Acadia Center
Totals 5.25 1,110.50
Total Labor 1,110.50
Total this Phase 1,110.50
Phase 006 Administrative
Total this Phase 103.75
Total this Project 57,950.25
Total this Report 57,950.25

Please Reference Our Invoice Number on your Payment
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Margie Lynch/Core Energy Insights, Inc.

4445 E. Hoback River Road, Jackson, WY 83001

TO : Optimal Energy Inc.
10600 Route 116, Suite 3

INVOICE

Invoice Number: CEl RI 8-2024
Invoice Date: September 1, 2024

Hinesburg, VT 05461 OEIl Project #: 7525
Work Performed for RI Energy Efficiency Council
Description of Services Amount
Services Performed 08/01/24 through 08/31/24
Hours Hourly Rate Amount Due
LABOR - Regular Hours 4.50 $199.00 $895.50
LABOR - Travel Hours 0.00 $99.50 $0.00

Travel Expenses
(See attached travel expense form for details.)

TOTAL DUE

$0.00

$895.50




Margie Lynch/Core Energy Insights, Inc.

Services Performed 08/01/24 through 08/31/24

001 - EE Program Planning & Implementation

001-02
Implementation 005-00
001-01 Oversight & 001-03 Research, Sub-Total | Sub-Total
Council Plan Education Analysis & other 006-00 Regular Travel Total
Date Description of Services Representation | Development Initiatives Council Support| Administrative | Travel Time Hrs. Hrs. Hours
Participated in Equity Working Group planning meeting;
8/14/24 |participated in Res Sector Team meeting 1.50 0.00 0.00 0.00
8/19/24 |Reviewed and commented on draft 2025 plan 1.50 1.50 0.00 1.50
Continued draft 2025 plan review; reviewed and commented on
8/21/2024]draft EWG report 1.50 1.50 0.00 1.50
1.50 0.00 1.50
Total Hours 0.00 4.50 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 4.50 0.00 4.50
Total Amount $0.00 $895.50 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $895.50 0.00 | $895.50




Energy Futures Group, Inc.
PO Box 587
Hinesburg, VT 05461

INVOICE
TO : Optimal Energy Inc. Invoice Number: 6476
10600 Route 116, Suite 3 Invoice Date: September 9, 2024
Hinesburg, VT 05461 OEI Project #: 7590

Work Performed for RI Energy Efficiency & Resource Management Council

Description of Services Amount

Services Performed 8/1/2024 through 8/31/2024

Hours Hourly Rate Amount Due
LABOR - Regular Hours 10.25 $212.00 $2,173.00
LABOR - Travel Hours 0.00 $106.00 $0.00
Travel Expenses $0.00

(See attached travel expense form for details.)

TOTAL DUE $2,173.00



Energy Futures Group, Inc.

Services Performed 8/1/2024 through 8/31/2024

001 - EE Program Planning & Implementation

001-02
Implementation 005-00
001-01 Oversight & 001-03 Research, Sub-Total | Sub-Total
Council Plan Education Analysis & other 006-00 Regular Travel Total
Date Description of Services Representation | Development Initiatives Council Support] Administrative | Travel Time Hrs. Hrs. Hours
8/14/2024|Res Sector monthly call. 1.00 0.00 0.00 0.00
8/19/2024]Plan review and comments. 3.00 1.00 0.00 1.00
8/20/2024|Review and provide comments on RIE 2025 draft plan (C&l) and associated data 2.00 3.00 0.00 3.00
8/21/2024]Finish comments on 2nd draft of AP 1.50 2.00 0.00 2.00
8/21/2024]Plan review and comments. 1.50 1.50 0.00 1.50
8/23/2024|Emails re: plan review; review lighting assumptions and provide comments to Adrian 1.25 1.50 0.00 1.50
1.25 0.00 1.25
0.00 0.00 0.00
Total Hours 0.00 10.25 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 10.25 0.00 10.25
Total Amount $0.00 $2,173.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00] $2,173.00 0.00 | $2,173.00




GDR Consulting
576 Rutland St
Carlisle MA 01741

INVOICE
TO : Optimal Energy Inc. Invoice Number: 8R
10600 Route 116, Suite 3 Invoice Date: September 5, 2024
Hinesburg, VT 05461 OEIl Project #: 7590

Work Performed for RI Energy Efficiency & Resource Management Council

Description of Services Amount

Services Performed 8/1/24 through 8/31/24

Hours Hourly Rate Amount Due
LABOR - Regular Hours 13.50 $212.00 $2,862.00
LABOR - Travel Hours 0.00 $106.00 $0.00
Travel Expenses $0.00

(See attached travel expense form for details.)

TOTAL DUE $2,862.00



GDR Consulting

Services Performed 8/1/24 through 8/31/24

001 - EE Program Planning & Implementation

001-02 005-00
001-01 Implementation 001-03 Research, Sub-Total
Council Oversight & Plan Education Analysis & other 006-00 Regular | Sub-Total Total
Date Description of Services Representation | Development Initiatives Council Support| Administrative | Travel Time Hrs. |Travel Hrs. Hours
8/5/2024 |Review of Electric Heat Characterization Study 1.00 1.00 0.00 1.00
Continued review of Electric Heat Characterization Study and
review of prior RASS data on electric heat saturation. Circulate
8/6/2024 linternal comments 1.50 1.50 0.00 1.50
Complete review of Electric Heat Characterization Study. Email
8/9/2024 |with summary comments 1.00 1.00 0.00 1.00
Review of proposed Rl and IECC energy code changes. Share
8/12/2024 |summary info with Consultant Team 0.50 0.50 0.00 0.50
8/14/2024 |Attend monthly Residential & IE sector team call 1.00 1.00 0.00 1.00
8/19/2024 |Review and comments on revised EM&V and DPA Plan text 0.75 0.75 0.00 0.75
Review and comments on revised Residential Plan text, Draft and
8/18/2024 |provide summary comments 1.75 1.75 0.00 1.75
Review and comments on Ml WTP survey. Review of EW-SF Wx
8/20/2024 |costs in BCR model 1.25 1.25 0.00 1.25
8/21/2024 |Review of revised savings and budget numbers and BCR models 2.00 2.00 0.00 2.00
Complete review and comments on savings and budget numbers
8/22/2024 |of BCR model. Confirm publication of IECC 2024 2.25 2.25 0.00 2.25
8/28/2024 |Participate in monthly Residential EM&V call 0.50 0.50 0.00 0.50
Total Hours 0.00 13.50 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 13.50 0.00 13.50
Total Amount $0.00 $2,862.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00] $2,862.00 0.00 | $2,862.00




Ralph Prahl
7001 Stanhope Place, University Park FL 34201

INVOICE
TO : Optimal Energy Inc. Invoice Number: 54
10600 Route 116, Suite 3 Invoice Date: September 1, 2024
Hinesburg, VT 05461 OEI Project #: 7590

Work Performed for RI Energy Efficiency & Resource Management Council

Description of Services Amount

Services Performed 8/01/24 through 8/31/24

Hours Hourly Rate Amount Due
LABOR - Regular Hours 11.50 $212.00 $2,438.00
LABOR - Travel Hours 0.00 $106.00 $0.00
Travel Expenses $0.00

(See attached travel expense form for details.)

TOTAL DUE $2,438.00



Ralph Prahl
Services Performed 8/01/24 through 8/31/24

001 - EE Program Planning & Implementation
001-02
Implementation
001-01 Oversight & 001-03 Sub-Total
Council Plan Education Sub-Total Travel

Date Description of Services Representation | Development Initiatives Regular Hrs. Hrs. Total Hours
8/1/2024]electric heat characterization report 0.25 0.25 0.00 0.00
8/2/2024|electric heat characterization report 2.25 2.25 0.00 0.25
8/4/2024|electric heat characterization report 2.00 2.00 0.00 2.25
8/5/2024electric heat characterization report 0.25 0.25 0.00 2.00
8/6/2024|electric heat characterization report 0.50 0.50 0.00 0.25
8/11/2024|ERH report; 2025 eval plan 1.00 1.00 0.00 0.50
8/14/2024|C&I studies check-in call 0.75 0.00 0.00 1.00
8/16/2024]1E impact eval 0.25 0.75 0.00 0.75

ev pl; C&lI custom electric sampling issue conf call;

8/19/2024|moderate income study; eval plan 2.25 0.25 0.00 0.25
8/20/2024]2025 ev pl; C&I custom electric impact eval 0.75 2.25 0.00 2.25
8/21/2024]C&I custom electric impact eval — conf call 0.75 0.75 0.00 0.75
8/23/2024]1E impact eval 0.25 0.75 0.00 0.75
8/24/2024]2025 plan 0.25 0.25 0.00 0.25
0.25 0.00 0.25
0.00 0.00 0.00
Total Hours 0.00 11.50 0.00 11.50 0.00 11.50
Total Amount $0.00 $2,438.00 $0.00 $2,438.00 0.00 $2,438.00




Rachel Sholly
48 Hudson Street, Providence, Rl 02909

INVOICE
TO : Optimal Energy Inc. Invoice Number: 80
10600 Route 116, Suite 3 Invoice Date: September 4, 2024
Hinesburg, VT 05461 OEIl Project #: 7590

Work Performed for RI Energy Efficiency & Resource Management Council

Description of Services Amount

Services Performed 8/01/2024 through 8/31/2024

Hours Hourly Rate Amount Due
LABOR - Regular Hours 28.00 $166.00 $4,648.00
LABOR - Admin Hours 1.25 $83.00 $103.75
LABOR - Travel Hours 0.00 $83.00 $0.00
Travel Expenses $0.00

(See attached travel expense form for details.)

TOTAL DUE $4,751.75



Rachel Sholly

Services Performed 8/01/2024 through 8/31/2024

001 - EE Program Planning &
Implementation

004 - Council Sponsored Meetings & Materials

001-02 004-02 005-00
Implementation | _ 001-03 004-01 Develop 00403 1 Research, 006-00 Sub-Total | o Total | Sub-Total | Total
Oversight & Education Meeting R Other Council . .. . Regular .
L Technical .. ..... _|Analysis & other| Administrative Travel Hrs.|Admin Hrs.| Hours
Plan Initiatives Attendance Materials Responsibilities Council Support Hrs.
Date Description of Services Development
08/01/24 |Finalized & sent edu sections of budget memo 0.75 0.75 0.00 0.00 0.75
Revisited Councilor feedback on URI proposal & shared
thoughts w/URI; Sent EdComm agenda & materials; Mtg
08/02/24 |prep correspondence w/PivotPath 1.00 1.00 0.00 0.00 1.00
08/05/24 |EdComm mtg, incl prep 1.50 1.50 0.00 0.00 1.50
C-team planning re: mtg materials; Reviewed July
PivotPath invoice, related correspondence, updated
invoice tracker; Reviewed revised URI proposal &
08/07/24 |budget; Updated budget slides & memo 2.50 2.50 0.00 0.00 2.50
08/08/24 |Biweekly check-in w/PivotPath 0.25 0.25 0.00 0.00 0.25
08/13/24 |Reviewed/edited briefing memo, related correspondence 0.75 0.75 0.00 0.00 0.75
C-team planning re: council mtg prep - budget,
08/14/24 |education; EWG agenda setting mtg 1.00 1.00 0.00 0.00 1.00
08/15/24 |EEC mtg - edu budget, URI proposal 1.00 1.00 0.00 0.00 1.00
Public Awareness Campaign RFP vendor debrief w/NJA
08/16/24 | & follow-up 0.75 0.75 0.00 0.00 0.75
Reviewed & sent feedback on new creative concepts
from PivotPath; Correspondence w/URI re: lecture
08/20/24 |series, 2025 proposal 1.50 1.50 0.00 0.00 1.50
C-team planning re: edu activities; Reviewed new RIE
08/21/24 |website; Requested IES program info from RIE 1.75 1.75 0.00 0.00 1.75
Correspondence & prep for PivotPath biweekly check-in,
Read IES section of plan; PivotPath biweekly check-in &
08/22/24 [follow-up; Reviewed EWG pre-read materials, EWG mtg 4.00 4.00 0.00 0.00 4.00
Reviewed IES materials provided by RIE to inform public
08/23/24 |awareness campaign feedback & copy editing 0.75 0.75 0.00 0.00 0.75
EEC website updates; IES background; Marketing copy
08/26/24 |brainstorm & graphic mockup 3.75 1.25 3.75 0.00 1.25 5.00
Internal marketing check-in, worked on copy & creative
08/27/24 |ideas 2.00 2.00 0.00 0.00 2.00
C-team planning re: edu activities, LEAD agenda;
Compiled draft marketing feedback, shared for internal
08/28/24 |review; URI invoicing recon & correspondence 2.75 2.75 0.00 0.00 2.75
C-team / OER check-in re: URI invoices, drafted email to
08/29/24 |URI; Correspondence re: PivotPath deliverables timeline 1.25 1.25 0.00 0.00 1.25
Drafted EdComm agenda, sent for internal review;
Correspondence w/URI re;: EdComm mtg & Councilor
08/31/24 |AnderBois re: agenda 0.75 0.75 0.00 0.00 0.75
Total Hours 0.00 28.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 1.25 28.00 0.00 1.25 29.25
Total Amount $0.00 $4,648.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $103.75] $4,648.00 $0.00| $103.75|$4,751.75




Handy Law LLC

42 Weybosset St
Providence, Rl 02903

seth@handylawllc.com

Mr. Steven Chybowski
Energy Efficiency Council
1 Capitol Hill, 4th Floor
Providence, Rl 02908

09/02/2024

09/05/2024

09/18/2024

09/19/2024

09/20/2024

09/23/2024

09/24/2024

09/25/2024

09/26/2024

09/30/2024

09/30/2024

Legal Services -
Connor MacDonald

Legal Services -
Connor MacDonald

Legal Services - Seth
Handy - EEC

Legal Services - Seth
Handy - EEC

Legal Services - Seth
Handy - EEC

Legal Services - Seth
Handy - EEC

Legal Services - Seth
Handy - EEC

Legal Services - Seth
Handy - EEC

Legal Services - Seth
Handy - EEC

Goodwill Discount

Overhead Markup

Review of upcoming EE
dockets, others which EEC
should consider intervening in

legislative touch-base

Read RIE's 2025 EE plan and
highlight

Read RIE's 2025 EE Plan and
prepare comments to Craig

Read exhibits to 2025 EE Plan;
Send Craig summary of
observations for discussion;
Correspondence

Read petition for gas demand
side management; Review
motion to intervene and
comment

Correspondence re gas demand
side management proposal

Correspondence; Prepare for
meeting

Review context memo and
comments in preparation for
meetings; Meet w client and
consultant; Attend council
meeting

Goodwill Discount

5% Service Charge

1:12

0:06

0:54

1:54

2:18

0:42

0:24

0:48

3:18

2,882.50

225.00

225.00

300.00

300.00

300.00

300.00

300.00

300.00

300.00

-500.00

0.05

2379
10/08/2024
Net 30
11/07/2024

270.00

22.50
270.00
570.00

690.00

210.00

120.00
240.00

990.00

-500.00
Subtotal: 2,882.50
144.13

$3,026.63



Routing Number: 123 456 789
Account Number: 8888888888
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Invoice O al

E NERGY
AN NW\S COMPANY

Remit checks to: Remit ACH transfer to: Remit Wire Transfers to:
Optimal Energy, LLC ABA Routing Number 063100277 ABA Routing Number 026009593
PO Box 74008680 Account Number 898052466590 Account Number 898052466590

Chicago, IL 60674-8680 Email ACH/Wire remittance details to Swift Code INTL. BOFAUS3N
RemittanceNotifications@nv5.com

Rhode Island Office of Energy Resources October 22, 2024
Project No: 6320824-0007590.00
Invoice No: 411895
Project 6320824-0007590.00 Rhode Island EERMC - 2024
Professional Services from September 1, 2024 to September 30, 2024 _ _ _ _ _ _ _ _ _ _ _____
Phase _ _ _ _ | 001 _ _ __ EE Prg Planning & Implementation Qversig _ _ _ _ _ _ _ _ _ _ _ _ _ _ ____
Task 01 Council Representation
Professional Personnel
Hours Rate Amount
Caesar, Adrian 1.50 201.00 301.50
Johnson, Craig 1.75 214.00 374.50
Totals 3.25 676.00
Total Labor 676.00
Total this Task 676.00
Task 02 Implementation Oversight and Plan Develo
Professional Personnel
Hours Rate Amount
Caesar, Adrian 68.75 201.00 13,818.75
Galluzzo, Jordan 19.00 35.00 665.00
Johnson, Andrew 12.00 201.00 2,412.00
Johnson, Craig 28.25 214.00 6,045.50
Totals 128.00 22,941.25
Total Labor 22,941.25
Consultants
GDR CONSULTING 901.00
JENNIFER L. CHIODO DBA: JLC CONSULTING 412.00
CORE ENERGY INSIGHTS INC. 199.00
ECOMETRIC CONSULTING, LLC 10,933.50

Please Reference Our Invoice Number on your Payment



Project 6320824- Rhode Island EERMC - 2024 Invoice 411895
0007590.00
ENERGY FUTURES GROUP, INC. 1,855.00
RALPH PRAHL 3,498.00
Total Consultants 17,798.50 17,798.50
Total this Task 40,739.75
Task 03 Education Initiatives
Professional Personnel
Hours Rate Amount
Caesar, Adrian .75 201.00 150.75
Galluzzo, Jordan 12.25 35.00 428.75
Johnson, Craig 3.25 214.00 695.50
Totals 16.25 1,275.00
Total Labor 1,275.00
Consultants
RACHEL SHOLLY 5,229.00
Total Consultants 5,229.00 5,229.00
Total this Task 6,504.00
Total this Phase 47,919.75
Phase _ _ _ _ | 002 _ ___ System Reliability Procurement _ _ _ _ _ _ _ _ _ _ _ _ _ _ _ __ __.
Task 01 Council Representation
Professional Personnel
Hours Rate Amount
McDonald, Clifford 2.00 229.00 458.00
Totals 2.00 458.00
Total Labor 458.00
Total this Task 458.00
Task 02 Plan Development and Oversight
Professional Personnel
Hours Rate Amount
Johnson, Craig 1.25 214.00 267.50
Totals 1.25 267.50
Total Labor 267.50
Total this Task 267.50
Total this Phase 725.50
Phase 003 Regulatory Proceedings

Develop Technical Materials

Please Reference Our Invoice Number on your Payment
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Project 6320824- Rhode Island EERMC - 2024 Invoice 411895
0007590.00
Professional Personnel
Hours Rate Amount
Caesar, Adrian .25 201.00 50.25
Johnson, Craig 5.75 214.00 1,230.50
Totals 6.00 1,280.75
Total Labor 1,280.75
Total this Task 1,280.75
Total this Phase 1,280.75
Phase _ _ _ _ | 004_ _ __ _ Council Sponsored Meetings and Materials _ _ _ _ _ _ _ _ _ _ _ _ __.
Task 01 Meeting Attendance
Professional Personnel
Hours Rate Amount
Caesar, Adrian 4.00 201.00 804.00
Galluzzo, Jordan 2.00 35.00 70.00
Johnson, Craig 5.00 214.00 1,070.00
Totals 11.00 1,944.00
Total Labor 1,944.00
Total this Task 1,944.00
Task 02 Develop Technical Materials
Professional Personnel
Hours Rate Amount
Caesar, Adrian 23.00 201.00 4,623.00
Galluzzo, Jordan 5.75 35.00 201.25
Johnson, Craig 30.00 214.00 6,420.00
Totals 58.75 11,244.25
Total Labor 11,244.25
Total this Task 11,244.25
Total this Phase 13,188.25
Phase 005 Research, Analysis, and Other Council Su
Professional Personnel
Hours Rate Amount
Johnson, Craig 12.25 214.00 2,621.50
Totals 12.25 2,621.50
Total Labor 2,621.50
Total this Phase 2,621.50
Phase 006 Administrative

Please Reference Our Invoice Number on your Payment
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Project 6320824- Rhode Island EERMC - 2024 Invoice 411895
0007590.00
Professional Personnel
Hours Rate Amount
Caesar, Adrian 1.00 86.00 86.00
Johnson, Craig .50 86.00 43.00
Totals 1.50 129.00
Total Labor 129.00
Consultants
RACHEL SHOLLY 124.50
Total Consultants 124.50 124.50
Total this Phase 253.50
Phase 007 EERMC Intern
Monthly Intern Fee March 2024 2,675.00
2,675.00 2,675.00
Total this Phase 2,675.00
Billing Limits Current Prior To-Date
Total Billings 68,664.25 440,868.95 509,533.20
Limit 817,025.00
Remaining 307,491.80
Total this Invoice 68,664.25
Billings to Date
Current Prior Total
Labor 42,837.25 319,757.50 362,594.75
Consultant 23,152.00 101,690.70 124,842.70
Expense 0.00 3,370.75 3,370.75
Add-on 2,675.00 16,050.00 18,725.00
Totals 68,664.25 440,868.95 509,533.20

Please Reference Our Invoice Number on your Payment

Page 4



Project 6320824- Rhode Island EERMC - 2024
0007590.00

Invoice 411895

Billing Backup

Tuesday, October 22, 2024

NV5, Inc. Invoice <Draft> Dated 10/22/2024 9:25:33 AM
Project 6320824-0007590.00 Rhode Island EERMC - 2024
Phase 001 EE Prg Planning & Implementation Oversig
Task 01 Council Representation
Professional Personnel
Hours Rate Amount
Caesar, Adrian 9/24/2024 1.25 201.00 251.25
OER/RIE/C-Team check in - September 26 EEC prep, NE
roundtable debrief, 2025 Annual plan filing, OER program updates
(HEAR/HER), C&I lighting AML adjustments, RIE website
Caesar, Adrian 9/27/2024 .25 201.00 50.25
September EE TWG meeting
Johnson, Craig 9/10/2024 1.00 214.00 214.00
Bi-weekly check-in with Stave and Brett
Johnson, Craig 9/25/2024 .25 214.00 53.50
Check-in call with OER.
Johnson, Craig 9/27/2024 .50 214.00 107.00
EE TWG Meeting.
Totals 3.25 676.00
Total Labor 676.00
Total this Task 676.00
Task 02 Implementation Oversight and Plan Develo
Professional Personnel
Hours Rate Amount
Caesar, Adrian 8/23/2024 5.00 201.00 1,005.00
2025 EE Plan review - Main Text and Attachments 1-10, BCR-TRM
comps, C-Team comments resolution and compilation for RIE/EEC
Caesar, Adrian 9/3/2024 3.75 201.00 753.75
Benchmarking research for Mercury Ban impacts on
lighting measures and program offerings; EM&V study
review - RICE/RICG PY2022 site reports and study
results/updated realization rates, Electric Heat Market
characterization study Report
Caesar, Adrian 9/5/2024 2.00 201.00 402.00

C-Team internal EM&V check in - RICE/RICG draft RR results,
electric heat market characterization report excerpt, condenser
coil cleaning measure impacts, RICE sampling plan threshold
evaluation; Condenser Cleaning savings methodology research;
C&I sector team meeting agenda development

Please Reference Our Invoice Number on your Payment
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Project

6320824- Rhode Island EERMC - 2024
0007590.00

Invoice

411895

Caesar, Adrian 9/6/2024 2.75 201.00

C-Team working session - final draft 2025 Plan review prep, RI
data reporting transition to iEnergy; 2025 Gas DR pilot proposal
review; 2025 Annual Plan final draft review - RIE responses to C-
Team second draft data questions, Electric and Gas BCR model
summary tables, program-level budgets and benefits

Caesar, Adrian 9/9/2024 5.25 201.00

C-Team working session - 2025 annual plan final draft review -
program level comps, updated TRM DB and MA studies results for
2025, measure-level impacts, program cost category comparisons;
RI Electric Heat market characterization study review - revised
Report, space heating sample frame results; 2025 annual plan
final draft review - narrative redlines and responses to C-Team
comments, program-level savings and cost comps

Caesar, Adrian 9/10/2024 4.50 201.00

2025 annual plan final draft review - narrative redlines and
responses to C-Team comments, program-level savings and cost
comps, data-related question responses and follow ups, C&I
lighting impacts methodology review; electric heat mkt. study
coordination; C&I EM&V call prep and agenda development; C&I
lighting questions and RIE responses for discussion w/EMV team

Caesar, Adrian 9/11/2024 7.25 201.00

EMRV study tracker review; C&I EM&V call and follow ups; RIE
prescriptive program application review and proposed edits re:
mercury ban; 2025 annual plan final draft review - plan measure
impacts comps, program cost category deltas, measure/end
use/program calcs analysis - lifetime savings, TRC, incentives,
CTA, savings per unit; EM&V study coordination - CI Lighting
controls market impact study, RICG impact evaluation draft report,
comprehensive measure life review SOW, Electric Heat market
characterization sample frame results vs. RASS and estimated
population characteristics

Caesar, Adrian 9/12/2024 5.00 201.00

C-Team working session - 2025 Annual Plan analysis; C&I sector
team meeting prep/call and follow-ups; C&I plan review and
follow-ups for C-Team/RIE; 2025 Annual Plan final draft review -
TRC/incentive coverage, actuals vs. plan measure-level comps;
Small C&I process evaluation report follow-up recommendations

Caesar, Adrian 9/13/2024 2.50 201.00

EM&V study review/coordination - Electric heat market
characterization revised report feedback for Illume, RICG 2022
impact evaluation report, combined RR results

Caesar, Adrian 9/16/2024 4.50 201.00

C-Team working session - 2025 annual Plan cost-effectiveness
report development and analysis/review updates; 2025 Annual
Plan review - measure-level inputs/impact factors and TRM DB
updates, TRM-BCR model comps and QAQC; RICG impact
evaluation draft report review and C-Team comments; EM&V
study tracker updates

Caesar, Adrian 9/17/2024 5.25 201.00

552.75

1,055.25

904.50

1,457.25

1,005.00

502.50

904.50

1,055.25

Please Reference Our Invoice Number on your Payment
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Project 6320824- Rhode Island EERMC - 2024
0007590.00

Invoice

411895

C-Team working session - 2025 Annual Plan final draft review;
2025 Annual Plan final draft analysis/review - follow-up topics for
sector team/EWG meetings, lighting adoption and market
characterization inputs for midstream/downstream programs,
responses to remaining C-Team comments; EM&V study tracker
updates; ; EM&V study review - Lighting Controls impact
evaluation SOW, comprehensive measure life review phase II
results memo

Caesar, Adrian 9/18/2024 2.50 201.00
C-Team working session - 2025 Annual Plan final draft review;
2025 Annual Plan final draft analysis/review - follow-up topics for
sector team/EWG meetings and reg review, responses to
remaining C-Team comments, delivered fuel measure comps to
3YP/2024 Plan; EM&V study review - Lighting Controls impact
evaluation SOW

Caesar, Adrian 9/20/2024 2.25 201.00

EMR&V study review/coordination - Lighting controls impact
evaluation revised SOW, RICE22 impact evaluation report

Caesar, Adrian 9/23/2024 6.25 201.00

EMR&V study tracker updates; updated RICG PY2022 impact
evaluation Draft Report and revised C&I lighting controls impact
evaluation SOW review; updated Electric and Gas program data
reporting template review; C&I lighting market characterization
analysis for mercury ban impacts - early retirement vs. replace on
failure assumptions, AML results, comps to 2024 RI AML update

Caesar, Adrian 9/24/2024 4.00 201.00
C-Team working session - 2025 annual plan measure level
analysis, electric and gas program data reporting template;
updated RICG PY2022 impact evaluation Draft Report, Steam Trap
memo and appendix review; C&I lighting AML updates and ROF
vs. early retirement parameters and discussion w/RIE

Caesar, Adrian 9/25/2024 1.25 201.00

C-Team working session - 2025 annual plan final draft measure
level deltas; Residential/C&I EM&V call and tracker review

Caesar, Adrian 9/26/2024 1.25 201.00
Mercury Ban impacts analysis - prescriptive lighting pathway
disaggregation, ER vs. ROF scenarios, potential electric savings
adjustments

Caesar, Adrian 9/27/2024 3.50 201.00
EM&V study coordination/review - PY2022 Custom Gas impact
evaluation final report and One-Pager, PY22 Custom Electric
Report and one-pager; Cross-jurisdictional BCA comps - RI/CT/MA
EE BCA frameworks, economic benefits methodology; June-August
preliminary Res/C&I program data review; October C&I Sector
Team agenda

Galluzzo, Jordan 9/6/2024 .50 35.00
Internal working session - discussed upcoming plan review tasks.

Galluzzo, Jordan 9/9/2024 3.50 35.00

502.50

452.25

1,256.25

804.00

251.25

251.25

703.50

17.50

122.50

Please Reference Our Invoice Number on your Payment
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Project 6320824- Rhode Island EERMC - 2024 Invoice 411895
0007590.00

Internal working session - discussed Final Draft 2025 Annual Plan
Review. Began updating Program Level Savings Comparisons and
Plan Measure Impacts Comparisons workbooks with Final Draft
2025 Annual Plan values.

Galluzzo, Jordan 9/10/2024 2.50 35.00 87.50
Internal working session - discussed progress on 2025 Final Draft
Plan review tasks. Continued updating Plan Measure Impacts
Comparisons workbook with Final Draft 2025 Annual Plan values.
Began updating Plan Cost Category Comparisons Workbook with
Final Draft 2025 Annual Plan values.

Galluzzo, Jordan 9/12/2024 .50 35.00 17.50
Began updating TRM BCR Model Comparisons with 2025 Final
Draft Plan BCR and TRM data.

Galluzzo, Jordan 9/13/2024 2.00 35.00 70.00
Continued updating TRM BCR Model Comparisons with 2025 Final
Draft Plan BCR and TRM data.

Galluzzo, Jordan 9/20/2024 1.00 35.00 35.00
Began updating Measure Level Savings Workbook with Final Draft
2025 Annual Plan values.

Galluzzo, Jordan 9/23/2024 2.00 35.00 70.00
Continued updating Measure Level Savings Workbook with Final
Draft 2025 Annual Plan values.

Galluzzo, Jordan 9/24/2024 2.50 35.00 87.50
Internal working session - discussed progress on 2025 Plan
Review Task. Continued updating Measure Level Savings
Workbook with Final Draft 2025 Annual Plan values.

Galluzzo, Jordan 9/25/2024 1.50 35.00 52.50
Internal working session - provided brief update on 2025 Plan
Review task. Continued updating Measure Level Savings
Workbook with Final Draft 2025 Annual Plan values.

Galluzzo, Jordan 9/26/2024 2.00 35.00 70.00
Continued updating Measure Level Savings Analysis Workbook
with Final Draft 2025 Annual Plan values.

Galluzzo, Jordan 9/27/2024 1.00 35.00 35.00
Continued updating Measure Level Savings Analysis Workbook
with Final Draft 2025 Annual Plan values.

Johnson, Andrew 9/4/2024 1.00 201.00 201.00
Electric Heat Customer Characterization Report Update - 3 page
document review and comment collection

Johnson, Andrew 9/11/2024 1.00 201.00 201.00
Measure Life Phase Il Memo review

Johnson, Andrew 9/12/2024 1.00 201.00 201.00
RIE Electric Heat Study Discussion and meeting preparation.

Johnson, Andrew 9/13/2024 1.00 201.00 201.00
PY2022 RI Custom Gas - Program Report Document review
comments.

Johnson, Andrew 9/19/2024 2.00 201.00 402.00

Measure Life Report and Excel review. PY2022 RI Custom Gas -
Program Report

Please Reference Our Invoice Number on your Payment
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Project 6320824- Rhode Island EERMC - 2024 Invoice 411895
0007590.00

Johnson, Andrew 9/20/2024 2.00 201.00 402.00
DNV Lighting Controls Work Plan. PY2022 Custom Electric -
Program Report

Johnson, Andrew 9/25/2024 3.00 201.00 603.00
Monthly RI Residential EM&V Meeting + PY2022 RI Custom Gas -
Program Report + DNV Lighting Controls Work plan

Johnson, Andrew 9/26/2024 1.00 201.00 201.00
Review of PY2022 Custom Electric - Program Report

Johnson, Craig 9/4/2024 .50 214.00 107.00
Residential Sector Team - work on drafting agenda topics and
materials for September meeting, correspondence with meeting
attendees re: reschedule.

Johnson, Craig 9/5/2024 2.50 214.00 535.00
Revisit C-Team comments on 2025 EE Plan second draft in prep
for upcoming review of final draft.

Johnson, Craig 9/6/2024 2.00 214.00 428.00
Continue review of C-Team comments on 2025 EE Plan second
draft in prep for upcoming review of final draft.

Johnson, Craig 9/8/2024 2.25 214.00 481.50
2025 Plan Review - Review TRM Update and memo re: MA study
adoption, correspondence with Adrian/Andrew re: same. Organize
final plan review tasks for team, including tasks for narrative, BC
Model, and EM&V review, assessment of impact on missing rate
and bill impacts model. Begin review of final draft narrative Main
Text.

Johnson, Craig 9/9/2024 5.00 214.00 1,070.00
2025 Final Draft Plan - Continue review of final draft, including
Main Text review, assessment of responsiveness to Council
priorities. Working session with Adrian and Jordan to review plan
for updating analysis workbooks.

Johnson, Craig 9/10/2024 3.50 214.00 749.00
2025 Final Draft Plan - Continue review of final draft, including
Main Text review, Residential attachment, and responsiveness to
comments provided on 2nd draft.

Johnson, Craig 9/11/2024 1.50 214.00 321.00
2025 EE Plan - Continue review of final draft, including preparing
key issues for consideration in plan approval process and review
of program comps workbooks.

Johnson, Craig 9/16/2024 3.25 214.00 695.50
Sector team work - coordinate with Spencer re: upcoming check-
in. 2025 Plan review - continue review of final draft plan, including
responsiveness to Res Attachment comments and responses to
data related questions.

Johnson, Craig 9/17/2024 1.50 214.00 321.00
Sector Teams - Reschedule monthly check-ins with RIE and
internal team. 2025 Plan Review - Work on final review of final
draft of plan to inform Council meeting materials.

Johnson, Craig 9/25/2024 2.75 214.00 588.50

Please Reference Our Invoice Number on your Payment
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Project 6320824- Rhode Island EERMC - 2024
0007590.00

Invoice

411895

2025 Plan - check-in with Adrian on recent updates, review RIE

content for Council meeting related to updates. Sector Team Work

- check-in with internal team and prep for next week's res team
meeting. Correspondence with RIE team re: IES BP/Vendor
delivery and program manager updates.

Johnson, Craig 9/26/2024 2.25 214.00

2025 Plan - Final read through of plan materials and analyses prior

to Council vote on plan. Review key drivers of changes. Sector
Team Work - discussion with Spencer about ideas for next week's
sector team meeting.
Johnson, Craig 9/27/2024 1.25 214.00

Sector Team - work on sector team agenda for next week's resi
meeting. Correspondence with Spencer re: same. Review 2024
Plan commitments for EWSF, IES SF, and HVAC and begin
prepping questions for sector team meeting.

Totals 128.00

Total Labor

481.50

267.50

22,941.25

Total this Task

22,941.25
40,739.75

Task 03 Education Initiatives

Professional Personnel
Hours Rate

Caesar, Adrian 9/4/2024 .25 201.00
Pivot Path EE and climate campaign updates, EEC
education committee mtg. planning

Caesar, Adrian 9/25/2024 .50 201.00
Council Handbook review and development

Galluzzo, Jordan 9/5/2024 3.00 35.00
Internal working session - discussed division of tasks and write-
ups for September EEC Newsletter. Began write-ups for the EC4,
its sub-board meetings, the Future of Gas Stakeholder Committee
meeting.

Galluzzo, Jordan 9/6/2024 3.00 35.00
Continued work on the EC4 and Future of Gas Stakeholder
Committee write-ups for the September EEC Newsletter.

Galluzzo, Jordan 9/11/2024 .50 35.00
Began reviewing and editing September EEC Newsletter.

Galluzzo, Jordan 9/12/2024 .75 35.00
Continued reviewing and editing September EEC Newsletter.

Galluzzo, Jordan 9/16/2024 1.75 35.00
Implemented edits and corrections to September EEC Newsletter.

Galluzzo, Jordan 9/17/2024 2.25 35.00
Continued revising September EEC Newsletter. Re-wrote energy

news piece for September EEC Newsletter. Revised formatting to
accommodate new section.

Galluzzo, Jordan 9/18/2024 1.00 35.00

Made the final revisions and updates to September EEC
Newsletter.

Amount
50.25

100.50

105.00

105.00

17.50

26.25

61.25

78.75

35.00

Please Reference Our Invoice Number on your Payment
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Project 6320824- Rhode Island EERMC - 2024 Invoice 411895
0007590.00

Johnson, Craig 9/4/2024 .25 214.00 53.50
Updates from Rachel re: Council education work on EE & Climate
Awareness Campaign and upcoming EdCom meeting, monitor
email traffic re: same.

Johnson, Craig 9/5/2024 .25 214.00 53.50
Correspondence with Rachel and Steve re: latest update from URI
vendor payment.

Johnson, Craig 9/6/2024 .50 214.00 107.00
Check-in with Steve and Rachel re: URI education vendor
payments, discuss strategy for paying through current or future
Council budgets.

Johnson, Craig 9/11/2024 .50 214.00 107.00
Review updates on education items with Rachel, including updates
on lecture series and URI vendor billing item as well as timeline
and next steps for EE and Climate Awareness Campaign launch.

Johnson, Craig 9/12/2024 25 214.00 53.50

URI invoicing investigation - monitor email traffic and share next
steps/thoughts with Rachel and Steve.

Johnson, Craig 9/13/2024 1.25 214.00 267.50
Review and provide comment on draft September Councilor
newsletter.

Johnson, Craig 9/27/2024 .25 214.00 53.50

Correspondence with Rachel and team re: next steps to launch EE
and Climate Awareness Campaign.

Totals 16.25 1,275.00
Total Labor 1,275.00
Total this Task 6,504.00
Total this Phase 47,919.75
Phase 002 System Reliability Procurement
Task 01 Council Representation
Professional Personnel
Hours Rate Amount
McDonald, Clifford 9/18/2024 2.00 229.00 458.00

SRP TWG Meeting attendance - presentation on NWS solution,
material review

Totals 2.00 458.00
Total Labor 458.00
Total this Task 458.00
Task 02 Plan Development and Oversight

Please Reference Our Invoice Number on your Payment Page 11



Project 6320824- Rhode Island EERMC - 2024 Invoice 411895
0007590.00
Professional Personnel
Hours Rate Amount
Johnson, Craig 9/6/2024 .25 214.00 53.50
Monitor activity on Electric Transportation BCA Model work,
correspondence with RIE team re: timing for review.
Johnson, Craig 9/11/2024 .25 214.00 53.50
SRP Electric Transportation BCA Model - coordinate review
assignment with Cliff, emails with RIE regarding same.
Johnson, Craig 9/25/2024 .75 214.00 160.50
Review and catchup on activity related to SRP TWG meeting and
Transportation BCA review.
Totals 1.25 267.50
Total Labor 267.50
Total this Task 267.50
Total this Phase 725.50
Phase 003 Regulatory Proceedings
Task 02 Develop Technical Materials
Professional Personnel
Hours Rate Amount
Caesar, Adrian 9/24/2024 25 201.00 50.25
C-Team working session - pre-file testimony prep for 2025 Annual
plan docket
Johnson, Craig 9/11/2024 .50 214.00 107.00
Future of Gas Docket - Work on review of draft stakeholder report
outline. Develop and send update on process to Harry.
Johnson, Craig 9/13/2024 1.25 214.00 267.50
2025 EE Plan Cost-Effectiveness Report - Review filing and report
from last year and begin flagging items that will likely require
updates for this year's report. 2025 Council Budget - Draft and
send approval of Council budget proposal for 2025 to RIE in
accordance with LCP Standards. RIE Gas DR Proposal - coordinate
with Council legal regarding Council vote and next steps
necessary.
Johnson, Craig 9/26/2024 .50 214.00 107.00
Review pre-file testimony from last year's plan to prep
development of upcoming pre-file testimony.
Johnson, Craig 9/30/2024 3.50 214.00 749.00
Gas DR Pilot Proposal Docket - coordinate with Council legal re:
filing for intervention. Future of Gas Docket - monitor e-mail traffic
from other stakeholders. Continue work on reviewing outline and
prepare feedback to submit to committee, including review of
notes and discussion from earlier meetings of the stakeholder
group.
Totals 6.00 1,280.75
Total Labor 1,280.75

Please Reference Our Invoice Number on your Payment

Page 12



Project 6320824- Rhode Island EERMC - 2024 Invoice 411895
0007590.00
Total this Task 1,280.75
Total this Phase 1,280.75
Phase 004 Council Sponsored Meetings and Materials
Task 01 Meeting Attendance
Professional Personnel
Hours Rate Amount
Caesar, Adrian 9/12/2024 2.00 201.00 402.00
September 12 EEC Meeting
Caesar, Adrian 9/26/2024 2.00 201.00 402.00
Sep 26 EEC meeting
Galluzzo, Jordan 9/26/2024 2.00 35.00 70.00
Attended September 26 EEC Meeting and recorded detailed notes
of Council discussion.
Johnson, Craig 9/6/2024 1.00 214.00 214.00
EEC EdCom meeting attendance.
Johnson, Craig 9/12/2024 2.00 214.00 428.00
EEC Meeting attendance
Johnson, Craig 9/26/2024 2.00 214.00 428.00
September 26 Council Meeting Attendance.
Totals 11.00 1,944.00
Total Labor 1,944.00
Total this Task 1,944.00
Task 02 Develop Technical Materials
Professional Personnel
Hours Rate Amount
Caesar, Adrian 9/3/2024 .75 201.00 150.75
C-Team working session - September 12 EEC agenda
review and mtg. prep, September EEC Newsletter
development
Caesar, Adrian 9/4/2024 2.00 201.00 402.00
September 12 EEC mtg. prep - 2025 annual plan
updates presentation, EE and climate campaign
updates presentation, Gas DR pilot
Caesar, Adrian 9/5/2024 4.25 201.00 854.25

C-Team working session on Sep. 12 EEC mtg
materials - 2025 annual plan presentation, EEC
calendar, September 12 Briefing memo; 2025 Annual
Plan presentation development, assessment of EE plan
responsiveness to EEC priorities

Please Reference Our Invoice Number on your Payment
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Project 6320824- Rhode Island EERMC - 2024 Invoice
0007590.00

Caesar, Adrian 9/6/2024 2.50 201.00 502.50
September EEC mtg. materials development - 2025 annual plan
updates, Sep EEC newsletter; 2025 Annual Plan presentation
development, assessment of EE plan responsiveness to EEC
priorities; RIE 2025 Plan update presentation review

Caesar, Adrian 9/9/2024 1.25 201.00 251.25
September EEC mtg. materials development - 2025 annual plan
deck, briefing memo

Caesar, Adrian 9/11/2024 1.00 201.00 201.00
2025 Annual plan presentation updates - sector/portfolio savings,
budget, and CTA charts and tables, program/sector-level cost
effectiveness charts

Caesar, Adrian 9/12/2024 1.00 201.00 201.00
September 12 EEC mtg. prep; September EEC newsletter review

Caesar, Adrian 9/17/2024 2.50 201.00 502.50
Sep 26 EEC mtg. materials development - 2025 annual plan final
draft review, EEC briefing memo, Sept. 2024 Newsletter; C-Team
working sessions - EEC mtg. materials development

Caesar, Adrian 9/18/2024 3.00 201.00 603.00
C-Team working session - EEC mtg. materials development; Sep
26 EEC mtg. materials development - 2025 annual plan final draft
review, Sept. 2024 Newsletter, final Sep 26 agenda, C-E report
presentation

Caesar, Adrian 9/19/2024 1.00 201.00 201.00
September EEC mtg. materials finalization - briefing memo,
Annual plan updates, C-E report presentation and draft report,
EEC September newsletter

Caesar, Adrian 9/23/2024 .50 201.00 100.50
September EEC mtg. materials review/finalization - public
awareness campaign

Caesar, Adrian 9/25/2024 2.75 201.00 552.75
C-Team working session - Sep 26 EEC mtg. prep

Caesar, Adrian 9/26/2024 .50 201.00 100.50
C-Team working session - Sep EEC mtg. prep

Galluzzo, Jordan 9/11/2024 2.50 35.00 87.50
Internal working session - discussed EEC Meeting materials
progress. Inserted updated tables and graphs with 2025 Annual
Plan Final Draft data into the 2025 Annual Plan Final Draft
Presentation.

Galluzzo, Jordan 9/12/2024 .25 35.00 8.75
Internal working session - discussed final meeting materials for
September 12 EEC Meeting.

Galluzzo, Jordan 9/16/2024 .50 35.00 17.50
Internal working session - discussed progress on meeting
materials for 9/26 EEC Meeting.

Galluzzo, Jordan 9/17/2024 .50 35.00 17.50
Internal working session - discussed status of meeting materials
for 9/26 EEC Meeting.

Galluzzo, Jordan 9/18/2024 1.50 35.00 52.50

Please Reference Our Invoice Number on your Payment

Page 14



Project 6320824- Rhode Island EERMC - 2024 Invoice 411895
0007590.00

Internal working session - discussed meeting materials progress
and additional tasks for 9/26 EEC Meeting. Final Draft Annual
Plan Presentation - ensured tables/ charts reflected final draft
numbers and pasted them in as images, revised minor formatting
issues.

Galluzzo, Jordan 9/26/2024 .50 35.00 17.50

Internal working session - discussed meeting materials &
presentations for September 26 EEC Meeting.

Johnson, Craig 9/3/2024 2.25 214.00 481.50

September Council Materials - Review draft agenda, scope out
assignments for team. 2025 Plan Update - begin work on
brainstorming content to include in presentation.

Johnson, Craig 9/4/2024 2.75 214.00 588.50

September Council Materials - Finish scoping out assignments for
team, discuss assignments with team, provide feedback to OER on
agenda. Draft and send questions regarding RIBA presentation to
OER. Gas DR Presentation - review presentation from last year,
coordinate with RIE on C-Team content to be included. 2025 Plan
Update - coordinate with Adrian on material development. Council
Budget - Work on developing content for presentation. EE/Climate
Awareness Campaign - discuss goals with Rachel, coordinate
messaging to PivotPath.
Johnson, Craig 9/5/2024 3.50 214.00 749.00
September Council Materials - Continue development of 2025 EEC
Budget proposal deck, review feedback from Adrian and Kaeley,
finalize deck and distribute to Steve. 2025 EE Plan Deck - Review
draft content from Adrian, continue work on updating slides.
Johnson, Craig 9/6/2024 3.75 214.00 802.50
September Council Materials - Gas DR Presentation - review slides
from RIE, suggest edits and correspondence with RIE re: same,
make edits and finalize material, distribute to OER. Discuss
modification options to September agenda given recent updates
with EE & Climate Awareness campaign with Steve and Rachel,
brainstorm impacts on second September meeting. Continue work
on content for 2025 EE Plan Update, including timeline update,
focus of presentation, and organization of responsiveness to
Council priorities.
Johnson, Craig 9/9/2024 3.75 214.00 802.50
September Council Materials - Continue development of content
for 2025 Plan review/update presentation, working session with
Adrian re: same. Work on finishing content for briefing memo
Johnson, Craig 9/10/2024 1.00 214.00 214.00

September Council Materials - Update budget proposal slides with
appendix content. Review draft agenda for second September
meeting and work on assignments.

Johnson, Craig 9/11/2024 .25 214.00 53.50

Please Reference Our Invoice Number on your Payment Page 15



Project 6320824- Rhode Island EERMC - 2024
0007590.00

Invoice

411895

September Council Materials - working session with internal team
to review presentation roles, discussion about updating
appendices for 2025 EE Plan update slides.

Johnson, Craig 9/12/2024 2.50 214.00
September Council Materials - review presentation materials for
RIBA Home Show and OER EECBG program presentations. Review
and prepare talking points for EEC 2025 Budget Proposal, Gas DR,
and 2025 EE Plan updates.

Johnson, Craig 9/13/2024 1.00 214.00
September Council Mtg 2 Materials - Review draft agenda and
work on setting up material development assignments and plan.
Coordinate with Rachel on draft materials for EE & Climate
Awareness Campaign. Begin work on Cost-Effectiveness Report
presentation.

Johnson, Craig 9/16/2024 3.00 214.00
September Council Meeting #2 - Check-in meetings with Adrian,
Jordan, and Rachel re: material development and timeline.
Discussion with Adrian re: content for 2025 EE Plan presentation.
Work on development of content for 2025 EE Plan presentation.

Johnson, Craig 9/17/2024 4.25 214.00

September Council Materials - working sessions with team to
check-in on progress and review pathway to completing materials.
Councilor Briefing Memo - draft memo, including key
considerations and discussions for most agenda items, handoff
remaining items to Adrian and Rachel to complete. 2025 EE Plan
Presentation - finalize content, including areas for further
exploration. Cost-Effectiveness Report - Draft and finalize slides

for update on C-E report. Agenda - provide recommended updates

re: EE & Climate Awareness campaign item to Steve and Rachel.
Johnson, Craig 9/26/2024 2.00 214.00

September Council Meeting - prep talking points for C-Team
materials. Review other materials in prep for meeting.

Totals 58.75
Total Labor

535.00

214.00

642.00

909.50

428.00

11,244.25

Total this Task

Total this Phase

11,244.25
11,244.25

13,188.25

Phase 005 Research, Analysis, and Other Council Su

Professional Personnel
Hours Rate
Johnson, Craig 9/10/2024 .25 214.00

Councilor briefings - prep for Thursday briefing with Harry and
coordinate briefings with Peter, Sue, and Priscilla.

Johnson, Craig 9/11/2024 4.00 214.00

Amount
53.50

856.00

Please Reference Our Invoice Number on your Payment
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Project 6320824- Rhode Island EERMC - 2024 Invoice 411895
0007590.00
Councilor briefing with Peter. Prep for tomorrow's Councilor
briefing with Harry, including updates on Council related items. EE
Admin RFP Support - meeting with OER review team to get update
on process, timeline, and next steps for interviews.
Johnson, Craig 9/12/2024 2.50 214.00 535.00
Councilor Briefing and catchup with Council Chair Oakley,
associated prep.
Johnson, Craig 9/17/2024 1.25 214.00 267.50
Councilor briefing with Sue and Peter, associated meeting prep.
Johnson, Craig 9/25/2024 2.75 214.00 588.50
EC4 Advisory Board Meeting. Councilor briefing prep and
correspondence. Correspondence with OER re: timeline for review
of interview questions for EE Implementation RFP.
Johnson, Craig 9/26/2024 1.50 214.00 321.00
Councilor briefing with Chair Oakley.
Totals 12.25 2,621.50
Total Labor 2,621.50
Total this Phase 2,621.50
Phase 006 Administrative
Professional Personnel
Hours Rate Amount
Caesar, Adrian 9/19/2024 1.00 86.00 86.00
Quarterly preview memo development
Johnson, Craig 9/17/2024 .50 86.00 43.00
Quarterly Preview Report - Scope outline for report, provide notes
and direction to Adrian to complete first draft.
Totals 1.50 129.00
Total Labor 129.00
Total this Phase 253.50
Total this Project 65,989.25
Total this Report 65,989.25

Please Reference Our Invoice Number on your Payment

Page 17



Rachel Sholly
48 Hudson Street, Providence, Rl 02909

INVOICE
TO : Optimal Energy Inc. Invoice Number: 81
10600 Route 116, Suite 3 Invoice Date: October 3, 2024
Hinesburg, VT 05461 OEIl Project #: 7590

Work Performed for RI Energy Efficiency & Resource Management Council

Description of Services Amount

Services Performed 9/01/2024 through 9/30/2024

Hours Hourly Rate Amount Due
LABOR - Regular Hours 31.50 $166.00 $5,229.00
LABOR - Admin Hours 1.50 $83.00 $124.50
LABOR - Travel Hours 0.00 $83.00 $0.00
Travel Expenses $0.00

(See attached travel expense form for details.)

TOTAL DUE $5,353.50



Rachel Sholly

Services Performed 9/01/2024 through 9/30/2024

001 - EE Program Planning &
Implementation

001-02 005-00
Implementation 001-03 Research, 006-00 Sub-Total | o 1\ Total | Sub-Total | Total
Oversight & Ec!l.!ca.uon Analysis & other] Administrative Regular Travel Hrs.|Admin Hrs.| Hours
Plan Initiatives Council Support Hrs.
Date Description of Services Development
Finalized and sent EdComm mtg materials, add'l mtg
09/03/24 |prep 0.50 0.50 0.00 0.00 0.50
Reviewed PivotPath invoice; Sent EdComm agenda to
PivotPath & URI; C-team planning re: edu activities &
09/04/24 |council mtg materials; Posted EdComm mtg materials 1.50 0.50 1.50 0.00 0.50 2.00
Correspondence w/project team re: PivotPath feedback;
PivotPath biweekly check-in; C-team check-in re:
09/05/24 |PivotPath strategy 1.25 1.25 0.00 0.00 1.25
09/06/24 |EdComm mtg & follow-up check-in re: PivotPath strategy 1.50 1.50 0.00 0.00 1.50
09/07/24 |Communications re: PivotPath timeline & working session 0.25 0.25 0.00 0.00 0.25
Searched for alternative campaign images; Met
w/PivotPath; Compiled alternative images & grouped by
09/09/24 |message alignment 5.00 5.00 0.00 0.00 5.00
Correspondence w/PivotPath & Councilors re: image
09/10/24 |guidance; Reviewed PivotPath invoice & updated tracker 1.00 1.00 0.00 0.00 1.00
C-team planning re: edu activities, council mtg prep;
Recon & correspondence re: URI invoicing; Drafted
09/11/24 |content for campaign landing page 4.00 4.00 0.00 0.00 4.00
09/13/24 [EEC mtg 2.00 2.00 0.00 0.00 2.00
09/16/24 |C-team planning re: edu activities; URI invoice follow-up 0.50 0.50 0.00 0.00 0.50
09/17/24 |Correspondence w/PivotPath re: Council mtg prep 0.25 0.25 0.00 0.00 0.25
PivotPath - images; PivotPath - landing page copy;
09/18/24 |Correspondence w/URI re: budget/contract extension 5.25 5.25 0.00 0.00 5.25
09/19/24 |PP biweekly, review & correspodence; Briefing memo 1.50 1.50 0.00 0.00 1.50
Quarterly activities report; Reviewed & posted PivotPath
09/23/24 |presentation & briefing memo, related correspondence 1.50 1.50 0.00 0.00 1.50
09/25/24 |C-team planning re: edu activities 0.50 0.50 0.00 0.00 0.50
09/26/24 |[EEC mtg 1.00 1.00 0.00 0.00 1.00
Reviewed, commented on & forwarded audio script, ad
09/27/24 |copy, landing page copy 1.25 1.25 0.00 0.00 1.25
Drafted & sent EdComm agenda for review;
09/28/24 |Correspondence re: EdComm mtg planning 1.00 1.00 0.00 0.00 1.00
Created events on website for EdComm mtgs, LEAD
session, PIER lectures; Correspondence re: mtgs display
09/29/24 |issue 1.00 0.00 0.00 1.00 1.00
09/30/24 |Drafted LEAD agenda, shared for C-team review 1.75 1.75 0.00 0.00 1.75
Total Hours 0.00 31.50 0.00 1.50 31.50 0.00 1.50 33.00
Total Amount $0.00 $5,229.00 $0.00 $124.50] $5,229.00 $0.00( $124.50| $5,353.50




Ralph Prahl
7001 Stanhope Place, University Park FL 34201

INVOICE
TO : Optimal Energy Inc. Invoice Number: 55
10600 Route 116, Suite 3 Invoice Date: October 1, 2024
Hinesburg, VT 05461 OEI Project #: 7590

Work Performed for RI Energy Efficiency & Resource Management Council

Description of Services Amount

Services Performed 9/01/24 through 9/30/24

Hours Hourly Rate Amount Due
LABOR - Regular Hours 16.50 $212.00 $3,498.00
LABOR - Travel Hours 0.00 $106.00 $0.00
Travel Expenses $0.00

(See attached travel expense form for details.)

TOTAL DUE $3,498.00



Ralph Prahl
Services Performed 9/01/24 through 9/30/24

001 - EE Program Planning & Implementation

001-02
Implementation 005-00
001-01 Oversight & 001-03 Research, Sub-Total
Council Plan Education Analysis & other 006-00 Sub-Total Travel
Date Description of Services Representation | Development Initiatives Council Support] Administrative | Travel Time | Regular Hrs. Hrs. Total Hours
custom electric impact eval, custom gas impact eval, electric
9/6/2024|htg market char report 1.50 1.50 0.00 0.00
9/9/2024|electric htg market char report 0.25 0.25 0.00 1.50
9/10/2024|electric heat report 0.50 0.50 0.00 0.25
9/11/2024|C&lI Itg AML issue; elec heat report 1.00 1.00 0.00 0.50
9/12/2024elec heat report (conf call); custom gas impact report 2.25 2.25 0.00 1.00
9/13/2024 |custom gas impact report 1.75 1.75 0.00 2.25
9/17/2024|custom gas impact report 0.25 0.00 0.00 1.75
Itg controls study res plan, custom gas impact report (conf

9/18/2024call), measure life report 2.25 0.25 0.00 0.25
9/19/2024|ltg controls study 1.50 2.25 0.00 2.25
9/20/2024|custom electric impact report 1.00 1.50 0.00 1.50
9/21/2024|measure life report 0.50 1.00 0.00 1.00
9/23/2024(ltg controls study (conf call, follow-up) 2.00 0.50 0.00 0.50
9/24/2024 |custom gas impact report 0.50 2.00 0.00 2.00
9/25/2024|C&I check-in call 0.50 0.50 0.00 0.50
9/26/2024|custom gas impact report 0.25 0.50 0.00 0.50
9/27/2024|1ESF results; custom electric report 0.25 0.25 0.00 0.25
9/30/2024|1ESF results 0.25 0.25 0.00 0.25
0.25 0.00 0.25
0.00 0.00 0.00
Total Hours 0.00 16.50 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 16.50 0.00 16.50
Total Amount $0.00 $3,498.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $3,498.00 0.00 $3,498.00




EcoMetric Consulting, LLC
41 Leopard Road, Suite 104

ool 19501 INVOICE

610.400.8600
ECOMETRIC admin@ecometricconsulting.com

BILLED TO TOTAL DUE

Craig Johnson

Optimal Energy - NV5 $ 1 9 5 7 OO
10600 Route 116, Suite 3 7 .
Hinesburg, VT 05461

Project Name RI EERMC Consultant Invoice Date 10/17/2024
Project # 7525 Due Date 11/16/2024
Invoice # 1029-P9-24 Payment Terms Net 30
Billing Period 09/01/2024 - 09/30/2024
taskNumber | Description | _Amount _
001-02 Implementation Oversight & Plan Development $1,957.00
Subtotal $1,957.00
Invoice Total $1,957.00

Budget Summary

Task Number Budget Previous Billings Total Spent

Task 001-02 $150,000.00 $66,178.00 $68,135.00 $81,865.00
TBD TBD $0.00 $0.00

Contract Balance $81,865.00




Invoice Number
Period

1029-P9-24
09/01/2024 - 09/30/2024

Person Month Hours Rate Amount

RI EERMC Consultant Implementation Oversight & Plan D Salil Gogte Partner 2024-09 0 $220.00 $ =

RI EERMC Consultant  Implementation Oversight & Plan D Michael Frischmann Partner 2024-09 0 $220.00 $ -

RI EERMC Consultant Implementation Oversight & Plan D Michael Honeychuck  Managing Consultant 2024-09 9.5 $206.00 $ 1,957.00
RI EERMC Consultant  Implementation Oversight & Plan D Bitul Sinha Managing Consultant 2024-09 0 $206.00 $ -

RI EERMC Consultant Implementation Oversight & Plan D Cory Read Data Scientist 2024-09 0 $206.00 $ =

RI EERMC Consultant  Implementation Oversight & Plan D Sharon Mullen Managing Consultant 2024-09 0 $206.00 $ -

RI EERMC Consultant  Implementation Oversight & Plan D Mary George Sr Engineer 2024-09 0 $166.00 $ =

RI EERMC Consultant Implementation Oversight & Plan D Kyle McKenna Managing Consultant 2024-09 0 $206.00 $ -

RI EERMC Consultant  Implementation Oversight & Plan D Jenna Bagnall Managing Consultant 2024-09 0 $206.00 $ -

RI EERMC Consultant Implementation Oversight & Plan D Vijay Susvirkar Sr Engineer 2024-09 0 $166.00 $ -

RI EERMC Consultant  Implementation Oversight & Plan D Vinay Belhekar Sr Engineer 2024-09 0 $166.00 $ =
Total 9.50 $ 1,957.00
Project Task Person Title Month Hours Rate Amount

RI EERMC Consultant 0 Salil Gogte Partner 2024-09 0 $220.00 $ -

RI EERMC Consultant O Michael Frischmann Partner 2024-09 0 $220.00 % -
RI EERMC Consultant 0 Michael Honeychuck  Managing Consultant 2024-09 0 $206.00 $ =

RI EERMC Consultant O Bitul Sinha Managing Consultant 2024-09 0 $206.00 $ -

Rl EERMC Consultant 0 2024-09 0 $ -
Total - $ -



fname local_date hours task notes

Michael Hol 9/5/24 2.00 Implementation Oversigh Monthly check-in with AdrianReview of custom electric sample designEmails
Michael Ho 9/11/24 1.00 Implementation Oversigh Monthly C&I meeting with RIE & C-TeamCustom gas report review
Michael Hol 9/13/24 1.00 Implementation Oversigh Custom gas report reviewReview of emails from Guidehouse
DNV Lighting Controls Work plan review & comments

9/18/24 3.00 Measure Life Phase Il Memo review & comments
Michael Ho Implementation Oversigh Emails
Michael Hol 9/20/24 1.50 Implementation Oversigh PY2022 Custom Electric - Program Report review & commentsEmails
Michael Hol 9/25/24 0.50 Implementation Oversigh Monthly residential meeting with RIE & Guidehouse

Michael Hol 9/26/24 0.50 Implementation Oversigh Monthly invoice estimate & emails




Energy Futures Group, Inc.
PO Box 587
Hinesburg, VT 05461

INVOICE
TO : Optimal Energy Inc. Invoice Number: 6798
10600 Route 116, Suite 3 Invoice Date: March 7, 2024
Hinesburg, VT 05461 OEI Project #: 7525

Work Performed for RI Energy Efficiency & Resource Management Council

Description of Services Amount

Services Performed 2/1/2024 through 2/29/2024

Hours Hourly Rate Amount Due
LABOR - Regular Hours 7.50 $212.00 $1,590.00
LABOR - Travel Hours 0.00 $106.00 $0.00
Travel Expenses $0.00

(See attached travel expense form for details.)

TOTAL DUE $1,590.00



Enerqy Futures Group, Inc.

Services Performed 2/1/2024 through 2/29/2024

002 - System Reliability

001 - EE Program Planning & Implementation Procurement 003 - Regulatory Proceedings 004 - Council Sponsored Meetings & Materials
001-02
Implementation 002-02 003-02 004-02 005-00
001-01 Oversight & 001-03 002-01 Plan 003-01 Develop 004-01 Develop 004-03 Research, Sub-Total | Sub-Total

Council Plan Education Council Development & Council Technical Meeting Technical Other Council |Analysis & other 006-00 Regular Travel Total

Date Description of Services Representation | Development Initiatives Representation Oversight Representation Manuals Attendance Materials Responsibilities | Council Support| Administrative | Travel Time Hrs. Hrs. Hours
2/1/2024 Emails and scheduling 0.50 0.00 0.00 0.00
2/5/2024 Respond to Adrian re: RIE programs and initiatives 0.25 0.50 0.00 0.50
2/7/2024/Review Daniel Tukey's request and respond; invite Ralph 0.50 0.25 0.00 0.25
2/8/2024 | Meeting prep and coordination; prep for meeting; update lighting dashboard 1.50 0.50 0.00 0.50
2/8/2024|Res sector monthly call with team 1.00 1.50 0.00 1.50
2/9/2024 Prep for RI meeting; leading lighting subgroup; send out notes 2.50 1.00 0.00 1.00
2/15/2024 C&I sector call; folow-up emails 1.25 2.50 0.00 2.50
1.25 0.00 1.25
0.00 0.00 0.00
0.00 0.00 0.00
0.00 0.00 0.00
0.00 0.00 0.00
0.00 0.00 0.00
0.00 0.00 0.00
0.00 0.00 0.00
0.00 0.00 0.00
0.00 0.00 0.00
0.00 0.00 0.00
0.00 0.00 0.00
0.00 0.00 0.00
0.00 0.00 0.00
0.00 0.00 0.00
0.00 0.00 0.00
0.00 0.00 0.00
0.00 0.00 0.00
0.00 0.00 0.00
0.00 0.00 0.00
0.00 0.00 0.00
0.00 0.00 0.00
0.00 0.00 0.00
0.00 0.00 0.00
0.00 0.00 0.00
0.00 0.00 0.00
0.00 0.00 0.00
0.00 0.00 0.00
0.00 0.00 0.00
0.00 0.00 0.00
0.00 0.00 0.00
0.00 0.00 0.00
0.00 0.00 0.00
0.00 0.00 0.00
0.00 0.00 0.00
0.00 0.00 0.00
Total Hours 0.00 7.50 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 7.50 0.00 7.50
Total Amount $0.00 $1,590.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00] $1,590.00 0.00 | $1,590.00




GDR Consulting
576 Rutland St
Carlisle MA 01741

INVOICE
TO : Optimal Energy Inc. Invoice Number: 9R
10600 Route 116, Suite 3 Invoice Date: October 3, 2024
Hinesburg, VT 05461 OEI Project #: 7590

Work Performed for RI Energy Efficiency & Resource Management Council

Description of Services Amount

Services Performed 9/1/24 through 9/30/24

Hours Hourly Rate Amount Due
LABOR - Regular Hours 4.25 $212.00 $901.00
LABOR - Travel Hours 0.00 $106.00 $0.00
Travel Expenses $0.00

(See attached travel expense form for details.)

TOTAL DUE $901.00




GDR Consulting

Services Performed 9/1/24 through 9/30/24

001 - EE Program Planning & Implementation

001-02 005-00
001-01 Implementation 001-03 Research, Sub-Total

Council Oversight & Plan Education Analysis & other 006-00 Regular | Sub-Total Total

Date Description of Services Representation | Development Initiatives Council Support| Administrative | Travel Time Hrs. |Travel Hrs. Hours
9/6/2024 |Comments on revised electric heat characterization study 0.25 0.25 0.00 0.25
9/9/2024 |Comparison of RASS data to electric heat study data 0.75 0.75 0.00 0.75
9/11/2024 |Continued engagement on electric heat study 0.50 0.50 0.00 0.50

Participate in call on electric heat characterization study. Research

9/12/2024 |on RI housing data 1.00 1.00 0.00 1.00
9/16/2024 |Review and comment on revised ML study 0.25 0.25 0.00 0.25
9/25/2024 |[Participate in monthly EM&V call w/RIE 0.50 0.50 0.00 0.50
9/26/2024 |[Participate in monthly internal Residential C-Team call 0.50 0.50 0.00 0.50
9/30/2024 |Review and reply to initial results of IE-SF impact evaluation 0.50 0.50 0.00 0.50
Total Hours 0.00 4.25 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 4.25 0.00 4.25
Total Amount $0.00 $901.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $901.00 0.00 | $901.00




Make Payable to: Jennifer Chiodo
JLC Consulting

52 Bent Creek Road

Hinesburg, VT 05416

INVOICE

TO : Optimal Energy Inc. Invoice Number: R-24.09
10600 Route 116, Suite 3 Invoice Date: September 30, 2024
Hinesburg, VT 05461 OEI Project #: 7525
Work Performed for RI Energy Efficiency & Resource Management Council

Description of Services Amount
Services Performed 09/01/24 through 09/30/24

Hours Hourly Rate Amount Due

LABOR - Regular Hours 2.00 $206.00 $412.00
LABOR - Travel Hours 0.00 $103.00 $0.00
Travel Expenses $0.00

(See attached travel expense form for details.)

TOTAL DUE

$412.00




Make Payable to: Jennifer Chiodo
Services Performed 09/01/24 through 09/30/24

UUT = LL

Program
Planning &
001-02
Implementation [ syp-Total | Sub-Total
Oversight & Plan|  Regular Travel Total
Date Description of Services Development Hrs. Hrs. Hours
9/11/24 [Review agenda for monthly Cl Sector call 0.50 0.50 0.00 0.50
9/12/2024 [Monthly Cl Sector call and follow up 1.50 1.50 0.00 1.50
0.00 0.00 0.00
0.00 0.00 0.00
0.00 0.00 0.00
0.00 0.00 0.00
0.00 0.00 0.00
0.00 0.00 0.00
0.00 0.00 0.00
0.00 0.00 0.00
0.00 0.00 0.00
0.00 0.00 0.00
0.00 0.00 0.00
0.00 0.00 0.00
0.00 0.00 0.00
0.00 0.00 0.00
0.00 0.00 0.00
0.00 0.00 0.00
0.00 0.00 0.00
0.00 0.00 0.00
0.00 0.00 0.00
0.00 0.00 0.00
0.00 0.00 0.00
0.00 0.00 0.00
0.00 0.00 0.00
0.00 0.00 0.00
0.00 0.00 0.00
0.00 0.00 0.00
0.00 0.00 0.00
0.00 0.00 0.00
0.00 0.00 0.00
0.00 0.00 0.00
0.00 0.00 0.00
0.00 0.00 0.00
0.00 0.00 0.00
0.00 0.00 0.00
0.00 0.00 0.00
0.00 0.00 0.00
0.00 0.00 0.00
0.00 0.00 0.00
0.00 0.00 0.00
0.00 0.00 0.00
0.00 0.00 0.00
Total Hours 2.00 2.00 0.00 2.00
Total Amount $412.00] $412.00 0.00 | $412.00




Energy Futures Group, Inc.
PO Box 587
Hinesburg, VT 05461

TO : Optimal Energy Inc.
10600 Route 116, Suite 3
Hinesburg, VT 05461

INVOICE
Invoice Number: 6513
Invoice Date: October 4, 2024
OEI Project #: 7525

Work Performed for RI Energy Efficiency & Resource Management Council

Description of Services Amount
Services Performed 9/1/2024 through 9/30/2024
Hours Hourly Rate Amount Due
LABOR - Regular Hours 1.25 $212.00 $265.00
LABOR - Travel Hours 0.00 $106.00 $0.00

Travel Expenses
(See attached travel expense form for details.)

TOTAL DUE

$0.00

$265.00




Enerqy Futures Group, Inc.

Services Performed 9/1/2024 through 9/30/2024

002 - System Reliability

001 - EE Program Planning & Implementation Procurement 003 - Regulatory Proceedings 004 - Council Sponsored Meetings & Materials
001-02
Implementation 002-02 003-02 004-02 005-00
001-01 Oversight & 001-03 002-01 Plan 003-01 Develop 004-01 Develop 004-03 Research, Sub-Total | Sub-Total
Council Plan Education Council Development & Council Technical Meeting Technical Other Council |Analysis & other 006-00 Regular Travel Total
Date Description of Services Representation | Development Initiatives Representation Oversight Representation Manuals Attendance Materials Responsibilities | Council Support] Administrative | Travel Time Hrs. Hrs. Hours
Review lighting AMLs from Adrian and provide response and comments re:
9/9/2024 impacts from mercury law 0.75 0.00 0.00 0.00
9/25/2024 C-Team check in meeting 0.50 0.75 0.00 0.75
0.50 0.00 0.50
0.00 0.00 0.00
0.00 0.00 0.00
0.00 0.00 0.00
0.00 0.00 0.00
0.00 0.00 0.00
0.00 0.00 0.00
0.00 0.00 0.00
0.00 0.00 0.00
0.00 0.00 0.00
0.00 0.00 0.00
0.00 0.00 0.00
0.00 0.00 0.00
0.00 0.00 0.00
0.00 0.00 0.00
0.00 0.00 0.00
0.00 0.00 0.00
0.00 0.00 0.00
0.00 0.00 0.00
0.00 0.00 0.00
0.00 0.00 0.00
0.00 0.00 0.00
0.00 0.00 0.00
0.00 0.00 0.00
0.00 0.00 0.00
0.00 0.00 0.00
0.00 0.00 0.00
0.00 0.00 0.00
0.00 0.00 0.00
0.00 0.00 0.00
0.00 0.00 0.00
0.00 0.00 0.00
0.00 0.00 0.00
0.00 0.00 0.00
0.00 0.00 0.00
0.00 0.00 0.00
0.00 0.00 0.00
0.00 0.00 0.00
0.00 0.00 0.00
0.00 0.00 0.00
0.00 0.00 0.00
Total Hours 0.00 1.25 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 1.25 0.00 1.25
Total Amount $0.00 $265.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $265.00 0.00 $265.00




Margie Lynch/Core Energy Insights, Inc.
4445 E. Hoback River Road, Jackson, WY 83001

INVOICE

TO : Optimal Energy Inc. Invoice Number: CEI RI 9-2024
10600 Route 116, Suite 3 Invoice Date: October 1, 2024
Hinesburg, VT 05461 OEIl Project #: 7525
Work Performed for RI Energy Efficiency Council

Description of Services Amount
Services Performed 09/01/24 through 09/30/24

Hours Hourly Rate Amount Due

LABOR - Regular Hours 1.00 $199.00 $199.00
LABOR - Travel Hours 0.00 $99.50 $0.00
Travel Expenses $0.00

(See attached travel expense form for details.)

TOTAL DUE

$199.00




Margie Lynch/Core Energy Insights, Inc.

Services Performed 09/01/24 through 09/30/24

001 - EE Program Planning & Implementation

001-02
Implementation 005-00
001-01 Oversight & 001-03 Research, Sub-Total | Sub-Total

Council Plan Education Analysis & other 006-00 Regular Travel Total

Date Description of Services Representation | Development Initiatives Council Support| Administrative | Travel Time Hrs. Hrs. Hours
9/16/24 JEWG preps w/Acadia Center staff 0.50 0.00 0.00 0.00
9/25/24 |Res C-Team meeting to discuss final plan issues 0.50 0.50 0.00 0.50
0.00 0.00 0.00
Total Hours 0.00 1.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 1.00 0.00 1.00
Total Amount $0.00 $199.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $199.00 0.00 | $199.00




EcoMetric Consulting, LLC
41 Leopard Road, Suite 104

ool 19501 INVOICE

610.400.8600
ECOMETRIC admin@ecometricconsulting.com

BILLED TO TOTAL DUE

Craig Johnson

Optimal Energy - NV5 $ 8 9 7 6 5 O
10600 Route 116, Suite 3 7 .
Hinesburg, VT 05461

Project Name RI EERMC Consultant Invoice Date 10/17/2024
Project # 7525 Due Date 11/16/2024
Invoice # 1029-P8-24 Payment Terms Net 30
Billing Period 08/01/2024 - 08/31/2024
taskNumber | Description | _Amount _
001-02 Implementation Oversight & Plan Development $8,976.50
Subtotal $8,976.50
Invoice Total $8,976.50

Budget Summary

Task Number Budget Previous Billings Total Spent

Task 001-02 $150,000.00 $57,201.50 $66,178.00 $83,822.00
TBD TBD $0.00 $0.00

Contract Balance $83,822.00




Invoice Number
Period

1029-P8-24
08/01/2024 - 08/31/2024

Person Month Hours Rate Amount

RI EERMC Consultant Implementation Oversight & Plan D Salil Gogte Partner 2024-09 0 $220.00 $ =

RI EERMC Consultant  Implementation Oversight & Plan D Michael Frischmann Partner 2024-09 0 $220.00 $ -

RI EERMC Consultant Implementation Oversight & Plan D Michael Honeychuck  Managing Consultant 2024-09 15.25 $206.00 $ 3,141.50
RI EERMC Consultant  Implementation Oversight & Plan D Bitul Sinha Managing Consultant 2024-09 11 $206.00 $ 2,266.00
RI EERMC Consultant Implementation Oversight & Plan D Cory Read Data Scientist 2024-09 0 $206.00 $ =

RI EERMC Consultant  Implementation Oversight & Plan D Sharon Mullen Managing Consultant 2024-09 0 $206.00 $ -

RI EERMC Consultant  Implementation Oversight & Plan D Mary George Sr Engineer 2024-09 0 $166.00 $ =

RI EERMC Consultant Implementation Oversight & Plan D Kyle McKenna Managing Consultant 2024-09 0 $206.00 $ -

RI EERMC Consultant  Implementation Oversight & Plan D Jenna Bagnall Managing Consultant 2024-09 0 $206.00 $ -

RI EERMC Consultant Implementation Oversight & Plan D Vijay Susvirkar Sr Engineer 2024-09 85 $166.00 $ 1,411.00
RI EERMC Consultant  Implementation Oversight & Plan D Vinay Belhekar Sr Engineer 2024-09 13 $166.00 $ 2,158.00
Total 47.75 $ 8,976.50
Project Task Person Title Month Hours Rate Amount

RI EERMC Consultant 0 Salil Gogte Partner 2024-09 0 $220.00 $ -

RI EERMC Consultant O Michael Frischmann Partner 2024-09 0 $220.00 % -

RI EERMC Consultant 0 Michael Honeychuck  Managing Consultant 2024-09 0 $206.00 $ =

RI EERMC Consultant O Bitul Sinha Managing Consultant 2024-09 0 $206.00 $ -

Rl EERMC Consultant 0 2024-09 0 $ -

$

Total



fname

Bitul Sinha
Bitul Sinha
Bitul Sinha
Bitul Sinha
Bitul Sinha
Bitul Sinha

Michael Hol
Michael Hol

Michael Ho
Michael Ho
Michael Hol
Michael Ho
Michael Ho
Michael Ho
Michael Ho
Vijay Susvir
Vijay Susvir
Vijay Susvir
Vinay Belhe

Vinay Belhe

Vinay Belhe

Vinay Belhe

local_date

8/12/24
8/13/24
8/16/24
8/20/24
8/22/24
8/23/24

8/1/24
8/6/24
8/14/24

8/15/24
8/19/24
8/21/24
8/22/24
8/23/24
8/30/24

8/2/24

8/9/24
8/12/24
8/13/24

8/14/24

8/14/24

8/16/24

hours task notes

1.00 Implementation Oversigh Review of 2025 EE Plan Attachment 2
1.00 Implementation Oversigh Review of 2025 EE Plan Attachment 2
2.00 Implementation Oversigh Review of 2025 EE Plan Attachment 3
1.00 Implementation Oversigh Review of 2025 EE Plan Main Text
3.00 Implementation Oversigh Review of 2025 EE Plan documents, discussions with Mike
3.00 Implementation Oversigh Review of 2025 EE Plan documents
Monthly check-in with Adrian
2.00 Review of current statuses
Implementation Oversigh Discussions with Vijay about BCR data files
1.00 Implementation Oversigh Invoice, discussions, & emails
Monthly C&I check-in with Guidehouse & RIE
2.00 Discussions with Vinay about 2025 EE plans & BCR models
Implementation Oversigh Emails
2.00 Implementation Oversigh RIG22N012 and RIG22N073 report reviewsEmails
1.75 Implementation Oversigh RICE2023 Sample Desigh Memo Review call, prep & follow-up
1.50 Implementation Oversigh RICE2023 Sample Design Memo Follow-Up, prep, & emails
2.00 Implementation Oversigh 2025 EE Plan document reviews & commentsDiscussions with Bitul
2.00 Implementation Oversigh 2025 EE Plan document reviews & commentsEmails
1.00 Implementation Oversigh Review emails & documents from Guidehouse
4.00 Implementation Oversigh Review BCR model documents & calculations, prepare summary & notes
4.00 Implementation Oversigh Review updated BCR model documents & calculations
0.50 Implementation Oversigh Rhode Island work handover to Vinay and discussion.
3.00 Implementation Oversigh RIE 2025 Annual Plan updated files review
4.00 . . RIE 2025 Annual Plan updated files review
Implementation Oversigh BCR-Elect Model files review
0 RIE 2025 Annual Plan updated files review
Implementation Oversigh BCR-Gas Model files review
RIE 2025 Annual Plan updated files review
2.00 2024.06.28 2025 Rl Electric & Gas Program Level Comparison
Implementation Oversigh Update Notes

4.0



INVOICE

PivotPath, LLC
930 New Hope Rd Ste 11-628
Lawrenceville, GA 30045

Bill to
Rachel Sholly
Rhode Island Energy Efficiency Council

Invoice details

Invoice no.: 1811

Terms: Net 15

Invoice date: 10/31/2024
Due date: 11/15/2024

Product or service

Creative Services

Media Planning

Project Management

Advertising Costs

Advertising Costs

Advertising Costs

Ways to pay

elizabeth@pivotpathdigital.com
+1 (404) 391-3528

Description

Task 3: Landing page adjustments; audio script
revisions and final recording

Task 4: Campaign set up/guidance for EEC

October 2024: Attending two meetings (2)
biweekly meetings; Project Coordination and
monthly report

24004_Audio_English Impressions: 44,753
24004_Audio_Spanish: 50,711
24004 _Display_English Impressions: 208,965

24004_Display_Spanish Impressions: 199,131

Added Value Package - Rl EEC Impressions:
135,907

visA @ mscmaﬂ BANK  |PPoyral venmo

Note to customer
October 2024 Agency & Media Costs

View and pay

Total

PIVOT-PATH

MARKETING STRATEGISTS AND CREATIVE STORYTELLERS.

Ship to
Rachel Sholly
Rhode Island Energy Efficiency Council

Qty Rate Amount
10.48 $195.00 $2,043.60
7.8 $150.00 $1,170.00
12.2 $125.00 $1,525.00
1 $2,246.21 $2,246.21

1 $2,634.85 $2,634.85

1 $0.00 $0.00
$9,619.66


mailto:elizabeth@pivotpathdigital.com
tel:+14043913528
https://connect.intuit.com/portal/app/CommerceNetwork/view/scs-v1-b320b4d0b866476d91a44c2a59125ad7b430b66df6dc4a3396cb2a04723630ba669129e3f9544c06874cccb7cf6a5457?locale=en_US&cta=pdfbutton




THE

UNIVERSITY

GM-00039139

OF RHODE ISLAND Invoice No:
INVOICE Invoice Date: 317124
THINK BIUQWE DO Page: 1
Remit To: Customer No : SPR11571
Payment Terms : Net 30
The University of Rhode Island Due Date - 4/6/24
Office of Sponsored & Cost Accounting
70 Lower College Road, 3¢ Floor Contract No  :Hardesty RIEERMC_021
Kingston, RI 02881 Purchase Order :
URI Award No :AWD11451
FEIN: 22-3011455 Contract Period : 2023-02-20 -- 2024-02-19
Voucher Status: Partial
Bill To: Invoice Period 2024-01-01 - 2024-01-31
RI Energy Effic and Resource Mgmt
Counci
One Capitol Hill, 4th floor
Providence RI 02908
Original
Line Description Net Amount
1 Expenses billed in Invoice Period $1,439.41
1,439.41 USD

AMOUNT DUE:

By signing this report, | certify to the best of my knowledge and belief that the report is true, complete and accurate and

the expenditures, disbursements and cash receipts are for the purposes and objectives set forth in the terms and

conditions of the Award (funded by Federal, State or other type of sponsor). | am aware that any false, fictitious or fraudulent

information or the omission of any material fact may subject me to criminal, civil or administrative penalties for fraud, false statements, false claims or

otherwise (U.S. Code Title 18, Section 1001 and Title 31, Sections 3729-3730 and 3801-3812).

A o Zordad CQH .

Kerry Budnick, Associate Controller, Sponsored & Cost Accounting

Office of Sponsored & Cost Accounting

For billing questions please contact Kerry Budnick at kbudnick@uri.edu or 401-874-2353



Invoice

Remit checks to:

Optimal Energy,

PO Box 74008680
Chicago, IL 60674-8680

Optl

mal

E NERGY
AN NW\S COMPANY

Remit ACH transfer to:

ABA Routing Number 063100277
Account Number 898052466590
Email ACH/Wire remittance details to

LLC

Remit Wire Transfers to:

ABA Routing Number 026009593
Account Number 898052466590
Swift Code INTL. BOFAUS3N

RemittanceNotifications@nv5.com

Rhode Island Office of Energy Resources November 18, 2024

Project No: 6320824-0007590.00
Invoice No: 416355
Project 6320824-0007590.00 Rhode Island EERMC - 2024
Professional Services from October 01, 2024 to October 31, 2024 _ _ _ _ _ _ _ __ _ _ ____ ___
Phase _ _ _ _ | oot _ _ __| EE Prg Planning & Implementation OQversig _ _ _ _ _ _ _ _ _ _ _ _ __ _ ___
Task 01 Council Representation
Professional Personnel
Hours Rate Amount
Johnson, Craig 3.00 214.00 642.00
Totals 3.00 642.00
Total Labor 642.00
Consultants
CORE ENERGY INSIGHTS INC. 99.50
Total Consultants 99.50 99.50
Total this Task 741.50
Task 02 Implementation Oversight and Plan Develo
Professional Personnel
Hours Rate Amount
Caesar, Adrian 27.25 201.00 5,477.25
Fink, Michael 2.50 214.00 535.00
Galluzzo, Jordan 17.50 35.00 612.50
Johnson, Andrew 7.50 201.00 1,507.50
Johnson, Craig 10.50 214.00 2,247.00
Totals 65.25 10,379.25
Total Labor 10,379.25

Please Reference Our Invoice Number on your Payment



Project 6320824- Rhode Island EERMC - 2024 Invoice 416355
0007590.00
Consultants
GDR CONSULTING 848.00
JENNIFER L. CHIODO DBA: JLC CONSULTING 257.50
CORE ENERGY INSIGHTS INC. 447.75
ECOMETRIC CONSULTING, LLC 1,648.00
RALPH PRAHL 2,173.00
Total Consultants 5,374.25 5,374.25
Total this Task 15,753.50
Task 03 Education Initiatives
Professional Personnel
Hours Rate Amount
Caesar, Adrian .25 201.00 50.25
Galluzzo, Jordan 1.00 35.00 35.00
Johnson, Craig 7.75 214.00 1,658.50
Totals 9.00 1,743.75
Total Labor 1,743.75
Consultants
RACHEL SHOLLY 4,648.00
Total Consultants 4,648.00 4,648.00
Total this Task 6,391.75
Total this Phase 22,886.75
Phase _ _ _ _ | 002_ _ _ __ System Reliability Procurement_ _ _ _ _ _ _ _ _ _ _ _ .
Task 01 Council Representation
Professional Personnel
Hours Rate Amount
McDonald, Clifford 4.50 229.00 1,030.50
Totals 4.50 1,030.50
Total Labor 1,030.50
Total this Task 1,030.50
Total this Phase 1,030.50
Phase _ _ _ _ | 003 _ _ __ Requlatory Proceedings_ _ _ _ _ _ _ _ _ _ _ _ _ _ _ __ _____.
Task 01 Council Representation
Professional Personnel
Hours Rate Amount
Johnson, Craig 2.00 214.00 428.00
Totals 2.00 428.00
Total Labor 428.00
Total this Task 428.00

Please Reference Our Invoice Number on your Payment

Page 2



Project 6320824- Rhode Island EERMC - 2024 Invoice 416355
0007590.00
Task 02 Develop Technical Materials
Professional Personnel
Hours Rate Amount
Caesar, Adrian 5.50 201.00 1,105.50
Galluzzo, Jordan .50 35.00 17.50
Johnson, Craig 33.50 214.00 7,169.00
Totals 39.50 8,292.00
Total Labor 8,292.00
Total this Task 8,292.00
Total this Phase 8,720.00
Phase _ _ _ _ | 004 _ _ __ Council Sponsored Meetings and Materials _ _ _ _ _ _ _ _ _ _ _ _ __.
Task 01 Meeting Attendance
Professional Personnel
Hours Rate Amount
Caesar, Adrian 3.25 201.00 653.25
Johnson, Craig 6.50 214.00 1,391.00
Totals 9.75 2,044.25
Total Labor 2,044.25
Total this Task 2,044.25
Task 02 Develop Technical Materials
Professional Personnel
Hours Rate Amount
Caesar, Adrian 14.50 201.00 2,914.50
Galluzzo, Jordan 1.00 35.00 35.00
Johnson, Craig 31.25 214.00 6,687.50
Totals 46.75 9,637.00
Total Labor 9,637.00
Total this Task 9,637.00
Total this Phase 11,681.25
Phase 005 Research, Analysis, and Other Council Su
Professional Personnel
Hours Rate Amount
Johnson, Craig 14.75 214.00 3,156.50
Totals 14.75 3,156.50
Total Labor 3,156.50
Total this Phase 3,156.50
Phase 006 Administrative

Please Reference Our Invoice Number on your Payment

Page 3



Project 6320824- Rhode Island EERMC - 2024 Invoice 416355
0007590.00
Professional Personnel
Hours Rate Amount
Johnson, Craig 6.00 86.00 516.00
6.00 516.00
Total Labor 516.00
Consultants
RACHEL SHOLLY 124.50
Total Consultants 124.50 124.50
Total this Phase 640.50
Phase EERMC Intern
Monthly Intern Fee March 2024 2,675.00
2,675.00 2,675.00
Total this Phase 2,675.00
Billing Limits Current Prior To-Date
Total Billings 50,790.50 509,533.20 560,323.70
Limit 817,025.00
Remaining 256,701.30
Total this Invoice 50,790.50
Billings to Date
Current Prior Total
Labor 37,869.25 362,594.75 400,464.00
Consultant 10,246.25 124,842.70 135,088.95
Expense 0.00 3,370.75 3,370.75
Add-on 2,675.00 18,725.00 21,400.00
Totals 50,790.50 509,533.20 560,323.70

Please Reference Our Invoice Number on your Payment

Page 4



Project 6320824- Rhode Island EERMC - 2024 Invoice 416355

0007590.00
B|”|ng BaCkUp Monday, November 18, 2024
NV5, Inc. Invoice <Draft> Dated 11/18/2024 1:51:04 PM
Project 6320824-0007590.00 Rhode Island EERMC - 2024
Phase 001 EE Prg Planning & Implementation Oversig
Task 01 Council Representation
Professional Personnel
Hours Rate Amount
Johnson, Craig 10/8/2024 1.00 214.00 214.00
Bi-weekly check-in with OER and RIE.
Johnson, Craig 10/16/2024 1.00 214.00 214.00
EWG meeting attendance
Johnson, Craig 10/22/2024 1.00 214.00 214.00
Bi-weekly check-in with RIE/OER
Totals 3.00 642.00
Total Labor 642.00
Total this Task 741.50
Task 02 Implementation Oversight and Plan Develo
Professional Personnel
Hours Rate Amount
Caesar, Adrian 10/1/2024 1.50 201.00 301.50

C-Team working session - upcoming filed plan review and analysis
prep; Filed 2025 EE Annual Plan narrative and Electric/Gas Tables
review
Caesar, Adrian 10/2/2024 .75 201.00 150.75

EMR&V study review/coordination - final RICG Impact evaluation
reports and one-pagers
Caesar, Adrian 10/3/2024 4.00 201.00 804.00
October C&I sector prep and sector team call; updated BCR model
C&l lighting mercury ban impacts analysis; Filed 2025 Annual Plan
review - program-level spending and cost comps; EM&V study
review - final Electric Heat market characterization report, IESF
Impact evaluation results; EMV study tracker updates
Caesar, Adrian 10/4/2024 1.50 201.00 301.50

Filed 2025 Annual Plan review - program-level spending and cost
comps, measure-level calcs deltas - costs, savings, and impacts
Caesar, Adrian 10/7/2024 3.75 201.00 753.75
RI program data reporting review/coordination - new vs. existing
program data raw data, required data fields/metadata for Res/IES
and C&I data reports, comments on Electric/Gas data templates;
EM&V study review - Measure Life Phase II study updated results
file and change log/recommendations

Please Reference Our Invoice Number on your Payment

Page 5



Project 6320824- Rhode Island EERMC - 2024
0007590.00

Invoice

416355

Caesar, Adrian 10/8/2024 3.50 201.00
C-Team working session on RI program data reporting
review/coordination - new vs. existing program data raw data,
required data fields/metadata for Res/IES and C&I data reports;
Comments on Electric/Gas data templates and required changes
to meet existing reporting needs

Caesar, Adrian 10/9/2024 1.25 201.00

Updated EM&V study tracker review; C&I EM&V call/prep/study
tracker updates

Caesar, Adrian 10/10/2024 5.00 201.00
C-Team working session - 2025 filed annual plan analysis -
TRC/incentive cost comps, plan cost category deltas; EM&V study
review - Measure Life Phase II study updated results file and
change log/recommendations, comps to source
documentation/TRMs, EMV process writeup

Caesar, Adrian 10/11/2024 2.50 201.00
EMR&V study review - Measure Life Phase II study updated results
file and change log/recommendations, comps to source
documentation/TRMs, follow-ups with GH team. RICE PY2023
Impact evaluation workplan, coil cleaning and ESPO measure
treatment in C&I evaluation, CC savings methodology for 2025;
EMV study tracker updates

Caesar, Adrian 10/15/2024 2.00 201.00
Filed 2025 Plan analysis - TRC-incentive coverage, measure-level
inputs and impacts review, Plan cost category comps; ASHRAE
guideline 36 training outline review; EMV study tracker updates &
RICEPY2023 workplan review

Caesar, Adrian 10/16/2024 .75 201.00

RICE2023 Sampling strategy discussion - Coil Cleaning/ESPO
sampling stratification and evaluation methodology

Caesar, Adrian 10/30/2024 .25 201.00
2025 Plan TRM and updated program data reporting template
follow-ups with RIE

Caesar, Adrian 10/31/2024 .50 201.00
C-Team working session - filed TRM DB-BCR Model QA/QC/comps,
program data reporting updates - prelim Q3 report, updated
reporting system for 2025

Fink, Michael 10/8/2024 2.50 214.00
Meeting with Adrian, Andrew, and Craig to discuss plan for
updating monthly data report generation and automation
potential. Review materials on existing report generation and
tools.

Galluzzo, Jordan 10/1/2024 25 35.00
Internal working session - discussed upcoming 2025 Annual Plan
Review after filing date.

Galluzzo, Jordan 10/3/2024 2.50 35.00
Internal working session - discussed Filed 2025 Annual Plan
review. Updated Program Level Savings Comparison workbook
with 2025 Filed BCR Model data.

Galluzzo, Jordan 10/4/2024 3.00 35.00

703.50

251.25

1,005.00

502.50

402.00

150.75

50.25

100.50

535.00

8.75

87.50

105.00

Please Reference Our Invoice Number on your Payment

Page 6



Project 6320824- Rhode Island EERMC - 2024 Invoice 416355
0007590.00

Finalized updates to Program Level Savings Comparison
workbook. Internal working session - provided update on 2025
Filed Annual Plan review. Began updating Measure Level Savings
Workbook with Filed 2025 Annual Plan values.

Galluzzo, Jordan 10/7/2024 2.00 35.00 70.00
Continued updating Measure Level Savings Workbook with Filed
2025 Annual Plan values.

Galluzzo, Jordan 10/8/2024 1.50 35.00 52.50
Continued updating Measure Level Savings Workbook with Filed
2025 Annual Plan values.

Galluzzo, Jordan 10/9/2024 2.50 35.00 87.50
Internal working session - provided an update on 2025 Filed
Annual Plan Analysis workbooks. Updated Plan Measure Impacts
Comps and Plan TRC Coverage workbooks with Filed 2025 Annual
Plan values.

Galluzzo, Jordan 10/10/2024 2.50 35.00 87.50
Continued updating Plan TRC Coverage workbook with Filed 2025
Annual Plan values.

Galluzzo, Jordan 10/11/2024 2.50 35.00 87.50
Finalized updates to Plan TRC Coverage workbook. Updated Plan
Cost Category Comparisons with Filed 2025 Annual Plan values.

Galluzzo, Jordan 10/29/2024 .75 35.00 26.25
Attended RI Energy: Savings for Women & Minority Owned
Businesses Webinar and recorded detailed notes.

Johnson, Andrew 10/2/2024 2.00 201.00 402.00
IESF Evaluation Results. IESF Evaluation Results

Johnson, Andrew 10/8/2024 1.00 201.00 201.00
RI Data Reporting Discussion

Johnson, Andrew 10/9/2024 1.00 201.00 201.00
2024 - Monthly RI C&I EM&V Meeting

Johnson, Andrew 10/16/2024 1.00 201.00 201.00
RIE Non-Residential New Construction Baseline Study Draft Report

Johnson, Andrew 10/18/2024 .50 201.00 100.50
Monthly RI Residential EM&V Meeting task planner review

Johnson, Andrew 10/23/2024 1.00 201.00 201.00
Monthly RI Residential EM&V Meeting

Johnson, Andrew 10/30/2024 1.00 201.00 201.00
RIE Non-Residential New Construction Baseline Study Draft Report

Johnson, Craig 10/1/2024 .50 214.00 107.00
Res Sector Team - finalize agenda for upcoming meeting,
distribute agenda. Continue work on prepping potential questions.

Johnson, Craig 10/2/2024 .25 214.00 53.50
2025 Plan - correspondence with RIE re: filed versions of Plan and
BC Models, internal team work to set up file plan review tasks.

Johnson, Craig 10/3/2024 3.75 214.00 802.50

Please Reference Our Invoice Number on your Payment

Page 7



Project 6320824- Rhode Island EERMC - 2024 Invoice 416355
0007590.00

2025 Plan Review - Working session with Jordan to discuss BC
Model review/analysis tasks that compare final draft with filed
version. Working session with Kaeley to discuss set up of final vs.
filed drafts of narrative portion of Plan. Sector Teams - Monthly
residential sector team call, associated meeting prep including
finalizing list of potential discussion topics for three program focus
areas and coordination with internal team re: same.

Johnson, Craig 10/4/2024 .50 214.00 107.00
2025 Plan Review - check-in with Jordan on comparison analyses
of filed draft with final draft.

Johnson, Craig 10/8/2024 1.00 214.00 214.00
Program Data Reporting systems - working session with internal
team to review updated format of RIE raw program data and
discuss plans and next steps to update reporting workbook

infrastructure.

Johnson, Craig 10/22/2024 25 214.00 53.50
Correspondence with team re: EWG scheduling.

Johnson, Craig 10/23/2024 .50 214.00 107.00
EMR&YV - Monthly Res team call, associated prep.

Johnson, Craig 10/29/2024 1.75 214.00 374.50

Sector Team Work - Prep for upcoming monthly residential sector
team meeting, coordination with Margie, Richard, and Glenn re:
prep work and assignments, call with Spencer and Brendan to
discuss agenda. IES Q4 Best Practices meeting.
Johnson, Craig 10/30/2024 2.00 214.00 428.00
Sector Teams - Review discussion questions from internal team to
inform conversations on Products, Multifamily, and NC programs
at next weeks sector team meeting and send along to RIE team
for their prep. Draft and send meeting agenda/materials to sector
team attendees, update meeting invite.

Totals 65.25 10,379.25
Total Labor 10,379.25
Total this Task 15,753.50
Task 03 Education Initiatives
Professional Personnel
Hours Rate Amount
Caesar, Adrian 10/16/2024 .25 201.00 50.25
C-Team check in - climate awareness and comms campaign
Galluzzo, Jordan 10/30/2024 1.00 35.00 35.00

Attended RI EC4 Advisory Board and took detailed notes for
November EEC Newsletter write-up.
Johnson, Craig 10/2/2024 1.00 214.00 214.00
Check-in with Rachel on education items, including remaining
steps to launch EE & Climate Awareness Campaign, EdCom
meeting agenda, and associated items.

Please Reference Our Invoice Number on your Payment
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Project 6320824- Rhode Island EERMC - 2024 Invoice 416355
0007590.00

Johnson, Craig 10/4/2024 1.75 214.00 374.50
EE & Climate Awareness campaign - final review of social media
ad copy and landing page on Council site, provide comprehensive
feedback to team.

Johnson, Craig 10/8/2024 .25 214.00 53.50
EE & Climate Awareness Campaign vendor invoicing -
correspondence with Rachel and Steve re: payment and next
steps.

Johnson, Craig 10/9/2024 .75 214.00 160.50

Correspondence with Rachel re: EE & Climate Awareness
campaign pre-launch updates.
Johnson, Craig 10/16/2024 .50 214.00 107.00
EE and Climate Awareness Campaign - final review of landing
page before campaign launch, send feedback, discuss with
Rachel.
Johnson, Craig 10/18/2024 .50 214.00 107.00
EE & Climate Awareness Campaign - review updates to landing
page, provide final input, e-mail correspondence with Rachel and
vendor re: launch.

Johnson, Craig 10/22/2024 .75 214.00 160.50

Check-in/working session with Rachel, discussed EE & Climate
Awareness Campaign and Council social media accounts.

Johnson, Craig 10/23/2024 1.00 214.00 214.00

EE/Climate Awareness Campaign - working session with Rachel to
review next steps/updates on campaign launch, discuss Council
social media aspect of campaign, meeting with Pivot Path to
discuss same.

Johnson, Craig 10/30/2024 1.25 214.00 267.50

EE & Climate Awareness Campaign - check-in with Rachel on
status. Monitor workstreams on updating Council social media
accounts to facilitate that portion of campaign. Correspondence
with PivotPath team re: google analytics and monitoring of site
activity since campaign launch. Newsletter - correspondence with
Kaeley re: incorporation of ACEEE leaders examples for RIE in
upcoming Newsletter.

Totals 9.00 1,743.75
Total Labor 1,743.75
Total this Task 6,391.75
Total this Phase 22,886.75
Phase 002 System Reliability Procurement
Task 01 Council Representation
Professional Personnel
Hours Rate Amount
McDonald, Clifford 10/9/2024 4.50 229.00 1,030.50

Please Reference Our Invoice Number on your Payment Page 9



Project 6320824- Rhode Island EERMC - 2024 Invoice 416355
0007590.00
Transportation BCA review
Totals 4.50 1,030.50
Total Labor 1,030.50
Total this Task 1,030.50
Total this Phase 1,030.50
Phase 003 Regulatory Proceedings
Task 01 Council Representation
Professional Personnel
Hours Rate Amount
Johnson, Craig 10/21/2024 2.00 214.00 428.00
RIE Gas DR Pilot Hearing
Totals 2.00 428.00
Total Labor 428.00
Total this Task 428.00
Task 02 Develop Technical Materials
Professional Personnel
Hours Rate Amount
Caesar, Adrian 10/4/2024 .25 201.00 50.25
Docket 24-39 EEC pre-file testimony prep discussion; review of
RIE docket 24-39 EE pre-filed testimony
Caesar, Adrian 10/31/2024 5.25 201.00 1,055.25
EEC pre-file testimony development - 2025 Annal Plan review
process and findings
Galluzzo, Jordan 10/30/2024 25 35.00 8.75
Internal working session - discussed pre-filed testimony for the
2025 Annual Plan.
Galluzzo, Jordan 10/31/2024 25 35.00 8.75
Internal working session - discussed pre-filed testimony for the
2025 Annual Plan.
Johnson, Craig 10/1/2024 1.00 214.00 214.00
Cost-effectiveness report — Work on drafting content for report,
including last year report review.
Johnson, Craig 10/2/2024 2.75 214.00 588.50
Docket 24-37-EE - Gas DR Pilot - review procedural schedule,
review filing materials from previous iteration of pilot proposal,
and coordinate with Council legal team re: next steps. Cost-
effectiveness report — Continue work on drafting content for
report, including new language/content for this year.
Johnson, Craig 10/8/2024 5.25 214.00 1,123.50

2025 EE Plan Cost-Effectiveness Report - Work on drafting report
and supporting analysis for tables and graphics to be included.

Please Reference Our Invoice Number on your Payment
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Project

6320824- Rhode Island EERMC - 2024
0007590.00

Invoice

416355

Johnson, Craig 10/9/2024 2.75 214.00

2025 EE Plan Cost-Effectiveness Report - Complete work on draft
report, including final graphics updates, review feedback from
Adrian, and final polish.

Johnson, Craig 10/16/2024 1.00 214.00

Docket 24-37-EE - Review hearing notice, filing, RIE pre-file
testimony, DPUC testimony, and data requests in prep for
upcoming hearing, correspondence with Council legal team re:
same.

Johnson, Craig 10/18/2024 3.75 214.00

2025 Plan Docket - Prepare final version of cost-effectiveness
report for filing with the Commission, correspondence with Council
legal team re: same. Review procedural schedule from Council's
legal, coordinate on timeline for pre-file development, emails re:
same. Future of Gas Docket - Complete review of outline of draft
report, revisit notes from last stakeholder committee, draft and
deliver comments, review stakeholder comments submitted to
date.

Johnson, Craig 10/21/2024 2.00 214.00

Gas DR Pilot - Continue review of relevant materials to prep for
hearing. 2025 EE Plan Docket - Review notes from Council
meeting to begin brainstorming format for pre-file testimony.

Johnson, Craig 10/24/2024 1.50 214.00

2025 Plan Docket - Review procedural schedule and set up
internal schedule for meeting Council filing obligations. Coordinate
with Council legal re: Council budget testimony. Begin drafting
Council budget testimony.

Johnson, Craig 10/25/2024 5.00 214.00

2025 Plan Docket - Work on drafting testimony for Council budget
development process, including review of testimony from last
year, reviewing presentations and meeting minutes for meetings
where Council discussed budget and drafting testimony that
describes the process, exhibit and exhibit list development. Work
also included start of drafting budget tables to support responses
to PUC guidance document.

Johnson, Craig 10/28/2024 1.75 214.00

2025 Plan Docket - Continue work on Council budget development
testimony, including work on developing budget tables with YTD
and Year-End forecast spending and variances from budget.
Coordinate with Seth, Steve, Will, and Rachel re: year-end
forecast updates for several budget items.

Johnson, Craig 10/29/2024 4.50 214.00

2025 Plan Docket - Continue work on Council budget development
testimony, including adding testimony for Council process related
to budget reconciliation for 2024, responding to questions from
PUC guidance document, finalizing budget and variances table,
ongoing correspondence with Steve, Rachel, and Seth regarding
year-end forecasts, and compilation of exhibit list and exhibits.

Johnson, Craig 10/30/2024 2.25 214.00

588.50

214.00

802.50

428.00

321.00

1,070.00

374.50

963.00

481.50
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Project 6320824- Rhode Island EERMC - 2024 Invoice 416355
0007590.00
2025 Plan Docket - Correspondence with Seth re: potential need
for correction to budget pre-file testimony. Begin work on Council
pre-file testimony re: plan review and outstanding concerns,
including review of testimony filed for plan docket last year and
identifying areas to update.
Totals 39.50 8,292.00
Total Labor 8,292.00
Total this Task 8,292.00
Total this Phase 8,720.00
Phase 004 Council Sponsored Meetings and Materials
Task 01 Meeting Attendance
Professional Personnel
Hours Rate Amount
Caesar, Adrian 10/28/2024 3.25 201.00 653.25
EEC Fall LEAD Session
Johnson, Craig 10/9/2024 1.00 214.00 214.00
EEC EdCom meeting Attendance
Johnson, Craig 10/17/2024 2.50 214.00 535.00
Council and Council ExCom meeting attendance.
Johnson, Craig 10/28/2024 3.00 214.00 642.00
Council LEAD session meeting attendance.
Totals 9.75 2,044.25
Total Labor 2,044.25
Total this Task 2,044.25
Task 02 Develop Technical Materials
Professional Personnel
Hours Rate Amount
Caesar, Adrian 10/3/2024 25 201.00 50.25
October LEAD Session agenda development and review
Caesar, Adrian 10/8/2024 2.75 201.00 552.75

C-Team working session - October EEC Mtg. material development
- 2025 annual plan regulatory review, EEC calendar, Cost-
effectiveness report

Caesar, Adrian 10/9/2024 2.50 201.00 502.50
C-Team working session - October EEC Mtg. material development
- 2025 annual plan regulatory review, EEC calendar, Cost-
effectiveness report; EEC Cost-Effectiveness Report development

Caesar, Adrian 10/10/2024 1.00 201.00 201.00
C-Team working session - October EEC Mtg. material development
- 2025 annual plan regulatory review, 2025 Plan cost-effectiveness
report/presentation

Please Reference Our Invoice Number on your Payment
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Project 6320824- Rhode Island EERMC - 2024 Invoice
0007590.00

Caesar, Adrian 10/11/2024 1.50 201.00 301.50
RIE EEC mtg. materials review - Old Mill LNG facility; October EEC
mtg. materials development - October briefing memo

Caesar, Adrian 10/15/2024 .75 201.00 150.75
C-Team working session - October EEC mtg. prep; RIE EEC mtg.
materials review - EWG report presentation, draft November
agenda

Caesar, Adrian 10/23/2024 .25 201.00 50.25
10/28 LEAD session mtg. materials development - MPS briefing
deck

Caesar, Adrian 10/24/2024 4.75 201.00 954.75
C-Team working sessions - 10/28 LEAD session mtg. materials
development - regulatory updates, MPS briefing deck; MPS-Plan-
Actual savings comps and Results/report review for MPS briefing

Caesar, Adrian 10/25/2024 .25 201.00 50.25
10/28 EEC LEAD session prep/materials finalization - ice breaker,
MPS deck

Caesar, Adrian 10/30/2024 .25 201.00 50.25
C-Team working session - LEAD session follow up tasks

Caesar, Adrian 10/31/2024 .25 201.00 50.25
C-Team working session - EEC newsletter, EEC handbook
development

Galluzzo, Jordan 10/8/2024 .50 35.00 17.50
Internal working session - discussed meeting materials for 10/17
EEC Meeting.

Galluzzo, Jordan 10/10/2024 .50 35.00 17.50
Internal working session - discussed meeting materials for the
upcoming 10/17 EEC Meeting.

Johnson, Craig 10/2/2024 .75 214.00 160.50
LEAD Session meeting agenda - review with Rachel, make edits,
provide feedback to Rachel.

Johnson, Craig 10/4/2024 .75 214.00 160.50
October Council Meeting - review draft agenda and coordinate
with team on deliverable assignments.

Johnson, Craig 10/8/2024 .75 214.00 160.50
October Council Materials - Check-in with team re: material
development assignments and progress. October EdCom -
Correspondence with Rachel and Steve re: EdCom agenda and
materials for meeting tomorrow.

Johnson, Craig 10/9/2024 3.50 214.00 749.00
October Council Materials - Review updates to LEAD Agenda,
including working on pulling together resources and reference
materials for meeting topics. Begin work on cost-effectiveness
report presentation. Work on content for 2025 Plan Docket
strategy presentation.

Johnson, Craig 10/10/2024 4.00 214.00 856.00

Please Reference Our Invoice Number on your Payment
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October Council Materials - Develop presentation material for cost-
effectiveness report, review comments from Adrian, finalize
materials. Review draft of 2025 Plan Docket Strategy presentation,
update existing content and develop new content, and work in
finalizing material. Review updated version of LEAD Session
Agenda, finalize material. Draft and send update to OER on status
of materials.
Johnson, Craig 10/14/2024 3.75 214.00 802.50
October Council Materials - Review draft of Briefing memo, edits
and finalize. Draft and finalize ExCom Briefing memo. Review and
provide feedback on Council appointments presentation from OER
for October ExCom. Review OER draft of Council budget
reconciliation deck, provide comments.
Johnson, Craig 10/15/2024 2.00 214.00 428.00
October Council meeting materials - check-in on final material
development and coordinate speaking roles with team. Review
OER update to Council budget reconciliation deck, provide further
comments. Review RIE EWG Report update presentation. Review
draft of November EEC agenda, provide feedback to OER.
Johnson, Craig 10/22/2024 .75 214.00 160.50

LEAD Meeting Agenda - review draft agenda, comments from EEC
meeting, update meeting agenda and prep assignments.
Johnson, Craig 10/23/2024 6.50 214.00 1,391.00
LEAD Meeting agenda - review/discuss agenda with Rachel,
finalize and post to meeting page. Working session with Rachel to
discuss icebreaker. MPS Presentation - quick check-in with Adrian
on preparing graphs and data needs. Source reference materials
for presentation topic. Work on assembling content for master
slide deck, including inclusion of Councilor Anderbois draft
legislator education slides. EE Legislation Challenges and
Opportunities Presentation - Source reference materials for
presentation topic, work on slide content.
Johnson, Craig 10/24/2024 5.50 214.00 1,177.00
LEAD Meeting Materials - MPS Presentation - working sessions
with Adrian on content development. EE Legislation Challenges
and Opportunities - work on presentation material content, prep
talking points. Legislative Update - draft slides, including
regulatory schedule. Discussion with Council legal team regarding
LEAD meeting materials.
Johnson, Craig 10/25/2024 2.50 214.00 535.00
LEAD Meeting Materials - Work on final draft of meeting
presentation, including finalizing intro and overview slides,
coordinating with Rachel on icebreaker, adding content for
regulatory updates, and final review and polish of all slides.
Johnson, Craig 10/28/2024 .50 214.00 107.00
Council LEAD Materials - review materials, prep talking points.
Totals 46.75 9,637.00

Total Labor
Total this Task

9,637.00
9,637.00
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0007590.00
Total this Phase 11,681.25
Phase 005 Research, Analysis, and Other Council Su
Professional Personnel
Hours Rate Amount
Johnson, Craig 10/2/2024 1.00 214.00 214.00

Correspondence with Council legal team and OER re: staffing and
2025 Plan review.

Johnson, Craig 10/3/2024 2.25 214.00 481.50
EE Implementation RFP - Review scoring proposal for next two

phases, correspondence with OER re: same. Review interview
guide, provide comments, and brainstorm additional questions to

ask.

Johnson, Craig 10/7/2024 1.00 214.00 214.00
Monitor EC4 meeting activity.

Johnson, Craig 10/15/2024 2.00 214.00 428.00

Councilor Briefings - coordinate with Councilors Gill Case,
AnderBois, De La Cruz, and Oakley re: pre-October meeting
briefings. EE Implementation RFP - Review draft of interview
guide questions, review comments on original bid response
documents and add vendor specific questions to guide; follow up
with OER re: same.

Johnson, Craig 10/16/2024 1.00 214.00 214.00
Pre-Council meeting briefing with Peter.
Johnson, Craig 10/17/2024 4.00 214.00 856.00

Pre-Council meeting briefing with Chair Oakley, associated
meeting prep. Meeting with stakeholder to discuss future
engagement with the Council and providing commentary on ee
program delivery.
Johnson, Craig 10/18/2024 .50 214.00 107.00
Coordinate with Sue and stakeholder re: EE plan discussions
meeting, provide info to stakeholder on Council's approach to plan
docket engagement.

Johnson, Craig 10/24/2024 .50 214.00 107.00
Councilor briefing with Chair Oakley.
Johnson, Craig 10/28/2024 1.00 214.00 214.00

Pre-LEAD Session meeting briefing with Chair Oakley and
Seth. Discussion with stakeholder from GECA about Council work.
Johnson, Craig 10/30/2024 1.50 214.00 321.00
Attend EC4 Advisory Board meeting (virtual). Correspondence with
Seth re: process for identifying dockets that Council has not
historically participated in but might be interested in participating
in the future.

Totals 14.75 3,156.50
Total Labor 3,156.50
Total this Phase 3,156.50
Phase 006 Administrative
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Professional Personnel
Hours Rate Amount
Johnson, Craig 10/8/2024 .75 86.00 64.50
EEC Website - troubleshoot current site issues, work on updating
plugins, correspondence with Rachel and Steve re: same.
Johnson, Craig 10/11/2024 2.50 86.00 215.00
EEC Website issue troubleshooting for redirect and calendar
issues. Call with Advocacy solutions and live chat support with
WordPress to work on resolutions to issues.
Johnson, Craig 10/16/2024 2.25 86.00 193.50
EEC Website Issues - work on identifying current issues with
redirects and access. Working session with Rachel re: same.
Working session with WordPress support to identify and resolve
ongoing issues.
Johnson, Craig 10/24/2024 .50 86.00 43.00
Council Website updates - setup google analytics access, confirm
with PivotPath ability to use for EE & Climate Awareness

Campaign
Totals 6.00 516.00
Total Labor 516.00
Total this Phase 640.50
Total this Project 48,115.50
Total this Report 48,115.50
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GDR Consulting
576 Rutland St
Carlisle MA 01741

INVOICE
TO : Optimal Energy Inc. Invoice Number: 10R
10600 Route 116, Suite 3 Invoice Date: November 5, 2024
Hinesburg, VT 05461 OEI Project #: 7590

Work Performed for RI Energy Efficiency & Resource Management Council

Description of Services Amount

Services Performed 10/1/24 through 10/31/24

Hours Hourly Rate Amount Due
LABOR - Regular Hours 4.00 $212.00 $848.00
LABOR - Travel Hours 0.00 $106.00 $0.00
Travel Expenses $0.00

(See attached travel expense form for details.)

TOTAL DUE $848.00




GDR Consulting

Services Performed 10/1/24 through 10/31/24

002 - System Reliability

001 - EE Program Planning & Implementation Procurement
001-02 002-02
001-01 Implementation 001-03 002-01 Plan Sub-Total
Council Oversight & Plan Education Council Development & Regular | Sub-Total Total
Date Description of Services Representation | Development Initiatives Representation Oversight Travel Time Hrs. |Travel Hrs. Hours
10/3/2024 |Participate in monthly Residential Sector call w/RIE; meeting prep 1.25 1.25 0.00 1.25
10/11/2024 |Review and comment on revised ML study; follow up 0.75 0.75 0.00 0.75
10/23/2024 |Participate in monthly EM&V call with RIE 0.25 0.25 0.00 0.25
Initial research to develop questions on Products Program for
10/29/2024 Jupcoming call with RIE 0.25 0.25 0.00 0.25
Attend ENERGY STAR HPWH Best Practices seminar, draft
10/30/2024 |meeting notes 0.25 0.25 0.00 0.25
Complete research and compile questions on Products Program
10/30/2024 |for upcoming call with RIE 1.25 1.25 0.00 1.25
Total Hours 0.00 4.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 4.00 0.00 4.00
Total Amount $0.00 $848.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $848.00 0.00 [ $848.00




Margie Lynch/Core Energy Insights, Inc.

4445 E. Hoback River Road, Jackson, WY 83001

TO : Optimal Energy Inc.
10600 Route 116, Suite 3

INVOICE

Invoice Number: CEl RI 10-2024
Invoice Date: November 4, 2024

Hinesburg, VT 05461 OEIl Project #: 7525
Work Performed for RI Energy Efficiency Council
Description of Services Amount
Services Performed 10/01/24 through 10/31/24
Hours Hourly Rate Amount Due
LABOR - Regular Hours 2.75 $199.00 $547.25
LABOR - Travel Hours 0.00 $99.50 $0.00

Travel Expenses
(See attached travel expense form for details.)

TOTAL DUE

$0.00

$547.25




Margie Lynch/Core Energy Insights, Inc.

Services Performed 10/01/24 through 10/31/24

001 - EE Program Planning & Implementation

001-02
Implementation 005-00
001-01 Oversight & 001-03 Research, Sub-Total | Sub-Total

Council Plan Education Analysis & other 006-00 Regular Travel Total

Date Description of Services Representation | Development Initiatives Council Support] Administrative | Travel Time Hrs. Hrs. Hours
10/3/24 Participated in Res Sector Team meeting 1.00 0.00 0.00 0.00

Reviewed final Equity Working Group report; drafted content on

10/10/24  |same for EEC briefing memo 1.00 1.00 0.00 1.00
10/17/2024 |Participated in EEC meeting 0.50 1.00 0.00 1.00
10/30/2024 |Prepped for Res Sector Team meeting 0.25 0.50 0.00 0.50
0.25 0.00 0.25
Total Hours 0.50 2.25 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 2.75 0.00 2.75
Total Amount $99.50 $447.75 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $547.25 0.00 $547.25




Make Payable to: Jennifer Chiodo
JLC Consulting

52 Bent Creek Road

Hinesburg, VT 05416

INVOICE
TO : Optimal Energy Inc. Invoice Number: R-24.10
10600 Route 116, Suite 3 Invoice Date: October 31, 2024
Hinesburg, VT 05461 OEI Project #: 7590

Work Performed for RI Energy Efficiency & Resource Management Council

Description of Services Amount

Services Performed 10/01/24 through 10/31/24

Hours Hourly Rate Amount Due
LABOR - Regular Hours 1.25 $206.00 $257.50
LABOR - Travel Hours 0.00 $103.00 $0.00
Travel Expenses $0.00

(See attached travel expense form for details.)

TOTAL DUE $257.50




Make Payable to: Jennifer Chiodo
Services Performed 10/01/24 through 10/31/24

\"AvA ] = =

Program
Planning &
001-02
Implementation
Oversight & | sub-Total | Sub-Total
Plan Regular Travel Total
Date Description of Services Development Hrs. Hrs. Hours
10/3/24 |Monthly Cl Sector call and follow up 1.25 1.25 0.00 1.25
0.00 0.00 0.00
0.00 0.00 0.00
0.00 0.00 0.00
0.00 0.00 0.00
Total Hours 1.25 1.25 0.00 1.25
Total Amount $257.50| $257.50 0.00 | $257.50




Rachel Sholly
48 Hudson Street, Providence, Rl 02909

INVOICE
TO : Optimal Energy Inc. Invoice Number: 82
10600 Route 116, Suite 3 Invoice Date:  November 7, 2024
Hinesburg, VT 05461 OEIl Project #: 7590

Work Performed for RI Energy Efficiency & Resource Management Council

Description of Services Amount

Services Performed 10/01/2024 through 10/31/2024

Hours Hourly Rate Amount Due
LABOR - Regular Hours 28.00 $166.00 $4,648.00
LABOR - Admin Hours 1.50 $83.00 $124.50
LABOR - Travel Hours 0.00 $83.00 $0.00
Travel Expenses $0.00

(See attached travel expense form for details.)

TOTAL DUE $4,772.50



Rachel Sholly
Services Performed 10/01/2024 through 10/31/2024

001 - EE Program Planning &
Implementation

004 - Council Sponsored Meetings & Materials

001-02
. 004-02 005-00
Implemt?ntatlon 001-0.3 004-.01 Develop 004-03 . Research, 006-00 Sub-Total Sub-Total | Sub-Total Total
Oversight & Education Meeting . Other Council . L . Regular .
e Technical . ... [Analysis & other| Administrative Travel Hrs.|Admin Hrs.| Hours
Plan Initiatives Attendance Materials Responsibilities Council Support Hrs.
Date Description of Services Development
Compiled & sent final marketing elements feedback to
PivotPath, responded to Councilor feedback; Compiled,
10/01/24 |sent & posted EdComm mtg materials 2.25 2.25 0.00 0.00 2.25
C-team planning re: LEAD agenda, website, PivotPath,
EdComm; Research & correspondence re: website
issues; Gave PivotPath access to Google Analytics;
10/02/24 |Correspondence re: rescheduling EdComm mtg 1.50 1.50 0.00 0.00 1.50
EdComm rescheduling; PivotPath check-in; Reviewed
10/03/24 |PivotPath invoice, updated tracker 1.25 1.25 0.00 0.00 1.25
Reviewed & incorporated C-team comments on LEAD
agenda; Posted & sent updated EdComm materials;
10/08/24 |Correspondence re: website issues 1.75 1.75 0.00 0.00 1.75
C-team planning re: edu activities; Listened, commented,
forwarded audio ad recordings; Correspondence re:
campaign finalizing strategy; Materials & feedback
review, correspondence re: campaign finalizing strategy;
10/09/24 |EdComm mtg 3.50 3.50 0.00 0.00 3.50
Finalize draft LEAD agenda; Correspondence re: stock
10/10/24 |images, website issues 0.50 0.50 0.00 0.00 0.50
C-team planning re: final campaign materials, website
issues, lectures, council mtg; Reviewed final campaign
materials & sent comments; Reviewed budget slides &
10/16/24 |updated LEAD agenda; Participated in EWG mtg 3.25 3.25 0.00 0.00 3.25
10/17/24 |Biweekly check-in w/PivotPath 0.25 0.25 0.00 0.00 0.25
Finalized & reposted LEAD agenda, sent reminder; C-
team planning re: edu activities; Check-in w/PivotPath re:
social media ad campaign; Updated events page &
facebook, email accounts troubleshooting; LEAD session
10/23/24 |prep 2.25 1.50 2.25 0.00 1.50 3.75
C-team planning re: edu activities; Drafted EdComm
10/24/24 |agenda & sent internally 1.00 1.00 0.00 0.00 1.00
10/28/24 |LEAD session incl prep 4.50 4.50 0.00 0.00 4.50
10/29/24 |Correspondence re: budget testimony, vendor invoicing 1.25 1.25 0.00 0.00 1.25
EdComm mtg incl prep & follow-up; PivotPath check-in;
10/31/24 |Designed rough draft of exec summary fold out 4.75 4.75 0.00 0.00 4.75
Total Hours 0.00 28.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 1.50 28.00 0.00 1.50 29.50
Total Amount $0.00 $4,648.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $124.50] $4,648.00 $0.00( $124.50( $4,772.50




Ralph Prahl
7001 Stanhope Place, University Park FL 34201

INVOICE
TO : Optimal Energy Inc. Invoice Number: 56
10600 Route 116, Suite 3 Invoice Date: November 1, 2024
Hinesburg, VT 05461 OEIl Project #: 7590

Work Performed for RI Energy Efficiency & Resource Management Council

Description of Services Amount

Services Performed 10/01/24 through 10/31/24

Hours Hourly Rate Amount Due
LABOR - Regular Hours 10.25 $212.00 $2,173.00
LABOR - Travel Hours 0.00 $106.00 $0.00
Travel Expenses $0.00

(See attached travel expense form for details.)

TOTAL DUE $2,173.00



Ralph Prahl
Services performed 10/1/2024 through 10/31/2024

002 - System Reliability

001 - EE Program Planning & Implementation Procurement 003 - Regulatory Proceedings 004 - Council Sponsored Meetings & Materials
001-02
Implementation 002-02 003-02 004-02 005-00
001-01 Oversight & 001-03 002-01 Plan 003-01 Develop 004-01 Develop 004-03 Research, Sub-Total | Sub-Total
Council Plan Education Council Development & Council Technical Meeting Technical Other Council |Analysis & other 006-00 Regular Travel Total
Date Description of Services Representation | Development Initiatives Representation Oversight Representation Manuals Attendance Materials Responsibilities | Council Support| Administrative | Travel Time Hrs. Hrs. Hours
10/1/2024|1ESF results 0.50 0.50 0.00 0.00
custom electric report, custom gas report, electric heat
10/2/2024|market report 1.00 1.00 0.00 0.50
10/9/2024|C&lI studies call + prep 0.75 0.75 0.00 1.00
10/10/2024|measure life report; custom electric impact eval workplan 1.25 1.25 0.00 0.75
10/11/2024|custom electric research plan, measure life report 0.75 0.75 0.00 1.25
10/14/2024|custom electric impact eval 0.25 0.25 0.00 0.75
C&l electric impact eval (conf call + prep); NRNC baseline
10/16/2024|report 1.50 0.00 0.00 0.25
10/17/2024|NRNC baseline report 2.25 1.50 0.00 1.50
10/18/2024|NRNC baseline report 0.25 2.25 0.00 2.25
10/20/2024|NRNC baseline report 0.25 0.25 0.00 0.25
10/21/2024|NRNC baseline report 0.50 0.25 0.00 0.25
10/22/2024|NRNC baseline report 0.50 0.50 0.00 0.50
10/23/2024|Res check in call + prep 0.50 0.50 0.00 0.50
0.50 0.00 0.50
0.00 0.00 0.00
0.00 0.00 0.00
0.00 0.00 0.00
0.00 0.00 0.00
0.00 0.00 0.00
0.00 0.00 0.00
0.00 0.00 0.00
0.00 0.00 0.00
0.00 0.00 0.00
0.00 0.00 0.00
0.00 0.00 0.00
0.00 0.00 0.00
0.00 0.00 0.00
0.00 0.00 0.00
0.00 0.00 0.00
0.00 0.00 0.00
0.00 0.00 0.00
0.00 0.00 0.00
0.00 0.00 0.00
0.00 0.00 0.00
0.00 0.00 0.00
0.00 0.00 0.00
0.00 0.00 0.00
0.00 0.00 0.00
0.00 0.00 0.00
0.00 0.00 0.00
0.00 0.00 0.00
0.00 0.00 0.00
0.00 0.00 0.00
Total Hours 0.00 10.25 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 10.25 0.00 10.25
Total Amount $0.00 $2,173.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00] $2,173.00 0.00 | $2,173.00




EcoMetric Consulting, LLC
41 Leopard Road, Suite 104

ool 19501 INVOICE

610.400.8600
ECOMETRIC admin@ecometricconsulting.com

BILLED TO TOTAL DUE

Craig Johnson

Optimal Energy - NV5 $ 1 648 OO
10600 Route 116, Suite 3 7 .
Hinesburg, VT 05461

Project Name RI EERMC Consultant Invoice Date 11/14/2024
Project # 7525 Due Date 12/14/2024
Invoice # 1029-P10-24 Payment Terms Net 30
Billing Period 10/01/2024 -10/31/2024
oskNumber | Description | _Amount__
001-02 Implementation Oversight & Plan Development $1,648.00
Subtotal $1,648.00
Invoice Total $1,648.00

Budget Summary

Task Number Budget Previous Billings Total Spent

Task 001-02 $150,000.00 $68,135.00 $69,783.00 $80,217.00
TBD TBD $0.00 $0.00

Contract Balance $80,217.00




fname local_date hours  task notes
Michael Honey 10/3/2024 1.5 Implementation Oversigh IESF Evaluation Results review, comments & emails
Monthly C&I meeting with RIE & Guidehouse
Michael Honey 10/9/2024 1 Implementation Oversigh Review recent email threads regarding ongoing study reviews
Measure Life Phase [l Memo & workbook review & comments
PY2023 Custom Electric Work plan review
Michael Honey 10/11/2024 2 Implementation Oversigh Emails
Michael Honey 10/14/2024 1 Implementation Oversigh Custom electric workplan review, comments & emails
Michael Honey 10/16/2024 1 Implementation Oversigh Custom Electric topics call with RIE & prep
Michael Honey 10/31/2024 1.5 Implementation Oversight & Plan Development Non-Residential New Construction Baseline Study Draft Repo

review, comments & emails




Invoice Number
Period

1029-P10-24
10/01/2024 - 10/31/2024

Person Month Hours Rate Amount

RI EERMC Consultant Implementation Oversight & Plan D Salil Gogte Partner 2024-10 0 $220.00 $ =

RI EERMC Consultant  Implementation Oversight & Plan D Michael Frischmann Partner 2024-10 0 $220.00 $ -

RI EERMC Consultant Implementation Oversight & Plan D Michael Honeychuck  Managing Consultant 2024-10 8 $206.00 $ 1,648.00
RI EERMC Consultant  Implementation Oversight & Plan D Bitul Sinha Managing Consultant 2024-10 0 $206.00 $ -

RI EERMC Consultant Implementation Oversight & Plan D Cory Read Data Scientist 2024-10 0 $206.00 $ =

RI EERMC Consultant  Implementation Oversight & Plan D Sharon Mullen Managing Consultant 2024-10 0 $206.00 $ -

RI EERMC Consultant  Implementation Oversight & Plan D Mary George Sr Engineer 2024-10 0 $166.00 $ =

RI EERMC Consultant Implementation Oversight & Plan D Kyle McKenna Managing Consultant 2024-10 0 $206.00 $ -

RI EERMC Consultant  Implementation Oversight & Plan D Jenna Bagnall Managing Consultant 2024-10 0 $206.00 $ -

RI EERMC Consultant Implementation Oversight & Plan D Vijay Susvirkar Sr Engineer 2024-10 0 $166.00 $ -

RI EERMC Consultant  Implementation Oversight & Plan D Vinay Belhekar Sr Engineer 2024-10 0 $166.00 $ =
Total 8.00 $ 1,648.00
Project Task Person Title Month Hours Rate Amount

RI EERMC Consultant 0 Salil Gogte Partner 2024-10 0 $220.00 $ -

RI EERMC Consultant O Michael Frischmann Partner 2024-10 0 $220.00 % -
RI EERMC Consultant 0 Michael Honeychuck  Managing Consultant 2024-10 0 $206.00 $ =

RI EERMC Consultant O Bitul Sinha Managing Consultant 2024-10 0 $206.00 $ -

Rl EERMC Consultant 0 2024-10 0 $ -
Total $ -



Voucher Status: Partial

Expenditures
Salaries and Wages
Fringe Benefits
Operating Expenses
Indirect Costs
TOTAL

Budget
$11,586.52
$7,948.79
$484.00
$5,004.83
$25,024.14

Page 2

Contract Number :Hardesty RIEERMC_021
Purchase Order :

URI Award Number: AWD11451

Contract Period  :2023-02-20 - 2024-02-19

Invoice Period : 2024-01-01 - 2024-01-31
Invoice No : GM-00039139
Expenses
Previously
Billed Current Cumulative
$7,887.74 $607.64 $8,495.38
$6,726.00 $543.88 $7,269.88
$0.00 $0.00 $0.00
$3,653.54 $287.89 $3,941.43

$18,267.28 $1,439.41 $19,706.69



_USCA3DO
All Departments

Funds: FEDERAL - Federal Share of Outlays
Award: AWD11451

Account

Total Revenue
MTDC Costs
Personnel & Fringe Costs
Personnel Costs

5255 Nonclassified-Part Time
PERS2 Personnel
Personnel

Personnel Costs
Personnel & Fringe Benefits

5281 Social Security-Fica

5283 Assessed Fringe Benefit Alloc
5286 Tiaa

5289 Staff Benefits Allocation

5294 BOG Employer Cost-ret Medical
5295 Employee Medical Insurance
5297 Employer Cost-Dental Care
5298 Employer Cost-Vision

FRINGZ Fringe Benefits-General
Fringe Benefits-General
Personnel & Fringe Benefits
Personnel & Fringe Costs
Operating Expenses
OPER2 Operating General
Operating (2)
Operating Expenses
MTDC Costs
Non-OH Costs
Indirect Costs
7731 Standard Overhead
INDC2 Indirect Cost General
Indirect Cost General
Indirect Costs
Non-OH Costs
Expenses

AWD_ACTUALS_AWD11451_FEDERAL.xIsx

University of Rhode Island
Award Expense Actuals Summary
As of Date: January 31, 2024

Run: March 7,2024 at 16:28

Award Dates: 2023-02-20 - 2024-02-19

Method of Payment:
Award Status: ACP

--------- BUDGET----------]| |====--2ceeaee--ACTUALS--------ccemn--|
Budget Revised Budget Current Month Fiscal Year Project-To-Date Encumbrance Pre- Encumbrance Balance Available

$ - $ - $ 607.64 $ 7,887.74 $ 8,495.38 $ - $ - $ (8,495.38)
$ 11,5686.52 $ 11,586.52 $ - $ - $ - $ - $ - $ 11,586.52

$ 11,5686.52 $ 11,586.52 $ 607.64 $ 7,887.74 $ 8,495.38 $ - $ - $ 3,091.14
$ 11,5686.52 $ 11,586.52 $ 607.64 $ 7,887.74 $ 8,495.38 $ - $ - $ 3,091.14
$ -8 -8 3070 $ 49933 § 536.99 $ -8 -3 (536.99)
$ - $ - $ 24.00 $ 31154 § 33554 $ - $ - $ (335.54)
$ -8 -3 5469 $ 709.92 $ 76461 $ - $ - 8 (764.61)
$ - $ - $ 492 $ 63.87 $ 68.43 § - $ - $ (68.43)
$ - $ - $ 2177 $ 283.01 $ 304.78 $ - $ - $ (304.78)
$ -8 -8 389.11 $ 464899 $ 5,003.98 $ - 8 -8 (5,003.98)
$ - $ - $ 16.02 $ 203.58 $ 21921 $ - $ - $ (219.21)
$ - $ - $ 267 $ 3375 §$ 3634 § - $ - $ (36.34)
$ 7,94879 $ 7,94879 $ - $ - $ - $ - $ - $ 7,948.79

$ 7,94879 $ 7,94879 $ 543.88 $ 6,753.99 $ 7,269.88 $ - $ - $ 678.91

$ 7,94879 $ 7,94879 $ 543.88 $ 6,753.99 $ 7,269.88 $ - $ - $ 678.91

$ 19,535.31 § 19,535.31 § 1,151.52 § 14,641.73 § 15,765.26 $ - $ - $ 3,770.05

$ 484.00 $ 484.00 $ -8 -8 -3 -3 -8 484.00

$ 484.00 $ 484.00 $ -3 -8 -8 -8 -8 484.00

$ 484.00 $ 484.00 $ - $ - $ - $ - $ - $ 484.00

$ 20,019.31  $ 20,019.31 § 1,151.52 $ 14,641.73 § 15,765.26 $ - $ - $ 4,254.05

$ -8 -8 287.89 $ 3,660.54 $ 394143 § -8 -8 (3,941.43)
$ 5,004.83 $ 5,004.83 $ - $ - $ - $ - $ - $ 5,004.83

$ 5,004.83 $ 5,004.83 $ 287.89 $ 3,660.54 $ 3,94143 § - $ - $ 1,063.40

$ 5,004.83 $ 5,004.83 $ 287.89 $ 3,660.54 $ 3,94143 $ - $ - $ 1,063.40

$ 5,004.83 $ 5,004.83 $ 287.89 $ 3,660.54 $ 3,941.43 $ - $ - $ 1,063.40

$ 25,024.14 $ 25,024.14 $ 1,439.41 $ 18,302.27 $ 19,706.69 $ - $ - $ 5,317.45

Per Used

78.8%



Certificate of Service

I hereby certify that a copy of the cover letter and any materials accompanying this certificate was
electronically transmitted to the individuals listed below.

The paper copies of this filing are being hand delivered to the Rhode Island Public Utilities Commission
and to the Rhode Island Division of Public Utilities and Carriers.

Joanne M. Scanlon

December 6, 2024

Date

Docket No. 23-35-EE — Rhode Island Energy’s EE Plan 2024-2026 Three-
Year Plan and 2024 Annual EEP

Service list updated 12/6/2024

Name /Address

E-mail Distribution List

Phone

The Narragansett Electric Company
d/b/a Rhode Island Energy

Andrew Marcaccio, Esq.

280 Melrose Street

Providence, RI 02907

Leticia C. Pimentel, Esq.

Steve Boyajian, Esq.

Robinson & Cole LLP

One Financial Plaza, 14th Floor
Providence, RI 02903

amarcaccio@pplweb.com;

cobrien@pplweb.com;

jhutchinson@pplweb.com;

jscanlon@pplweb.com;

dmmoreira@rienergy.com;

SLawrence@rienergy.com;

BSFeldman@rienergy.com:

ACLi@rienergy.com;

BDagher@RIEnergy.com;

SBriggs@pplweb.com;

BJPelletier@rienergy.com;

JOliveira@pplweb.com;

Teast@rienergy.com;

Masiegal(@rienergy.com;

Cagill@rienergy.com;

sbovajian@rc.com;

LPimentel@rc.com;

HSeddon@rc.com;

401-784-4263

Division of Public Utilities & Carriers
Margaret L. Hogan, Esq.

john.bell@dpuc.ri.gov;

Joel.munoz@dpuc.ri.gov;

Christy.hetherington@dpuc.ri.gov;

Margaret.L.Hogan@dpuc.ri.gov;

Kyle.J.Lynch@dpuc.ri.gov;

401-780-2120




Mark.A.Simpkins@dpuc.ri.gov;

Leo.Wold@dpuc.ri.gov;

Ellen.golde@dpuc.ri.gov;

Machaela.Seaton@dpuc.ri.gov;

Tim Woolf

Jennifer Kallay

Synapse Energy Economics
22 Pearl Street

Cambridge, MA 02139

twoolf(@synapse-energy.com;

ikallay@synapse-energy.com;

Energy Efficiency & Resource Mgmt.
Council EEMRC)

Seth H. Handy, Esq.

HANDY LAW, LLC

42 Weybosset Street
Providence, RI 02903

seth@handylawllc.com;

helen@handylawllc.com;

conor@handylawllc.com;

401-626-4839

Office of Energy Resources (OER)
Albert Vitali, Esq.

Dept. of Administration

Division of Legal Services

One Capitol Hill, 4™ Floor
Providence, RI 02908

Albert.Vitali@doa.ri.gov;

Nancy.Russolino@doa.ri.gov;

Christopher.Kearns@energy.ri.gov:

William.Owen@energy.ri.gov;

Steven.Chybowski@energy.ri.gov;

Nathan.Cleveland@energy.ri.gov;

Karen.Bradbury@energy.ri.gov;

401-222-8880

File an original & 9opies w/ PUC:
Stephanie De La Rosa, Commission
Clerk

Public Utilities Commission

89 Jefferson Blvd.

Warwick, RI 02888

stephanie.delarosa@puc.ri.gov;

John.Harrington@puc.ri.gov;

Alan.nault@puc.ri.gov;

Todd.bianco@puc.ri.gov ;

401-780-2107

Interested Party

Dept. of Human Services
Frederick Sneesby

Frederick.sneesby(@dhs.ri.gov;

RI Infrastructure Bank
Chris Vitale, Esq.,

cvitale@hvlawltd.com;

SUsatine(@riib.org;

Green Energy Consumers Alliance
Larry Chretien, Executive Director

Larrv(d)massenergv.org;

Amanda Barker

amanda(@greenenergyconsumers.org;

Acadia Center
Emily Koo, Director

EKoo@acadiacenter.org;

401-276-0600 x402
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